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Voters To Nominate 
CandidatesforJVariety 
Of Positions Aug. 4r 

Voters in western Washtenaw coun­
ty will be able to nominate party can­
didates for local, county, and national 
seats in the general primary election 
next Tuesday, Aug. 4. 

The primary, the prelude to the 
November general elections, has a 
much fuller slate of Republican can-eput 

HcH 

JOHN MITCHEIX'S 1927 WHIPPET will be one of the had the vehicle out last Sunday at the Chelsea Retirement 
many cars on display this Saturday at the annual Antique Community. He came appropriately dressed and even bad 
Car Show as part of the Chelsea Sidewalk Sale. Mitchell a 78RPM record playing music of the era. 

Bargains, Food, Activities 
Highlight 19th Annual 

Sidewalk Sale 

i 

Sales, entertainment, and a host of 
activities will highlight the 19th An­
nual Chelsea Sidewalk Sale this Fri­
day and Saturday, July 31 and Aug. 1 
in downtown Chelsea. 

The final community-wide event 
before the Chelsea Community Fair 
begins at 8 a.m. on Friday and winds 
up at 5 p.m. on Saturday. It will also 
be the first festival downtown since 
the • completion of the Downtown 
Development Authority's streetscape 
project. 

Asusual, one of the highlights of the 

event, as well as the primary reason 
for it, is the sale of drastically dis­
counted merchandise by downtown 
businesses. Some merchants have to 
move seasonal merchandise to 
prepare for fall, others use the occa­
sion to sell slow-moving or discon­
tinued products. Sidewalks are usual­
ly filled with products ranging from 
clothes to hardware. 

There will also be more than 30 
craft booths and information booths 
on Main St. and South St. next to the 
post office, as well as at the Chelsea 

Depot, Area craftspeople sell 
everything from pottery to jewelry to 
stuffed animals. 

Assorted food vendors will be set up 
oh E. Middle St. Corn on the cob will 
be provided by The Common Grill and 
Cleary's Pub. Chelsea Music Boosters 
will sell sno cones, Kiwanis Club of 
Chelsea will have its Kiwanis Kitchen 
on hand to serve up sausage san-
wiches, munchies, and beverages, 
Domino's Pizza wUI sell pizza, The 
Big Dipper will serve ice cream, and 
an elephant ears trailer will be 
available. 

Downtown Merchants Association 
will have free balloons and drinks at 
major intersections. 

Several special events are also 
planned. 

McKune Memorial Library will host 
a pre-schoolers reading program on 
Friday from 11 a.m. to 11:30 a.m., 
featuring stories, games, and finger 
plays. A similar elementary program 
will be held on Saturday from 1 p.m. 
to 1:30 p.m. 
. First United Methodist church will 
have a pancake breakfast in the 
church-basement-on-Saturday°from 
7:30 a.m. to 10:30 a.m. Ages 3 and 
under are free. Ticket prices are $1.50 
for children and |3 for adults. Pro­
ceeds will benefit the church's 
building program. 

Chelsea Farmers Market will be 
held as usual In the eastern Municipal 
Parking Lot from 8 a.m. to 1 p.m. on 
Saturday. Market vendors will be 
sponsoring a drawing for prizes which 
are available at the market. The 
grand prize will be a hand-crafted 
walnut clock made by Ray Schairer. 
Other prizes include a framed pressed 
paper heart, a hand-made basket, 
t-shirts, a fern, and a scarecrow. All 
prizes are on display at State Farm 
Insurance downtown. 

An Antique Car Show organized by 
John Mitchell, Jr. will be held on Park 

(Continued on page eight) 

Chelsea Fair 

didates than Democratic candidates 
for the various positions, especially in 
the townships elections, where 
Democrats appear to be an en­
dangered species. 

In many cases the primary will 
essentially be the election since many 
final candidates will have no opposi­
tion in<November. 

Each voter will be able to select 
candidates in one party only. Anyone 
who votes in more than one partisan 
sectionjwill have his ballot rejected. 

In Sylvan township, which includes 
most of the village of Chelsea, there is 
only one contested position. 
Republicans Luann Strieter Koch and 
Blake Thomson are fighting to take 
the clerk seat, now held by Mary Har­
ris, who Is not running for re-election. 
The remaining candidates, all 
Republicans, are running unopposed: 
Gerald Dresselhouse for supervisor, 
Fred Pearsall for treasurer, and 
Reuben Lesser, Jr. and Earl Heller 
for trustees. 

Dexter township also has one con­
test, a three-way Republican race for 
two trustee seats among incumbents 
Doug Smith and Earl Doletzky and 
newcomer Harley Rider. Republican 
supervisor Jim Drolett is running 
unopposed for re-election, as is 
Republican treasurer Julie Knight. 
Clerk William Eisenbeiser, the only 
Democrat on the township ballot, is 
running unopposed. 

In Lyndon township, the in­
cumbents, all Republicans, are run­
ning unopposed: John Francis for 
supervisor, Linda Wade for clerk, 
Geraldine Reith for treasurer, and 
Barbara Roderick and L. Duane Noah 
for trustees. 

The situation is the same in Lima 
township, where the incumbents, all 
Republicans, are running unopposed; 
William Van Riper for supervisor, 
Arlene Bare is for clerk, Betty 

Messman for treasurer, and Harold 
Trinkle and Bob Heller for trustees. 

Sharon township has two races. 
Republican incumbent clerk Duane 
Haselschwerdt is being challenged by 
Republican Sandra Thompson. There 
are also three Republican candidates 
for two trustee seats. Incumbent 
Willard Blumenauer is being 
challenged by newcomers Gary 
Blades and Reno Feldkamp. 
Republican supervisor John Savage 
and Republican candidate for 
treasurer, Rita Burkhardt, have no 
opposition. 

In Freedom township, all 
Republican incumbents" are running 
unopposed: Robert C. Little for super­
visor, Julie A. Schaible for clerk, 
Walter A. Hieber for treasurer, and 
William L. Uphaus>and Dale E. Weid-
mayer for trustees. 

Webster township also has a slate of 
incumbent Republicans who are run­
ning unopposed: Donald Zeeb for 
supervisor, Wana Baldus for clerk, 
Janis Keogh for treasurer, and Paul 
Kleinsclunidt and Hugh Mosher for 
trustees. 

Scio township has more contests 
than any other western county 
township, but all the candidates are 
Republicans. 

Candidates for supervisor are in­
cumbent Robert Tickle and Larry 
Grant; for clerk, incumbent.Gay F. 
Ennschuh and Anns 1,. Srfwppal; far 
treasurer, incumbent Donna E. 
Palmer and Daniel DeSmyther; for 
trustees (four seats), incumbent 
Charles Ream, Jerry S. Schleicher, E. 
Spaulding Clark, Aaron A. Machnik, 
Robert Rayer, David Poppenger, and 
incumbents George H.J. Smith and 
Janet Gearson. Marie Anderson is 
campaigning actively as a write-in 
candidate. 

In the race for U.S. representative, 
8th district, Republican candidates in­
clude Sandy Pensler, Dick Chrysler, 
John Mangopoulos, and Margaret 
O'Connor. The lone Democratic can­
didate is incumbent Bob Carr, 
although the district has recently 
been redrawn to Include most of 
western Washtenaw county. Current 
representative is Carl Pursell. 

(Continued on page four) 

Village Planners 
Approve Site Plans 
For Bank Bwtdhtg 

Chelsea Village Planning Commis­
sion last week approved site plans for 
Chelsea State Bank's new building at 
Chelsea Shopping Center. 

The 17,353-square-foot addition at 
their current branch bank at the cor­
ner of M-52 and Old US-12 will essen­
tially become the bank's main office. 
Basic banking services will also be 
continued downtown. — 

The commission also re-approved 
site plans for an office building pro­
posed a couple of years ago by 
developer Rene Papo. His Chelsea Of-
ficenter is scheduled to be built off Old, 

US-12 just northeast of the M-52 in­
tersection. 

The plans had to be re-approved 
because the original approval ex­
pired. 

The only difference is Papo will now 
have to conform to the village's new 
landscape ordinance, which has been 
passed since the first approval. 

Several new members of the plan­
ning commission were sworn in. Com­
mission members now include chair 
Tim Merkel, David Stelnbach, Doug 
Denison, Kathryn Powers, Bill Bott, 
Tim Eder, Margaret Schlanker, and 
Terrence O'Hagan. 

Books 

TRUCKS FULL OF WHEAT began lining up at thumb area of me state. Cool, rainy weather has delayed 
Chelsea Milling Co. this week as the wheat harvest gets In- this year's harvest by nearly two weeks, 
to foil swing. The company gets most of its wheat from the 

v 

Early Wheat Price. Yields Good, 
Now Available But Weather Pattern is Concern 

Chelsea Community Fair premium 
books are available at Various loca­
tions in Chelsea and Dexter. 

Chelsea locations include Farmer's 
Supply, The Chelsea Standard, Mc* 
Calla Feed Service, Parts Peddler, 
and The Village Bakery. 

Dexter locations include Dexter 7fcFOOTUTILrrY POLE was raw wed rromdow^ ~ ^ r ? A™w!" »«»««« "**«» 
ed to the Chelsea Fairgrounds, where It will hold a new emergency siren pur- Mill, Estech, Hackney Hardware, and 
chased by the village. The siren is used primarily to warn of tornadoes and Provico Big-H. 
other severe weather. The fair runs Aug. 25-29. 

Wheat prices are up over last year 
and If there's no further deterioration 
of the crop, area farmers should be 
able to make a little money this year. 

Provico Blg-H of Chelsea saw the 
first loads of wheat arrive last week. 

Price per bushel has been about 
$3.10 for white wheat and $3.20 for red 
wheat, which is about 8046 cents 
higher than last year. Fanners are 

reporting yields of about 70-90 bushels 
per acre, which Provico's Klaus 
Bachmann called "really good." A 
yield of 65-70 is about average. 

The major concern last week is 
whether there would be enough dry 
weather to keep remaining wheat 
from sprouting. Bachmann said about 
2-8 percent of red wheat had sprouted 
while 8-37 percent of white wheat had 

less sprouted. The crop becomes 
valuable the more it sprouts. 

Test weights have been reported at 
5842 pounds, with a moisture content 
of 15-19 percent. Dry wheat is 13.5 per­
cent, and Bachmann said most wheat 
would have to go through the dryers. 

As of late last week, about 8-9% of 
red wheat and 2% of white wheat 
had been harvested. 

(Continued on page five) 
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Engler Calls for Immediate 
Parole Board Changes 

Governor John Engler, testifying 
before a Joint legislative conference 
committee, urged quick action on 
legislative reforms of the state's 
parole system, expressing hopes that 
the House might vote on a com­
promise when it returns to session 
next week. 

Should an agreement be reached 
and supported by the House, Engler 
said he has been assured that, the 
Senate will return to session to act on 
it prior to recessing until September. 

While Engler and conferees agreed 
there have been problems with the 
current parole system, they pointed to 
charges of serial murder levied 
against a paroled inmate as the 
catalyst for immediate change. 

"This is a very old problem that has 
had a great deal of new urgency," 
said lead House conferee Nick 
Ciaramitaro (D-Roseville). 

"That (the murder charges against 
Leslie Williams) has reiterated the 
danger society faces. I think that 
means it's incumbent on us to develop 
a system to protect society." 

Engler, who said the system lacks 
accountability, called for removal of 
parole toard restrictions from civil 
service requirements, the dire 

A ̂ 4_r____*_ t w u f c v u 4 M 

NATIONAL NEWSPAPER 
ASSOCIATION 

JUST REMINISCING 
/terns taken from the /Me* of The Chelsea Standard 

• • • 4 Years Ago 
Wednesday, Aug. 3,1988— 

If all goes according to plan for Pol­
ly's Market manager Mike Kennedy, Softball Association fast-pitch team 
construction will begin on Chelsea's ran Ita win streak to six gamesTTOtf 
second shopping center this month, night, July 7, to remain in strong con 

Low Key Gangster." The plays will be 
given Saturday, July 15 beginning at 1 
p.m, in the high school auditorium. 

Chelsea 16- 18-year-old Amateur 

pointment of the board by the director 
of the Department of Corrections, a 
four-year limit of service on the 
board, and an increase in the number 
on the board from seven to 10. 

Emphasizing the importance of the 
boad, Engler said, "This is not like 
handling a license. If we make a 
mistake here, the risk can be very 
serious." 

Department Director Kenneth 
McGinnis said revised parole 
guidelines that have been im­

plemented by board members will not 
be mandated by them until they are 
codified He said he did not know 
when the validation of the guidelines 
would be completed 

• • • 

"Endangered Beaches" Cited 
By Environmentalists 

The Clean Water Fond nominated 
34 "endangered beaches" along 
Michigan's Great Lakes shore as it 
blamed overdevelopment and 
destructive recreational uses rather 
than pollution for posing the greatest 
threat to the scenic areas. 

The fund's report, based on a 
survey of 50 local officials, en­
vironmental groups, scientists, land 
conservancies and the public 
throughout the state, is designed to 
harness citizen action to protect 
Michigan's 3,200 miles of Great Lakes 
shoreline. 

"Given the current failure of 
federal and state governments to ad­
dress and prevent shoreline develop­
ment, it's up to Michigan citizens to 
protect this resource," said Kathy 
Aterno, Michigan CWF director. 

The following threats were Iden­
tified: 

• residential development for con­
dominiums, cottages and summer 

;15 beaches)^ 
• overuse, especially by off-road 

vehicles (six beaches); 
• large industrial or commercial 

development (five beaches); 
• actions by government agencies 

to destroy sensitive areas within inap-
propriate development (three 
beaches). 

The list includes 15 Upper Peninsula 
and 19 Lower Peninsula beaches, with 
Little Presque Isle, north of Mar­
quette on Lake Superior, the area 

most frequently nominated as an en­
dangered beach. 

The Department of Natural 
Resources has proposed building a 
modern campground along the 
shoreline. 

Other beaches threatened by 
department proposals include Platte 
Bay, Sleeping Bear Dunes National 
Lakeshore in Benzie county, where 
the Park Services has considered 
creating a marina; and Cross Village 
Shores in Emmet county, where the 
department has proposed a harbor of 
refuge amid habitat for threatened 
plant species, interdunal wetland 
shoals and adjacent scenic areas. 

Improved land use planning, 
government land purchases, improv­
ed regulation and enforcement, rejec­
tion of development proposals and 
public education were recommended 
by those surveyed to preserve the 
beaches. 

• • • 
$37.1 Million Deficit Expected 

After 1992-93 Vetoes 
An estimated 150 million in under-

funding of critical state operations, in­
cluding Corrections, the Medicaid 
program and the Grand Rapids 
Veterans Facility and liability in-

and Budget Director Patricia Wood-
worth announced recently. 

The deficit is based on 1992-83 ap­
propriation levels after 56 vetoes 
totaling $30 million in general fund 
spending, compared to the 210 items 
worth 9131 million the governor 
vetoed from the current budget 

After the governor's veto action, in­
cluding less than 92 million in vetoes 
expected in the general government 
budget (HB 5520) to be presented to 
the governor next week, next year's 
general fund budget will total $7,987.2 
million. 

The under-funding is offset by the 
general fund vetoes and the lapsing of 
vetoed restricted fund spending into 
the general fund. 

"We will continue to work closely 
with state departments throughout 
the fiscal year to try to avoid the need 
for additional cuts or supplemental 
appropriations," Woodworth said. 

"The governor's vetoes are 
targeted to avoid the need for a 
restoration supplemental which last 
year made the budget debate a year­
long activity," she added. 

Give a 
Giff Subscription to surance in Military Affairs, will con-

ibute to a projected $37.1 txmmrjf^Q Chelsea Standard! 
deficit for next year, Management • - . 

Chelsea Village Planning Commission 
gave final site plan approval for 
Village Mall at their regular meeting 
last Tuesday, July 26. The approval 
was granted with several minor con­
tingencies. The 
center will adjoin Polly's Market to 
the south behind Great Lakes Ban­
corp. 

Al Townsend and the Ambassadors 
delighted a big Pierce Park audience 
last Thursday with their brand of big 
band music. It was the third concert 
of the summer C^cert in jhe Park 
series sponsored by ibe Chelsea Area 
Chamber of Commerce and Chelsea 
Recreation Department. 

Michelle Renee LaVigne, a 1985 
Chelsea High school graduate, has 
completed an intense two-year dance 
program with the School of Hartford 
Ballet. She was presented with a per­

formance preparation otrtificate. 

tention in the Ann Arbor Recreation 
16-18 Fast-Pitch League. 

Uncle Lew from Lima Says: 
24 Years Ago • 

41,000-square-f oot Thursday, Aug. 8,1968— 

• • • 

Voting turnout was reported light in 
Tuesday's primary election and that 
fact was evidenced In the Chelsea 
area. Less than one-third of the 
registered voters in Sylvan, Lyndon, 
Lima, Sharon and Freedom townships 
made it to the polls to choose can­
didates for the Nov. 5 national elec­
tion. 

The annual August Steak Fry was the 
-agenda Tuesday evening, Aug. 6, for 
the Chelsea Jaycees, who met at the 
American Legion Homenon" Cava-
naughLake. 

It's mad money time again. Resur­
rect your sun, visors, arm garters, 
suspenders, galtlra and walking 
sticks to attend the time-honored 
tradition of outdoor summer sales 
Aug. 16 and 17 in downtown Chelsea. 

• • • 

14 Years Ago 
Thursday, July 13,1978— _. 

It's been a long time coming, but in _ ' 
-thejiext three weeks Chelsea will add 34 Years Asp 
to its list of moderately priced,~iz^mu 4-4,7 ios£-
raasonably quick service restaurants ^ ¾ ¾ ¾ ¾ race for the 
wift the opening of the1 Big[Boy RepabUcan wminatiOT as candidate 
^ T t e ^ u L M i V ^ ? M "or sheriff Twashtenaw county, 
•Mi The restaurant will employ «H» < k w | > A P e t e r s e n won b y a v o t e ^ 

Annual Summer Children's Theatre 5'718 whUe tocumbent sheriff •**•* 
Workshop, sponsored by the Friends 
of the Chelsea Players, is now in its 
final week with everyone busily 
preparing for the final productions. 
This year there will be four plays, in­
cluding two musicals. They are "The 
Only Star," "Tow Away Zone," "The 
Legend of Sleepy Hollow," and "The 

WEATHER 
For*the Record . . . 

Max. Mia. Precip. 
Wednesday,JulyS . . . . .75 SO 0.3» 
Thursday,JuiyZ) 64 86 0,10 
Friday.JujyM 72 59 0.02 
Saturday,7ttb25 86 56 0.24 
Sunday, J u l y * .86 68 0.02 
Monday, July 27... 78 62 0.00 
Tuesday,July28.. 79 51 0.00 A 

E.A. Lillie received slightly more 
than. 1,000 less-a total of 4,669, ac­
cording to unofficial figures, available 
yesterday. 

Tickets for Washtenaw Farm 
Bureau Council's Chicken Barbecue 
to be held Sunday, Aug. 17 at the 
Rural Activities Center on Saline-Ann 
Arbor Rd., are now avilable 
throughout toe county, according to 
board chairman Carl Lesser. 

A sudden electrical and wind storm 
which struck the Chelsea area shortly 
after 6 p.m. Sunday darkened the 
southwest part of Chelsea, the north 
side of E. Middle St. and toe Freer Rd. 
neighborhood for several hours and 
cut off telephone service for more 
than 200 homes as the result of trees 
and limbs falling on wires. 

DEAR MISTER EDITOR: 
It says here that people in England 

have to pay for information from the 
Guvernment. I offered this informa­
tion to the fellows at the country store 
Saturday night free of charge and 
they were full agreed that folks oyer 
there ought to sue for violation of their 
Constitution rights. Bug Hookum said 
he recalled where Thomas Jefferson 
put somepun in the Declaration of In­
dependence about toe free spread of 
information being necessary to the 
public well being. 

I was quick to point out to Bug that 
England is hooked up with Great Bri­
tain that is a whole separate country 
from the United States, and they have 
their own rules and idees on what is 
right and wrong. For instant, over 
there you can get hanged for picking 
somebody's pocket at a hanging, and 
if you're out of work you're total out of 
luck. Them people ain't never heard 
of any kind of welfare, never mind 
unemployment compensation. 

Ed Doolittle Jumped up and com­
menced waving a handfull of clip­
pings. He got the floor and noted first 
off that I must of got my information 
from a encyclopedia wrote about the 
time we went to war with Britain for 
our independence, because everthing 
I said was changed about that time. 
Nowdays, Ed said, toe British don't 
execute anybody and until recent they 
didn't even let their policemen carry 
guns. Farthermore, all medical care 
is free over there, even if you have to 
wait two years to have a bad tooth 
pulled. 

On the down side, Ed went on, his 
most recent readings say Britain is 
coming around to our way of thinking. 
They still have the Bobbies on 
bicycles peddling after crooks in 
souped-up Jaguars, but if the crooks 
have a falling out over the loot and try 
to kill one another, or if they have a 
four-tire blowout during the chase, the 
Bobbies have the firepower to control 
the situation. 

Unfortunate, I got my information 
about England's situation from Clem 

Siding Windows 

CHELSEA REMODELING SERVICES 
Home Remodeling—Carpentry 

Qualifyyvork at reasonable prices. 
" L ICENSED—INSURED 

Call Dale Behnko at 4737823 
= -Kitchens- Additions 

Webster early in the week when we 
run into one another at the lodge 
meeting. Clem said his neighbor's 
grandson was recent sent home after 
being stationed over there with toe 
Air Force, and he brought home some 
Guvernment pamflets as souvinlrs for 
the family. Clem said he toumed 
through some of them, and he saw 
where folks there actual have to fill 
out order forms and pay what would 
be 75 cent of our money for em. 

It ain't no wonder, Gem allowed, 
that Great Britain ain't great and the 
sun has a hard time finding what's left 
of It to set on. 

The simple democratic fact is, when 
you can't write a postcard to youfcon-
iApMdfi a 

mailbox running over with free 
pamfleU from any agency .of the 
Federal Guvernment you just ain't 
getting what you're paying for. It ain't 
no wonder that we bowed our necks in 
1776 and said we ain't going to put up 
with this kind of Guvernment service 
any more. When you pay your money 
you expect a little consideration. 

What was worst, Gem reported, 
was that one of the pamflets from 
England called "Wimmen's Roles" 
said "wimmen's employment often is 
cited as toe cause of divorse." He 
wanted to know why folks in England 
will put up with paying 75 cent to read 
what they can learn by walking 
around their neighborhoods. 

Yours truly, 
Uncle Lew. 

FALL FRIENDS 
PROGRAM 
JULY a-AUOUST e 

New Clothes for School 
Please consider a cash donation 

or new Nothing for students ages 5-17 

Call us for Information on hew 
you can contribute 

CHILSIA SOCIAL SIRVICIS. 473-1381 
Thurt., 10-4 p.m. or call 479-1935 

OPEN HOUSE 
To thank ana Soy Farewell to 

JACKIE TRACY 
COMMUNITY EDUCATION DIRECTOR 

FOR THE CHELSEA SCHOOtS-
FROM 1978-1992 

WBNESDAY, JULY 29ff 1992 
Board Room — 7:00-9:00 p.m. 

The Public Is Invited To Attend 

20 years Chief Trial Lawyer 
for Prosecutor 

< ~ 

William F. Delhey 

Vote August 4th for 

JWOnH 
fa r PROSECUTOR 

Election Committst 
Howard S. Holmes, Honorary Chair 
Curtis Orsinger. Co-Chair 
David Foulke, Co-Chair 
Larry Hahn, C.P.A., Treasurer 
Gary Raab, Finance Chair 
Jang Talcott, Consultant 

Paid for by Committee to Elect Noah Prosecutor 
800 Sunrise Court, Ann Arbor, Michigan 48103 •4Wm 

SPONSORED BY: 

CHELSEA CLASSIC CRUISERS 
CAR & TRUCK SHOW 

DOWNTOWN MERCHANTS ASSOC. 

CHELSEA SHOPPING CENTER 

DATE: August l, saturcTay 
RAIN OR SHINE 

LOCATION: Park Street. NOTE -
This will be .a Park & 

_Show event, NOT a 
South Parte 

Summit 

Orcrwd 

parade. Site i£ tree-
lined and shady, great 
spot for a car show 
and picnic. 

TIME: 10:00 a.m. til 3:00 p.m. 
Dash Plaques for the First 75! 
Popular Vote Award and Plaque given at 3:00 p.m. 

i i n 
W.Middto 

t * 
N s 

•I 

RAILROAD 
• M 1 t 

E Middle 

+-4-H M i l l 
• — McKrtoy 

Van Goran WuNflgton 

NAME 

ADDRESS 

VEHICLE. MODEL. B O D Y STYLE 

Please return this to me so 
that we.may make up packets. 

JohnW.Mitchell, Jr. 
124 Park Street 
Chelsea, Michigan 48118 

Questions - (313) 475-1444 

This advertisement courtesy of Siaffan-Mltchell Funeral Home 
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Jerry and Charna Boquette 

Charna Street; Jerry Bdquefre 
Marry in Methodist Church 

Charna Lee Street of Chelsea and 
Jerry Edward Boquette, Jr. were 
married March 28 at the First United 
Methodist church,of Chelsea. 

The Rev. Gerald Street, uncle of the 
bride, performed the ceremony 
uniting the daughter of Merlyn and 
Karen Street of Chelsea and the son of 
Jerry and Janice Bouquette, Sr. of 

-Saginawr 
Jeanne Harper of Ashville, N.C. 

was the matron of honor. Bridesmaids 
Were Martina Street, sister of the 

Manikas of Ann Arbor, and Corrine 
Garrecht of Grand Blanc. Flower 
girls were Marianna and Katerina 
Manikas. 

Best man was Christopher Bou­
quette of Saginaw, brother of the 
bridegroom. Groomsmen were Nor­
man Weber of Chelsea, Bryan 
I jFranne of Howell, Joseph-Mendyk-

Dina Glaspie, Edward Blissick 
Wed in Michigan Cenfer Church 

Dina L. Glaspie, daughter of Dee 
Glaspie of Jackson and Richard 
Glaspie of Evart, and Edward P. 
Blissick of Chelsea, son of Olivia 
Blissick of Michigan Center and the 
late Edward J. Blissick were married 
May 23 at Our Lady of Fatima 
Catholic church. Michigan Center. 

bride, Laura Mills of Ann Arbor, Julie 

i 

SUMMER 
SAVER 
CLASS RINGS 

95 $ 59 VAI AOIUM-

• ChoosefromAtlasandAtherui, 

• Personaljiewithyourrwoe, 
adivity.mascotarWilgefilsfAr*; ' 

• OffergoodthoiAugust 1 b, 1 <#2 
• FastestDeiivery Available.' 

ATLAS 

OFFERED EXCLUSIVELY BY 

R. JOHNS, LTD. 
Full Name, l>arnood»jr»dCubic7i<cofi<<i\dri'avail.it)lr for an 
XklifoiutchJj^e. 

of Fenton, and Tom Garrecht of 
Grand Blanc. Ringbearer was Derek 
Street, cousin of the bride. Ushers 
were Kaipn Trim of Lake City, uncle 
of the bridegroom, Jon Dracht of 
Cadillac, cousin of the bridegroom, 
Brian Mills of Ann Arbor, and Nick 
Manikas of Ann Arbor. 

Hostesses were Kelli Paquet of 
Saginaw, sister of the bridegroom, 
and Tenley Street of Brighton, cousin 
of the bride. 

A reception was held at the 
Michigan League Ballroom in Ann Ar­
bor. 

The newlyweds took a honeymoon 
cruise in the Caribbean. They are 
residing in Alma. 

The Rev. Fr. Andrew Dunne perform­
ed the ceremony. 

Maid of honor was Dawn Rigelman 
of Jackson, and best man was 
Richard Esham of Michigan Center. 

The newlyweds left on their boat 
"Priority," cruising and fishing on 
Lake Erie. 

Dina graduated from Jackson High 
school and is now an assistant account 
executive at BookCrafters. Edward is 
a graduate of Michigan Center High 
school and Eastern Michigan Univer-

HAMMERSCHMJDT-De ANGELIS: Jerry ond Cindy Hommerscrtmldt of 
Chelsea hove announced the engagement of their daughter, Marguerite Ann, 
to Paul Carlo De Angelis, son of Carlo and Emma De Angells of Mt. Clemens. 
The future bride is a 1988 graduate of Chelsea High, school ond a 1992 
graduate of the University of Detroit. She plans to attend low school. The 
future bridegroom is a 1987 graduate of L'Anse Creuse North High school and 
a 1991 graduate of the University of Detroit. He is a math teacher in the L'Anse 
Creuse Public School System. A Dec. 26 wedding is planned. 

sity. He is also 
BookCrafters as 
ecutive. 

employed by 
an account ex-

The couple are now making their 
home at Cavanaugh Lake, Chelsea. 

Blood Drive 
Slated Aug* 10 

ti 
' ' - - -H ~-"• u i t - i u i n l . jilatXinai, • * " ' " '<'! >'H H')>iit*>|l ) i « l / n . 'r,. , -j ,»l 

CHELSEA CUB SCOUTS of Pack 455 are acting goofy for the camera on 
their last day of Day Camp. They enjoyed a fun-filled week of games, crafts 
and even swimming despite rainy weather. Camp was June 22-26. In front row, 

Diooa anve "> tjeuea on wonoay, f r o m Mtf a r e ̂  christensen, Joel Gentz, Na|han Hinderer, Davy Graff, Max 
^ g ^ 4 ( U ^ e VTWRHalL 105N.Main—sprt^e^,^ Standing are WOIim KaTz-HaU, Chris 

St. from 11 a.m. to 5 p.m. Evans, Mike Miller. Kyle Schrotenbner. Derek KHnkr nw«>n Anri>»nn, r\,*A 
Potter, Scott Dettling, and David Schlosser. Not pictured are Ben Hicks, Matt 
Hicks, Brett Putman and Jamie Herendeen. 

American Red Cross will sponsor a 
blood drive in Chelsea on Monday, 

PRESCHOOL EXPEDIENCE 
Offered To 

2 to 5 year-olds 

20 years . . < 
of 

Preschool fun. 

Join us at an 
OPEN HQUSI 
- ' ft 4 i r j • * i -t • > 

i H\l n; i 

TUESDAY, AUG. 4th"& Sept;1st 
10 a.m. to 12 noon and 6 p.m. to 8 p.m. 

Bring your child. 

CHELSEA 

People once believed wearing that clear stone the diamond would render one invisible. 

CHILDRENS CO-OP 
Located at St. Barnabas Church 
20.500 Old US-12, Chelsea 

Sign up now for fall 1992 

Interested? Call 475-7457 or 475-2436 

EAR PIERCING 
FREE 

win overuse cf pef cmo 
oaoings Pa'tniaicoMeni 
'Mui'-ed unoc 18 

WINANS JEWELRY 

NANCY BENJAMIN 
Chelsea Representative 

NEWCOMERS 
1 A WELCOME SERVICE 

"A tradition of helping newcomers feel at home" 

If you are new in the Chelsea School District. 
call 475-9962 for your complrmentary 
welcome packet. 

Sponsored By 
Chelsea Chamber of Commerce and the leading Merchants of Chelsea | 

ELECT — ELELI — bLbll 

Pold for by Concerned Citizens 
of Sylvan Township 

ATTENTION VOTERS OF DISTRICT 52 
In the race for State House of Representatives there is a candidate 
who has been called "unpretentious" by the Ann Arbor Observer. The 
thesaurus gives the following synonyms for unpretentious: candid, 
frank, open, sincere. These are excellent qualities for a State 
Representative. 

The Ann Arbor News Editorial stated that George Merkel would be an 
honest representative but knows little about state issues. Issues 

LUANN 
STRIETER 

KOCH 
for 

SYLVAN 
TOWNSHIP 

CLERK 
R E P U B L I C A N 

Vote — Primary Tuesday, Aug. 4,1992 

r-aw ho T-narnari hn» S t ' a nnt awaryr iay yrm f i rsA aw h^nrn- f p n T i f t r t i i n 
Talking with customers, friends, and local business, operators, 
George knows the issues which affect his district. 

The Ann Arbor News published how much money two of the candidates 
have raised through their political connections. George hasn't 
raised that kind of money. Though he did receive donations from 
friends and family (wmen. ne appreciates tremendously)/ he did not 
seek contributions from businessmen or other politicians. Why? 
If you really believe in something you must be willing to devote 
your own time and resources. Also, as stated in the Observer, he 
is a "free-spirit". George can enter office free of ties. He's 
going to Lansing to serve the grassroot interests. 

George understands the grassroot interests. Raised on afarm in 
the Chelsea area he understands the values, ethics and needs of the 
people in our district. Having owned small businesses, he 
understands the values, ethics and needs of business. Because he 
raised seven children, he understands.tAeyaljjes, ethics and needs 
of the family. 

Of George 
Michigan. 
Among us, 
personal 

and Nancy's seven adult children, six of us live in 
The seventh is employed by a company based in Chelsea, 
we have nine children of our own. We each have a 

the interest in 
homes, our children and 

outcome of this 
our futures. 

election as it affects our 

Five of us will be voting in District 52's primary on August 4. We 
will be voting for George Merkel, not because he is our father whom 
we love, but because we believe he is the candidate who will serve 
the needs of this district properly. 

Please vote on August 4, and cast your vote for the candidate who 
will really make a difference in Lansing, --our father, George 
Merkel. 

Paid for by Ellen Hall', Linda lahn/Hichael Merkel, Ann Salver, Elizabeth Corvin, Theresa Kernel., Margaret Stech 
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Wilber and Elizabeth Worden 

Wiiber WordensCelebrate 
SQfh Wedding Anniversary 

Wilber and Elizabeth Worden 
celebrated their 50th wedding an­
niversary, Sunday, June 28 at the 
home of their daughter and son-in-
law, Dia and Marc Vale in Chelsea. 
About 70 friends and family gathered 
to congratulate them with food, 

Park, Worden & Walz Marathon Oil 
distributors in Chelsea, and retired in 
1980 from employment of the State 
Prison of Southern Michigan, 
Jackson. 

Elizabeth also retired in the sum-" 

BSB^BaaBOBBBSssBBHOSBaaeai 

SENIOR 
MENU & 

ACTIVITIES I 
Week of July 2&-Aug. 4 

Food, Fun and Fellowship for Seniors 
Senior Center, Faith in Action Bldg. 
Chelsea Hospital Grounds. Ph. 47M180 
Wednesday, July 29— 

Pinochle and euchre every Wednes­
day. 

Past Matrons second Wednesday of 
each month 
LUNCHr-Beef sirloin cubes with rlce^ 
peas, pickled beef salad, roll and but-
ter, strawberries and bananas, milk. 

1:00 p.m..—Fitness. 
3:004:00 p.m.-Swim. 

Thursday, July 30— 
9:30 a.m.-Euchre and pinochle. 

LUNCH-Lasagna, Italian green 
beans, garden vegetable salad, french 
bread and butter, melon, milk. 

8:30 a.m.-Leave for Grand Ledge 
Boat Trip. 

5:30 p.m.—Return from Grand 
Ledge Boat Trip. 
Friday, July 31— 

9:30 a.m.—Jackpot Bingo. 
LUNCH-Chef's salad bowl with 
turkey, cheese and hard cooked egg; 
three bean salad, roll and butter, car­
rot cake, milk. 

3:00-1:00 p.m.—Swim. 
Monday, Aug. 3— 
•>- 9:30 a.m.—China painting. 

H—Cabbage rolls, parsley 
potatoes, carrots, rye bread and but­
ter, peaches, milk. 

1:00 p.m.—Bingo. 
3:00-4:00 p.m.—Swim. 

Tuesday, Aug. 4— _ 
10:00 a.m.—Blood Pressure. 
LUNCH-Veal cutlets with 

mushroom sauce, scalloped potatoes, 
tomato and green pepper marinade, 
brownies, milk. 

Primary Election 
Slated Tuesday 

(Continued from page one) 
.The Republican slate of candidates 

for state representative includes 
Charles Sayre, George Merkel, Mark 
Oulmet, Dennis Petsch, and Tom 
Richardson. Merkel and Petsch have 
Chelsea-area ties. Democratic can­
didates are Earle Stevenson, Sabra 
Briere, Scott Munzel, and Mary 
Schroer. Margaret O'Connor is the 
current representative. 

Candidates for Washtenaw county 
prosecuting attorney include 
Democrats Brian L. Mackie and Ter-

-rence~ Q*Haganr Republican- can=-
didates are Lynwood Noah and John 
Stanowski. 

Democrat Charles Stewart and in­
cumbent Republican Ron Schebil seek 
unopposed nominations, for county 
sheriff. 

Republican incumbent Peggy 
Haines and Democrat Pam Fromm 
are seeking nominations for county 
clerk/register. 

Republican incumbent Michael 
Stimpson and Democrats Nancy 
Davis and Rose Moon Gross seek 

mer of 1980 from ITgfJVL AnfrArboF-
memones ana-song. Th>-party^was business office of the Institute for 

Food Companies 
Plun Stale Fair 

hosted by their daughter Dia and hus 
band Marc Vale, and their two sons, 

-Raymono* will Steven. ~~~ 
The Wordens were married at 

North Lake United Methodist church 
on June 28,1942. They are parents of 
Diane Vale, Raymond Worden and 
grandchildren, Sarah and Brady, and 
Steven Worden of Chelsea, and the 
late Peter Worden. 

Wilber worked at the business of 

Social Research. 
The Wordens now reside in Thomp-

Cooking Contests 

nominations 'tor county treasurer. 
Democratic incumbent Janis 

Bobrin and Republicans William Fer­
ris and Steve Olmsted seek nomina­
tions for'county drain commissioner. 

There are nine candidates in the 
non-partisan primary for Court of Ap­
peals judge. Top two vote-getters will 
be the finalcaiididateslihthe general 
elections. Candidates are William L. 
Cahalan, Michael J. Callahan, John 
H. Gillis, Jr., Renee V. Loridas. Mar­
tin T. Maher, Edward J. Plawecki, 
Cynthia D. Stephens, George E. 
Ward, and Helene^N.White. 

There are six candidates in the non­
partisan primary for Circuit Court 
judge. Again, the top two vote-getters 
will square off in the general elec­
tions. Candidates are Glynn D. 
Barnett, Jerome D. Farmer III, Don 
Ferris, Ernestine McGlynn, Lore Ann 
Rogers, and Kurtis T. Wilder. 

hall from 7 a.m. to 8 p.m. Anyone in 
line at 8 p.m. will be allowed to vote. 

HEGADORN-JALYNSKI: Herbert Hegadom and Janet Brown of Chelseo 
have announced the engagement of their daughter, Christine Marie, to Greg 
Jalynskl, Jr., son of Mr. and Mrs. Gregory Jalynski of Chelsea. An August 
wedding is planned. The future bride is a 1985 graduate of Chelseo High 
school. She attended Washtenaw Community College and Eastern Michigan 
University and earned a degree in language and international trade, The 
future bridegroom is a 1986 graduate of Chelsea High school. He is working 
for a manufacturing company in Westland and is starting his own company. 

sonville. 

Within the goods-producing sector, 
agricultrure and construction will in­
crease and offset the decline in 
manufacturing and mining, according 
to the Bureau of Labor Statistics' Oc­
cupational Outlook Quarterly, Fall 
1991. 

NEED 
TEMPORARY 

^HEAXTH ~ 
INSURANCE? 
Unihsured because you are: 

• between jobs 
• temporarily laid off 
• waiting for 

K-^'J}* gro"PTOvgragg~ 
-seasonally employe* 

Instant protection if you qualify for coverage 

• Only one premium payment 
• Choice of deductibles 

* • Choice of coverage period 

You may be eligible for 
American Community's Short Term 

health insurance plan. 

LOISAVHALL 
(313) 434-3175or 475-3583 

Coleman Insurance Agency 
4825 Washtenaw 

, Ann Arbor, MI 48108 

American Community 
Mutual Insurance Company 

HotVie Urtrce • Liv&nia, ' Michigan. 
• Founded 1938 • 

Calling ail COOKS and chefs! The 
1992 Michigan State Fair wants to 
know—who can bake the most delec­
table delights? The ingredients are 
Sure-Jell , Crisco shortening, Jiff 
Peanut Butter, Land O' Lakes light 
sour cream, Gerber and Spam. 

Kraft General Foods Sure-Jell con­
tests invites entrants to create the 
most delectable delight with Sure-Jell 
products. No entry fee is required and 
contestants will be judged in the 
categories of taste appeal, originality, 
ease of preparation, and visual ap­
pearance. * 

Crisco invites entrants to bake the 

Robert Pratt Named to 
Academic Honor List at 
Spring Arbor College 

Robert C. Pra t t of Chelsea has been 
named to the Spring 1992 Academic 
Honors List a t Spring Arbor College. 
The Academic Honors List is publish­
ed each semester, recognizing those 
students who have earned a grade 
point average of 3.5 or above on a 4.0 
scale. Prat t earned a 4.0 grade point 
average during the spring semester. 

Pra t t was a senior at the College 
flakiest-cherry pie, the tastiest cake 
or the chewiest peanut butter cookies. 
The contest is open to ama te t r 
bakers, 18 years or older. No entry fee 
is required and contestants will tie 
judged in the categories of flavor, tex­
ture, appearance, anorpreparation. 

Crisco will also sponsor a Parent 
and Child cookie celebration. Parents 
and children will be working together 
to bake the most delicious peanut bufe 
ter cookie. 

Winners in these two categories can 
advance to the regional competition 
and then to the national competition to 
be held in New York City In the 
spring. 

Land O' Lakes is sponsoring a light 
sour cream Quick Bread contest. Con­
testants a re invited to bake their 
favorite quick bread from scratch and 
bring it to the Fairgrounds the day of 
the contest. Contestants -will be 
judged based on taste, originality, ap­
pearance and ease of preparation. 

Gerber challenges contestants to 
create a main dish, salad, appetizer 
or baked good with a Gerber product 
a s the main ingredient. Entrants will 
be judged on taste, originality, and 
appearance. 

Spam Luncheon Meat contest wants 
contestants to create a dish from 
scratch using at least one 12*ounce can 
of Spam. Cash prizes will be awarded 
to all winners. 

For a free Community & Fine Arts 
Premium Book that includes entry 
forms, rules and regulations about the 
contests, contact the Michigan Ex-

-pftSlliorand Fairgrounds, 11¾ West 
State Fa i r Ave., Detroit 48203, or call 
(313)369-6280. 

last semester, majoring in philo-
sophy/reljgion. He is the son of Bob 
and Jan Prat t of Chelsea. 

Give a 
Gift Subscription to 

The Chelsea Standard! 

Elect A New Voice For Michigan. 

z r p a y ^ 
% 

o Preschool 
Six-week sessions (M/W, T/Th), 
starling August 31 • Register 
now! 

0 Summer Camp 
—June 8 • August 1Sf8;30i3i30 

V Leatt̂ ' 
(Daycare available before & after) 

Daycare 
Monday thru Friday, 6i30 AM - 6:30 PM 
(Flexible hours to suit your schedule) 

Drop-in 
Any time, Monday thru Friday. 
6:30 AM - 6 :30 PM 

.. Jo maintain • or improve - our 
?sired quality of life, we must work for 

meaningful tax reform and improved 
cational and job opportunities. As your 

Representative, / won 7 make promises that I 
can't keep. In fact, the only promise I will make is to 
listen and to work hard for each and every one of us.' 

On Election Day, we ask that you join us in electing a 
new voice for Michigan: 

Linda Adler 
Sandra Baikmdn 
J owe Bradlev 
Bob Bliss 
PhilBoham 
Joyce Bradley 
Kathleen Brigham 
GilBurslcy 
Russ Calvert 
Man- <$ Susan Carlson 
SnmiMuuL.Clmk, 

. Howdy Holmes 
Will Johnson 
Don Kenney 
Hannah Hardy Liddiard 

. Peter Long 
Jack Lousma 
Jerry Lutz 
Paul Mann 
Kerry McConneil 
Joe Merkel 
Marx.Piiiewski,. — : — 

"Ouimet's hard work on the City Council, 
his dedication to the Ann Arbor area and his 
experience as a bank vice president are 
impressive." 

=¾ ? - Ann Arbor News. July 24.1992 

9\(prv! 
313-475-0484 

14443 Stofer Court 
Chelsea, Ml 48118 

-JJiomas <& Patricia Clemons 
Ken Collica 
Ed Coy 
Steven & Rebecca Daut 
Dick Debug 
Harry & Virginia Denham 
Chester & Gilda Elkins 
Rhonda Eilioth 
Pete & Shirley Enderle 
Manin L. & Olga Esch 
Reuben & Deborah Feldkamp 
Bruce Gaffnev 
Richard Gall' • 
Arlene & Carl Genske 
Delores Gillespie 
Gene Graher 
Barbara Grant 
Larry Grant 
Jake <$ Linda Haas 
Howard'Holmes 

-Mikt-&-Nwwy-Poulin 
Mary Lou Riga 
Bud Roberts 
Dick & Norma Sams 
Jerry & Nancy Schleicher 
Ray & Donna Smit 
Tim Spencer • 
RichardSteeh '• 

"Mark has my full and e.ntkmiattic _ 
endorsement. He has the qualifications 
needed to effectively represent us in 
Legislature." 

Gilbert E. Bursley -
Michigan State Representative & Senator. 1960-1978 

"Mark stands for honesty and integrity fpt\ 

Mart v Stratth 
Will & Cheryl Susan 
Jane Talcotr -
David & Penny Trinkle 
Brian & Susan Urquhart 
Bill & Dot Van Riper 
Bruce Waggoner 
Nancy Weinmahn 
Gary & Linda White 
Loren Yates 
Robert Yopko 

send a genuine Representative to Lansing." 
Hannah Hardy Liddiard. Dexter Village President 

"Mark's a real worker and that's what we 
need in Lansing today." 

Richard Steele. Chelsea Village President --

"Mark's record of public service and 
community involvement are proof that he'll 
be the hard'Working, effective Representative 
we need." 

Marty Straub. Washtenaw County Commissioner 

Remember, Michigan's future is in our hands. 
Your vote wj]l make a difference. In August and again in November. 

5-2'n-d D i s t r i c t 
R e p u b l i c a n 

F o r . S l a t e R e p r e s e n t a t i v e 

Call MARK O U I M E T at 747-8487 if you have questions or would like 
to discuss the issues, the campaign, or both. 

Paid for by the Mark C. Ouimet for State Representative Committee. P.O. Box 2599. Ann Arbor. Ml 48106. Chuck Carver. Treasurer 

•4-



Buy R 
Prdd 

cled 

Dennis M. McDonald CPA 

s *„ ' ' s" g-m-Tax Preparation 
and M o ^ y Acc^untin^ for Small Business 

747-8882 
475-3228 

3001 South State S t , # 1010 
Ann Arbor, Mi. 48108 
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Richard D. Klelnschmidt 
(313) 426-4613 

GENERAt CONTRACTOR 
Rooting 'Siding • Carpentry • Seamless Aluminum Gutters 

4785 Matt, Dexter, Ml 46130 

DRAINS a n d SEWERS 
CLEANED ELECTRICALLY 

PROMPT SERVICE 

M 

FLOOR 
DRAINS 

MAIN 
LINES 

STORM 
SEWERS 

SEPTIC TANKS-Cleaned, Installed, Repaired 
DRAINFIELD & OTHER EXCAVATING 

• RESIDENTIAL • COMMERCIAL • INDUSTRIAL 

B0WNGER SANITATION SERVICE 
PHONE (313) 475-2097 

Kleinschmidt 

CHELSEA COMMUNITY HOSPITAL has announced the start of a new 
volunteer program to enhance the quality of care patients receive. Shown 
organizing the volunteer Ust and services offered are, from left, Maggie Tap­
ping and Joyce Stein. 

Patient Special Services 
Volunteer Program Started 

The .P.S.S. program is a new 
volunteer contribution to enhance the 
Itialtty at far* flrnri«*» rnmmimity 
Hospital patients receive. Volunteers 
will provide a variety of patient ser­
vices during weekdays to patients in 
Med/Surg, Head Pain, ICU and 
Rehab units. Nurses or Unit 
Secretaries from other units may oc­
casionally make a request for a pa­
tient service. Patients or family 
members may caU an advertised 
number and make requests for 
special personal services. 

( P.S.S. volunteers will periodically 
visit in appropriate patient rooms. 

Complimentary newspapers will be 
delivered to patient rooms? 

Sf i 

tvieinscnmiui ^¾¾¾¾^ Hardware 
IVS60 Sharon Valley 1 ^ ^ ^ 1 ^ Manchester,Mi. 

313-428-8337 fc^f1 

M O D - I'Yi 7am - 6 p m Sun. 10 am - 4 p m I 

Saturday K am - 5 pm * 

POWER EQUIPMENT SALE 
All Products 

Set-Up and Texted 

* H ff^-w^ni'm 
4rf%n% • -.r<™Ar 

*1M 99 
* Off «MVI IM Mft. 

• MulcHtrl 
» » 0 » Oauuwi 

> SHt W w h » y 

• 3 H.P. CHAIN DRIVE H U B . . . .$269.99 
• 5 H.P. CHAIN 1 1 I 1 E R . . . . . . . . . $359.99 
• SNAPPER MOWERS. Shrtig from $199.99 

P.S.S. volunteers will visit the pa­
tient and do shopping as requested. 

Cassette recorder and choice of 
j audiotapes can be delivered to pa-
* tient's room upon request. 

Wheat Crop 
(Continued from page one) 

"Without further deterioration, and 
if the price holds, farmers should be 
able to make a little money,". 
Bachmann said. 

Bachmann said the export market 
for wheat is very weak, but he ex­
pects domestic demands to use up 
most wheat. 

Co-operative Extension Service 
Agent Bill Ames said the poor 
weather is affecting crops of all kinds. 
He said farmers canV ge^Jntfrth^ 
fields to cut alfalfa, anid some crops 
are suffering root rot. 

Standard Classified Ads 
Ret quick results! 

A mobile cart of games, cards, 
books, etc., may be delivered to the 
patient's room. — -

P.S.S. volunteers may assist patient 
in making contact with CCH pastoral 

..services or patient's personal clergy. 
P.S.S. volunteers upon request will 

respond to a request from Admitting 
Office to escort a patient to a hopsital 
service or nursing unit and help 
transport belongings. Upon request, 
they will assist with readying patient 
for discharge by packing personal 
belongings or assisting nursing in 
escorting patients in wheelchairs and 
their belongings to hospital, exit. 

P.S.S. volunteers will periodically 
stop in patient rooms for a brief visit. 

P.S.S. volunteers will attempt to 
respond to any other patient requests 
if cleared through nursing. 

Q U O T E S 

'The covetous man is ever in want 
—Horace 

Regardless of how much or how little of this world's material 
things he may possess, the man who is satisfied with what he has 
needs nothing more. A very wealthy individual who. craves even 
more can drive himself insane with discontent; based on .greed. ::::;r 

^~~-The secret of contentment lies not in what we Have but in our 
attitude toward what we do not have. If we are envious of others we 
will always be in want, unable to fully enjoy the many things with 
which ^generous providence has blessed us. 

Our years of experience enable us to answer your questions 
about funerals. Let us outline the advantages of making detailed ar­
rangements well in advance of need. Call us. 

FUNERAL CHAPEL 
- Chelsea funerai Home withthe 

"HOME" Like Atmosphere 
2.14 EAST MIDDLE ST. PHONE 475-1551 

/ * 

STEVE 
QLMSTED ' ir Washtenaw County Drain Commissioner 

• A master's degree in urban planning from 
the University of Michigan. 

• 10 year's experience in all areas of community 
growth and development. 

• M e m b e r of the Pittsfield Township Zoning 

iUBirm 

I f.ifc 

.Board of or^^rmm- <.>m * „ ^r 
SreveOlmsted believed therris a criticalVreed to 
•WfiWfth'sollnd'p'cyHc^fdr the protection o f our, 
water supply. He encourages (1) the elimination 
of toxic substances in our water resources (2) con 
stan.t management of stormwater runoff (3) re­
duction of top-soil erosion. anH-f4) an p»pnlist: 
review of toxic waste facilities. 

Paid lor by tne Committee to Elect Steve Olmsted 
7794 Warner Roaa'Salme. Mi 48176 

>aOKlAHU 

tSUBWRV 
SIDEWALK SALE 

Special 
Friday, July 31 & Saturday, Aug. t i t 

Buy Any Foot-Long Sub . . . 
W0t$$w: "T-^'^W-^W^*^ ?W?®? '^**$mm; 

•tfSRT:".:. . . . : .^ii«&*»*^ f e ' '*••• i^i&}i£l'-.*;&«M 
•jg&V/Wffl.f'z 

Glecta leader, not a Politician: 

ENDORSED BY: 
Ann Arbor News, 7-24-92 

'"Richardson has the edge... 
he is innovative and has the 
ability to grasp complex issues." 

Detroit Free Press, 7-21-92 _ 
~ "Bright, composted and not 

easily intimidated . . , " 

• . . and get your 2nd 
f o r A e * * * 

With purchase of a large drink 

•SUBWAY" of CHELSEA 
lnth# 

1107 1Htt*3S& Call (313) 475-SUBS 
•Second footlong SUB muit be of equal or letter value. Not good in combination with ony other offer.. 

1 om has lived in the 52nd District for most of his life. 
A former member of the Ann Arbor City Council, he is an honors 

graduate of Harvard and University of Michigan Law School. 
He and his wife Michele operate their family business, Liberty Title 

Company. They live on Ann Arbor's far West side with their 
children Bill, age 5 and Tracy, age 3. 

* *+ * * * * * * * * • 

Richorclson 
Republican/Representative * 52nd District 

Vote Rugust 4, ? 992 
Paid for by Richardson for Representative 

111 N. Main St. Ann Arbor, Ml 48104 313 666-)512 • PAX 313 666-4623 

I t f t f M H * * ^ .tJ^taafci^M 
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free, Convenient Perking!!! Savings Galore!!! 

SIDEWALK SALES AT CHELSEA 
v 

Tizza 

Cl^ 

CLASSIC DEEP-DISH 

9 5 with topping 

plus tax 

Additional toppings only $P° 

Carry-out only 

Offer good Friday, July 31 • Saturday, Aug. 1, 1992. 

Sidewalk Specials 
VL50% 

1060 SOUTH MAIN STREET CHELSEA SHOPPING CENTER 
, Ladies Apparel 

7 

New, Fall-fashions arriving daily !!! 
Now carrying 

X-larges and Plus sizes 
' • * " • ~ — — . - . — . . 

^¾ Lots of free parking 

UA1RLUBE 
Chelsea Travel 

in tho 
CHELSEA SHOPPING CENTER 

1070 S. Main St., Chelsea 

PK, 475-3TT0 

Monday-Friday 
8:30 a.m.-5 p.m. 

Evenings and Saturday 
by appointment 

AFurr s 
and PORTRAIT STUDIO 

1 Hr. Service - Free Double Prints 
135, 110, 126 or Disc 

••%•%! 

nstont 

Chelsen Shnnninn Center 
•*mr - * -mr m w < v -^PV ^ ^ • M **m W B W • « • -^rm y^r W • - • **m> w 

1090 South Main St. 

hoto 475-5920 

JOIN US FOR SUMMER SID 
t . jJi lis*. 

SAVINGS 
BOTH DAYS: JULY 31st & August 1st 

^ 2 O F F ALL, SERVICES 
1 0 % ALL MATRIX 
O F F HAIR PRODIJCTS 

12 years and older. Not good with any other coupons or specials. 

Talk with our Professional Experts . . . 
Lisa, Theresa, Christine, Lynette, Chantel, Shammy, 

Carrie, Gndy & Wendy. 

/MMM 
" AttU 

. . . THE LEADER Iff HAiR CARE FASHION 

tionec. 
perms. 
and-now cuts ancl styles. Our professional experts 

will recommend the Matrix Essentials hair 

color and perms just right for your spirited 
summer. 

\ 

y matrix 
ESSE.NTIALS 

JF" TrT i"k. • 

• f 6*tA 

1008000 

iafen, 
1020 S. main St., Chelsea «(313) 475-7006 

HOLTIS: MON.-THLRS.: 8(3041(00, FRLt 8t304s00, SAT.j 8t30-ffx00 
N^oiMtBtaaaooeaoeoaeeooooeaooeaoeoeooooeo 
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Rain or Shine!I! Fast Courteous Service!!/ Friday & Saturday 

SHOPPING CENTERJu,y" * *—' 
1170 S.M.32, Chelsea 

MEABON'S 
TEreVlSlONrAPPLTAl 

Complete Line for the Home 

(313) 473-1666 

Iftifr 'BEST" Redlnors & Rocking Swirl Chairs 
In a variety of styles A colorsl 

• TELL CITY solid oak dining room & bedroom sets 
* Living room furniture • Large selection of carpeting 

and much morelt 

Take advantage of great discounts, mark-downs, specials 
and STORE-WIDE SAVINGS. 

Cafe 
$ % * TamityTtining 

1120 South Main Street • Chelsea • 475-7714 

= 4 1 ^ 

CHELSEA 
1̂7 

MasterCard 

1050 S. MAIN 
IN CHELSEA SHOPPING CENTER 

475,1188 
- "mm, ••? > 

HOURS; Mi > = 5 -

SUMMERTIME 
SAVINGS 

Stock-up on 

Paper Plates 
for summer barbecues and . . . 

lOOct. . . . 6 9 C 

e-L« 
. Hey 

pM 

2 Liter 

99« plus 
deposit 

o * * * WS4 

^ / 

,'""»iit„ i'.'in 

ksfisfSH 

wSfr, - N M 

,„ Jw 

LSEA AREA CHAMBER OF GOAAMER( 1ke carit &•&<£, MjjrfWM, W i t 

* ,.. 

• M 



The Chelseo Stondord, Wednesdov, July 29,1992 

COMIVTUNITY 
CALENDAR 

Recycling Authority Members like 
Idea of Building Transfer Station 

Monday— 
Lima Township Board meets the first Monday of 

each month at 8 p.m., Lima Township Hall. 
advxMH 

• • • 
Chelsea High School P.T.T. (Parents-Teachers 

Together), second Monday of each month, 7:30 
p.m., in Board of Education Room. 

• » • 
Chelsea Recreation Council 7:30 p.m., fourth 

Monday of the, montbLViUageJfrui^diambjrt. 
< • * 

Chelsea Rebekah Lodge No. 130 meets the first 
and third Tuesday of each month, at 7:30 pjn. 

• • • 
Chelsea Amateur Radio Club, Inc., fourth .Tues­

day of each month, 7 p jn., Society Bank basement. 
• • • 

Chelsea Chamber of Commerce Board of Direc­
tors meetings, second Tuesday, each month, noon, 
Chelsea Community Hospital, private dining room. 

7tf 
• • • » • 

r>)wntowi>{>eve)opmet^uthof4fyi4eeoiKi-Tuee--
day each month at 8 a.m. in the Chelsea Village 

ok . i . . . « < . « i . n „ h m t r i . « » » u m u h » A.it Council chambers. It Is a board of directors Chelsea Kiwanis Club meets every Monday, 6:15 , , ^ , ^ ^ . ^ ^ to m]cam to attend. p.m. in the main dining room of Chelsea Communi- « * « « * i « i w w . • » W W H « W aHWi 
ty Hospital. For further information, phone John &nokMB-Ananvm«»-Ewrv Tu**tav^e*<*ot~ ™TOio^l7S^3KS7TrrwrltrtoT^)'.*BBre7r-—— " S I ^ « l / A n « n y a » « » s - - B v e r y Tuesday ^except 

* * * 
Chelsea School Board meets the first and third 

Mondays of each month, 8 p m , in the Board 
Room. 

• * • 
Chelsea Lioness, second Monday of each month*" 

at the Meeting Room in the Society Bank on M-62, 
Chelsea, at 7:36 p.m. Call 475-1791 for information. 

Waterloo Area Historical Society Board of Direc­
tors meets the third Monday of each month 7:30 
p.m„ at Waterloo Farm Museum. For more infor­
mation call Agnes Dikeman, 769-2219. 

Victorian Villa in Union City Dinner 
Theatre presenting "Mass Appeal," 
Aug. 29, $50. Call Burns Park Senior 
Center, 769-5911. 

Thursday— 
As Parents We Will group meats third Thursday 

each month 7 p.m., Beach, school media center. 
For information Cheryl Davis, 47M131, ext. 28. 

Tuesday— 
* 

McKune Memorial library Board, 7:30 pin., 
third Tuesday of the month at McKune Memorial 
Library, 221 S. Main St. Individuals with 

the first Tuesday of each month) at St. James 
Episcopal church, 3279 Broad St., Dexter, 7:30 to 
8:30p.m. Questions? Call 426-8896. 4tf 

Wednesday— 
Friends of McKune Memorial 

Library meets at 7 p.m. on the first 
Wednesday of each month upstairs at 
the library. Meetings are occasionally 
held at the homes of members. Upon 
request, meetings may be scheduled 
at an alternate accessible site. For hi* 
formation call the Library at 475-8732. 

Mystery Book Club meets on the 
third Thursday of every month at the 
McKune Memorial Library. The club, 
sponsored by the Friends of McKune 
Memorial Library, is free and open to 
the public. Visitors are welcome. To 
request that the group use an alter­
nate accessible meeting space please 
call the Library at 475-8732. 

Chelsea Rod and Gun Club Auxiliary regular 
meeting, second Thursday of each month, 7:30, 
clubhouse, Lingane Rd. 

Players Board meeting 
. h month, 7:30 pan., at 

Bank meeting room. For more information 

ChglSftfi Arfifl 

Thursday of each month, 7:30 pan, 
second 
Society 

call 

disabilities requiring-auxiliary aids or services—day of-roonth^un., at Sylvan Township Hall. 112 
* iitaetthe Ouetlui uf We llUiary. Fur lii- "W. MlddftSt SllUlilU Luiiu 

formation call 475-8732. 

Chelsea Zoning Board of Appeals, third Wednes-

advWtt 

475-2629. 
» • • 

American Legion Post No. 31. General meeting 
the first Thursday of each month at the post home, 
CataiaugliEBk'e; "• • • 

Western Washtenaw Recycling 
Authority may soon get into the trash 

• business. 
The majority of members told 

Chelsea Village Manager Jack Myers 
they are interested in constructing a 
transfer station as a collection point 
for trash generated by the western 
part of the county. 

The village says its Werkrier Rd. 
landfill could be out of space by the 
end of the year or shortly thereafter. 
It is interested in finding another 
place to take its trash since construc­
tion of another landfill seems to be out 
of the question. 

„„..The„tranaf/er station would be a 
place where all trash haulers, as well 
as township residents, could bring 
their trash. From there it would he 
hauled to a landfill, probably the 
Browning Ferris Industries landfill in 
Salem township. 

In addition to providing perhaps the 
most economical way for the area to 
dispose of its trash, the station is also 
seen as the only way small, indepen­
dent trash haulers will be able to stay 
in business. 

Myers plans to schedule a meeting 
with authority members and BFI to 

^»fig»RS atf f tnwfAP-stat inn.RFT h a s In . 

Dexter Township Board will meet the first and 
third Tuesdays of the month, .7:30p_.m., at Dexter 
Township Hall. 

Rotary Club, 12 noon Tuesday, at Common Grill. 
. » « • 

Chelsea Village Council, second and fourth Tues­
day of month, 7:30 pjn., at Sylvan Township Hall, 
112 W. Middle St. adv44tf 

Chelsea Village Planning Commission, third 
Tuesday of month, 7:30 p.m., at Sylvan Township 
Hall, 112 W. Middle S\. adv44tf 

Fraternal Order of Eagles, Ladies Auxiliary No. 
2154 meet second, fourth Wednesday of each 
month, 7:30 pjn., 7530 Jackson Rd. 

• • • 
Chelsea Athletic Boosters membership meeting 

third Wednesday of each month; Board of Direc­
tors meet the second Wednesday, 7.-30 p.m., 
Chelsea High Media Center. tf 

OES Past Matrons dinner and meeting at Senior 
Citizen site, Faith in Action building, second 
Wednesday every month at 11:45 a m . Ph. 47W141 

. for reservations by Monday preceeding meeting.' 
•33-2 

• • • 
VFW Post 4076 meeting second Wednesday of 

month, 7:30 pjn. VFW Hall, 105 N. Main. 

T S S ? a g f t g J ' ™-W- Union Grange, No. 882, mee.ts.tbe sec; 
-hattrHiWrf '" 

Knights of Columbus Women's Auxiliary, first 
"Tffunaayefeach month, 8 p mratKrof CrHall; 
20750 Old US-12. 

— - - - - - « • • - • • • • 

Substance Abuse Lecture Series: Meetings: 7:15 

& m. every Thursday; Chelsea Community 
ospltal, Dining Room. Series is open to the public 

to provide awareness and education regarding 
various aspects of alcoholism or other chemical 
dependence abuse. 

Friday— \ 
* 

Senior Citizens meet third Friday of every month 
for pot-luck dinner, games and cards, 6 p.m. at 
Senior Citizen Activities Center at Faith in Action 
Bldg., on Hospital grounds. 

self-help group for 

dicated it is interested and could even 
provide financing, BFI would make 
its money from hauling charges (from 
the station to the landfill) plus landfill 
charges. 

The northern townships in the 
authority, Sylvan, Lima, Lyndon, and 
Dexter, as well as Manchester 
village, have indicated they are in­
terested in the idea. Bridgewater and 
Manchester townships still want to 
find out what is involved. 

"I'd say the idea of a transfer sta­
tion was greeted with no anxiety and a 

fMtMel 
£L'£f' Plttsfleld Union Grange, No. 882, meets the sec- Parents Anonymous, a seu-neip group ior • " " ' " " ^ ' y ^ 7 . . « «.«.• i • ^ m K L - ^ - i l 
w"§SB---uiitlWwMiwUay uf euuh month, 6 pjn. at Pittsfleld—abusive or potentially abu» parents; Fr idaya, -70—reasonable f e e l i n g t h a t It Will Be p o s s i -

" ^ Grange Hall, 3337 Ann Arbor-SaUneRd., Ann Ar- -^ jnr^parat f r^Md^^rouprSame itight^Gall—ble tO WOfk it Out," Said a u t h o r i t y 31tf 4754952 or 4754176 for information. 
American Business Women's Association 6:30 

p.m. at the Chelsea Hospital fourth Tuesday of 
each month. Call 475-2041 for information. 

• • * 
Olive Lodge 156 F&AM, Chelsea. Regular 

meeting, first Tuesday of each month. 
i • a 

Lima Township Planning Commission, third 
Tuesday of each month, 8 p.m., Lima Township 
Hall. ; r " advxSOtf 

• • • 
Lions Club, first and third Tuesday of every 

month, 6:45 p.m., at Chelsea Community Hospital. 
Ph. 475-7324 or write P.O. Box 121, Chelsea. • • • 

Chelsea Rod and Gun Club regular meeting, sec­
ond Tuesday of each month at the clubhouse, 
Lingane Rd, 

49tf 

Friends of McKune Memorial Library meets at 7 
p.m. first Wednesday of each month upstairs at 
McKune Memorial Library. Visitors are welcome. 

* • • 
Chelsea Depot Association will meet the first 

Wednesday qf each month at 7 a.m. at the Chelsea 
Depot. Every third month, beginning with the 
month of November, the meetings will be at 7 p.m. 
All Interested persons are welcome to attend. • • • 

Chelsea-Manchester Chapter No. 108, OES, 
meets the first Wednesday of each month, 7:30 
p.m., Masonic Temple, 113 W. Middle. 

Senior Adult Day Bus Trip to 
Golden Voyage Mini-Cruise on Lake 
St. Clair, Aug. 5, $45. Call Burns Park 
Senior Center, 769-5911. 

Saturday— ?? 

VFW Ladies Auxiliary, second Saturday of each 
month, 9:30 a.m., at VFW Hall, 105 N. Main. 

Misc. Notices— 
COMING SOON—Tecumseh 

sidewalk sale Friday, July 24, and 
Saturday, July 25. c8-2 

vice-chair Frank Hammer, who also 
chairs the Chelsea village solid waste 
committee. 

In other authority news, contracts 
for the materials recovery facility at 
the village landfill were scheduled to 
be signed by this week. The building 
could be constructed and made opera­
tional by sometime in September. 

Chelsea Historical Museum open every Satur­
d a y , 1 to 3 pirnr Meet^econd-Mon * 
month, 7:30 p.m. Everyone welcome. 514 

Parent to Parent Program: in home, friendly, 
ting support system foi 

Call 475-3305. 
visiting support system for families with children. 

-ROBERT BRABBS 

/i)»»<j^'*4<.>'to%ViiH&1,«sft•»•'>'.,.« '.. MWPm&fy®. 

HE ATI NG & COOLI NG 
"Tho Specialist" 

Sales • 24 Hour Service • Installation 
S47596-2729 

PLEASE CALL FOR A FfcEE ESTIMATE 
8780 Moeckel Rd., Grass Lake,"Mi 49240 

Parents Without Partners, support group for 
single parents. Youth activities, social events, 
discussion groups. For membership information, 
call recording at 973-1933. : 

• • • 
Home Meals Service, Chelsea. Meals served dai­

ly to elderly or disabled. Costper meal, $2.60 for 

• . ; . • • , • • • • • ^ 

Chelsea Social Service, 475-1581, 2nd floor of 
Village Offices. Thursdays, 10 to 4, or If an 
emergency need at other times, call Jackie at 
475-1925 or Bonnie at 475-0137. > • • 

Aiuuiiilt Crisis Center ha« mnvwi to lMfl Pur karri 

Rd., Y; 
line,. 

ilanti 48197. 
-7942,bi 

Ph. 483-RAPE, 24-hour crisis 

Sidewalk Sale 
(Continued from page one) 

St. between East St. and Madison St. 
on Saturday from 10 a.m. to 3 p.m. 

Chelsea magicians Boyer & Fitz-
simmons will perform a magic show 
for all ages on Saturday at 11:30 a.m. 
on E. Middle St. 

^MMi^mM»Mm^m^mk 
up on. gauraay. near the Sylvan* 
wmd^t.:. ••:.... ' .̂.u::;; 

WHLC-TV roving reporter Alex 
Weddon will be on hand to film 
Chelsea citizens. 

Lions Club Sightmoblle will per— 

A Free 
Insurance Review 

Are your insurance policies giving you the 
coverage you need? Our free insurance 
review will answer some important questions 
about your insurance needs. Call today for a 
confidential review. 

Making your future more predictable. 
mim FARM BUREAU 
mm. INSURANCE 

DAVE ROW! CPCU 
121 S. Main 

Chelsea, Ml 48118 
Phone: 479-9184 

III* U1*J ftmjh . 11» MUtl lilt . l&JW M l v 4f«U' . <» urn?" 

Faith in Action House Community Center, open 
daily throughout the week provides various free 
services to those in need. Services include food, 
clothing, financial help, advocacy and many other 
forms of assistance. Need friendly help? Call us 
from 9 a.m. to 4 p.m., 475-3305. • • » 

Chelsea Together. For information, call 4754030, 
M-F, 8 a.m.-5 p.m., or 475-6935, M-F, 5 p.m.-9 p.m. 

, Waterloo Senior Nutrition program meets 
Tuesdays and Thursdays at 12 noon, Waterloo 
Township Hall. For reservations call 476-7439 be­
tween, 10 a.m. to 1 p.m. Lunches, cards and 
fellowship. 

form vision tests on W. Middle St. 
Chelsea Children's Co-6perative7 

Pre-school will have a duck pond 
somewhere downtown. 

I Happy 

Someone DOES Core... 

Chelsea Help Line 
In Cooperation with SOS 

Let Us Help — -

Coll: 475*0111 
(SOS Will Help You) 

Paint Ball Gun 
Used in Vandalism 

A McKinley St. resident had a 
screen shot out of a front window by 
someone using a paint ball gun on 
Saturday, July 18. 

The resident told police she heard a 
noise outside while she was watching 
television at about 1 a.m. but thought 
it was something that had fallen out of 
a tree. . _ _ 

Damage was estimated at $50. 

•Gl ITAR-
LESSONS 

Fast Results! 
20 years experiences all styles 

roon't be a-, 
taartbreaker 

o 
O 
Stop 

smoking 

8 
5 

c 
a 

Birthday, 
Emily! 

Love, 
Mom, Dad 

Laura & Jennie 

AfiSfc"* 
l & ^ K * * * * 6 

Gl IT AR 
REPAIR 

Call 475-2964 

J Name_ 

^ Address 

i City _ 
I 

SUBSCRIPTION ORDER FORM 
_ far • "• 

©tie QUjdsea 5>tanfcard 
State Zip 

clip and tend with payment in odvantm to 
THE CHELSEA STANDARD, 300 N. MAIN, CHELSEA Ml 48116-1502 

-&••• 
BY MAIL DELIVERY 

tIS/yr., «10/6 mot. 
Elsewhere in Michigan 

*20/yr., in ' /6 mot. 
Outtide Michigan (In U.S.) 

tlS/yeer, t t /omot. 
In Wathtenaw County, Grots Lotto, 
Gregory, Hamburg, Munlth, Northvilte, 
Prnckney, Plymouth, South Lyon 8 

Stockbridge 

D flenewo/ 
D New Subscription 

Congratulations) 

You've 
made It to 

Happy Anniversary 

July 29th 
Mom & Dad 

Love, 
all your kids 

H H M a o B B m a a 

Happy 25th 
Wedding 

iversary 
Bill & Mary 

Lutz 
from your friends 
at 
Mt. Hope Bible Church J 

http://mee.ts.tbe
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Professional Home 
Maintenance 

Carpentry, Plumbing 
Electrical 
Appliance Repair 

We Fix It ALL 
INSUREO 

Call the Home Doctor! 
426-371¾ 

Chelsea Police 
Aid Sheriffs Deputy 

A 22-year-old man may face 
charges of assaulting a police officer 
in connection with an incident in Dex­
ter on Sunday, July 26. 

Chelsea police responded to help a 
Washtenaw County Sheriffs Depart­
ment Deputy at 1:24 a.m. A "highly 
intoxicated" man was throwing rocks 
at the deputy, police said. 

A search found the suspect, John 
Crawford, hiding under a bush. 

M U N Z E L for M I C H I G A N 
House of Representatives 52nd District Democrat 

Reform Property Taxes 
Protect the Environment 
Pro-Choice 
Support Educational . 
Excellence 
Pursue Economic Growth 
Accountability in 
Government 
Eliminate Official Perks 

Scott chairs the Sheriffs Community 
Relations Advianjry ^ ^ 

COMMUNITY SERVICE and FAMILY VALUES 

Scott, wife Lori Ward, and son Griffin 

• J.D., U of M Law School 
- Peace Corps Volunteer -

Ecuador, Agriculture 
-B.A.,yofM, 

Marching Band 
- Private legal practice 
• Chairperson, Washtenaw 
County Sheriffs 
Community Relations 
Advisory Board 

- Member, Ann Arbor 
Zoning Board of Appeals 

- Pro-bono counsel, 
Save Black Pond Woods 

VOTE AUGUST 4th 
Paid for by the Committee to Elect Scott Munzel State Representative, 
1116 W. Washington St. Ann Arbor, MI 48103 

The Cholseo Stondord, Wednesdoy, July 29,1992 9 

When you see news happening 
call 475-1371! 

FRIENDS OF McKune Memorial Library Lew Green (left) and Greg Raye 
examine some of the books that will be available at the Friend's Annual Sum­
mer Book Sale this Friday and Saturday. In the background, Mary Lou Bower 
sortsidlemany cbJldren's books tb^t will D€ available. 

Friends of Library 
Plan Summer Sale 

INDISTRUCTIBLI 
MAILBOXES 
I I I ! ! ! ! ! ! ! ! 
Tired of replacing 
mailboxes 6 posts ? 
? ? ? ? ? ? ? ??7? 

Call 
The Mailbox Man 
for our- free- catalog-v 

over 500 yard 6 garden accents 
(313)434-1380 

(313) 434-3468 evenings 
. WE INSTALL & BEAUTIFY 

Your advertising support makes this newspaper possible. 

Friends of McKune Memorial 
Library will bold their annual sum­
mer Book Sale on Friday, July 31, 
from 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. and Saturday, 
Aug, 1, from 9 a.m. to 3 p.m. at the 
library. 

—Books-wiU-bepriced at fflf, fifty and 
$1. Some special volumes, recent edi­
tions, videos, books on tape and 
records will be sold at slightly higher 
prices. 

Baked goods donated by members 
of the Friends of McKune Memorial 
Library group and others, who support 
library programs also will be 
available on Saturday, Aug. 1. 

Volunteers are being recruited to 
assist booksale chairpersons Ben 
Bower and Allen Cole in moving the 
books from the basement of the 
library to the front lawn on Friday, 
Aug. 31 at-8 a.m. The movo takes ap-r 
proximately 30 minutes. If you are in­
terested in volunteering please report 
to the library promptly at 8 a.m. 

Area Students 
On Dean9* List^ 
At U'M Engineering 

Several area students were named 
to the Dean's List at the University of 
Michigan College of Engineering for 
the winter term. 

The students are Scott and Linda 
Mullison, and Eaton Weiler of 
Chelsea; David C. Hochrein, Joseph 
Scheuring, and Kirk Van Natter of 
Dexter; Trevor Harding of Gregory; 
and James Hall of Manchester. 

PAID POLITICAL ADVERTISEMENT 

STANOWSKI 
«• f A -a? 

•MA 

Jgf/y ••*'*• 
/j /4? . 

mm,. 
:~ <&<- yj* 

'? 
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PROSECUTING ATTORNEY 
23 YEARS Of TRIAL 

& STATE 
j s. 

t < 

V4 

1BP; 

John W. Stanowskl 
Senior Trial Attorney 

»3: 

—Felonies and Misdemeanors 
—Probate and Juvenile Court & 
~~ Detinqueni and Abused Children 
—Administrative Boards and Hearings 

KYEARSASASSl FMSECUIMG ATOMY 
FOR PROSECUTOR WILLIAM F. DELHEY 

SHARING YOUR CONCERNS O N THESE ISSUES: 
BDeclining Property Values Due To Crime IZlSpouse And Child Abuse 
0Drugs gnd Assaultive Crimes 0 Repeat Offenders 
BThe Victim And Their Rights 0Property Crimes 

* PROFESSIONAL * ETHICAL * EXPERIENCED 
Paid for by Stanowskl for Prosecuting AHorney CommlHce, 9 4 4 9 M o o n Rd., Saline, Ml 4 8 1 7 6 . Gera ld Rushlow, Treasurer 

A© ,. 

GEMINI . 3 p.m v« 
?.̂ -> 

INFORMATION HOTLINE: 426-2888 

sTwnl" • 4 p 

' Swiss Steak Fry 
4:30 to 8 p.m. 

American Legion 
Dexter-Chelsea Rd.—just past Main 

Times 

\ 

Delicious 
Food 

I 

Tent 

Free 
Entertainment! >si 

>«•-•-
A- •£»• 

'**•& •t̂ :« • ? » s ^ ' » ^ m v \\ y &* ̂ m * * <**Jk 

Saturday 
Parade at 10 a.m. 
Antique Fire Engine Muster 

at American Legion 
Plymouth 
FIFE & DRUM CORPS 
White Heather 
B A G P I P E B A N D 

St. James Church 

T«> OLIVIA STREET 
STUMPERS . . . 5:30 p.m. 

Fun Run 
7 p.m. 

GEORGE BEDARD 
& The Kingpins 8 p.m. 

FRIDAY & SATURDAY 
'EVENTS. 

Arts and Crafts Displays 
K of C Bingo 
Boy Scout Troop 477 Dank Tank 
Doxter Historical Museum Open House, Noon«3t00 p.m. 
Fire Safety House 
Chelsea Hospital Health Screening 
Klwants and Otsenlngo Lodge Raffles 
Firefighters* Beer Tent 

1 Fantastic Showboat 
Non-stop puppet entertainment 

for children of al l ages! 

Chicken Bar-B-Q 
11:30 a.m.-6 p.m. 

Horseshoe Tournament 
Main St., behind Fire Hall 

* 

Chelsea 
Classic Cruiser Car Show 

Library Book Sale 
RAGTIME CHARLIE n • 
& SISTER KATE ...•*• p . « l . • 

RFD BOYS . 5 p.m. . 

SIDEWAYS . 8 p .m. ; 
km*., Snttr \kn, 0* Mwi, ffrtt Ptddtor, DAttO, km AiWr Nw, «««*> Bftat Ukn towory. 
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Dial-A-Garden 
Topics Listed 

The following is a weekly schedule 
of Dial-A-Garden, the system of pre­
recorded daily gardening tips spon­
sored by the Washtenaw County Co­
operative Extension Service. The 
system is in operation 24 hours a day, 
seven days a week. Interested persons 
are invited to call 971-1129 at their con­
venience to listen to timely, up-to-date 
gardening information. 
Wednesday, July 29— "Animals in the 

Garden." 
Thursday, July 30—"Lawn Aeration." 
Fjiday, July 31-"Powdery Mildew." 
Monday, Aug. 3^*eaitrolling Pleas;" 
Tuesday, Aug. 4—"Dividing Iris and 

Daylilies." 
Wednesday, Aug. 5—"Summer Prun­

ing of Fruit Trees." 

Severe Weather 
Program Slated 
At Eddy Center 

A program on severe summer 
weather will be held on Sunday, Aug. 2 
at 2 p.m. at the Eddy Geology Center 
in the Waterloo Recreation Area. 

Joe Kopecek, meteorologist for 
WILX-TV (channel 10) in Jackson will 
discuss, tornadoes, lightning_stormsJ_ 

Elvis Sighting Highly Likely 
At Saturday^ Concert in Park 

and other severe weather topics. 
The free program is sponsored by 

the Waterloo Natural History Associa-
-tiem State motor vehicle permits are 
required to enter the center. 

For more information call 475-3170. 

After grabbing a burger in 
Kalamazoo* "The King" is-scheduled 
to perform in Chelsea Saturday when 
the third Concert in the Park begins at 
6 p.m. in Pierce Park. , 

Dave King of Brighton is scheduled 
to bring his' 'Tribute to Elvis" show to 
Pierce Park, the first time an Elvis 
Presley impersonator has performed 
in the series. 

King's show, called "a professional 
masterpiece," has been performed at 
various "lR>te1te~aiidnrffiste^ toe 
greater Detroit area, as well as at the 
Nectarine Ballroom in Ann Arbor and 
Bob-Lo Island. 

Oz Productions says "The voice, the 
music, the movements have been 
carefully studied and duplicated in 
such a way as to convey to the au­
dience a true feeling of 'living 
nostalgia.' His show has been known 
to bring tears to the eyes of those who 
lived through the ear of the 'King', 
and a respectful understanding to 
those who were not a part of that 
magic musical time." 

Cottage Inn Pizza will again provide 
concessions featuring pizza, drinks, 
and breadstieks. A portion of pro­
ceeds will be donated to the Chelsea 
Area unamoer ot commerce. ~" 

Concert-goers are also encouraged 
to bring their own food and drinks, 
folding chairs, or other creature com­
forts. However, alcoholic beverages 
are not allowed. 

Free parking is available on the 

grounds of Chelsea Community 
Hospital next to the park. 

The concert series is sponsored by 

the Chelsea Area Chamber of Com­
merce and the Chelsea Recreation 
Council. 

Simpllaliq 
Sales, Service, Parti 

Model LTH 
• 12.5 h.p. Vanguard twin cylinder 
engine 

• 38" axle-mounted mower 
• Deluxe hydrostatic trantmitsior* 

Mo.Vr rCtvd VISA 

Dexter Rental-Dexter 
12.5 LTH 38 

3629 Control St. 496-2216 

Nfc?" 

^4* 

V 
•t) 

t? 

> I?J 

ALL MAKES 

PAINT JOB 
(517)522-5122 

AS LOW AS 

*1SA c 

. tiMiLr! 
CARS 
TRUCKS 

Don't Vote For Me lfw 

*?ou want a career politician 
.you believe our school ta* money 

should leave our district 
•you want "BIG C1TV" liberals 

mahing laws for you 

Vote For Me I f . 
»_you believe in limited terms ___ 

for elected officials ~ 
• you believe our school tax money 

should stay in our school* -
• you believe in traditional family 

values 

Vote August 4 

DENNIS PETSCH 
COMPLETE COLLISION SERVICE-BODY REPAIRS 

FREE ESTIMATES 

ILIS COLLISION 
142 W.Michigan A vo. Grass Lglc* 

Your advertising support moires this newspaper possible. 

REELECT 

EARL 
V 

DOLETZKY 
for 

DEXTER TOWNSHIP 
TRUSTEE 

Your vote will 
be appreciated! 

, PRIMARY ELECTION 
^ - TUESDAYHHia^ 

Paid for by Committee To Re-Elect 

DAVE KING will bring his Elvis impersonation act to Chelsea this Saturday' 
from 6 p.m. to 8 p.m. In Pierce Park. 

Area Students 
Have 4.0 Averages 
At Michigan State 

Several area students earned 
perfect 4.0 grade point averages at 
Michigan State University for the 
spring semester. 

The students are Martin C. Heller, 
20640 Sager Rd., Chelsea, a senior 
chemical engineering major; Bryan 
Talbot, 20905 Sager Rd., Chelsea, a 
junior mechanical engineering ma­
jor; Timothy Burkhardt, 20432 Logan 
Rd., Manchester, a junior accounting 
major; and Christopher Willett, 1983 
Cherry Ln., Pinckneyr v" • 

Republican t>2n<i district 
r«i »8» uier iiMvi MUM «T»ti 

Earl Ooletrky Dexter Township Trustee J* National Animal Prison Centre* Center ' 

0'Hagan 
BitlSftM&:.> ifii&L-.. • 

T E R i R E N C e O ' H A G A N ' F O R 
W A S H T E N A W C O U N T Y P R O S E C U T I N G A T T O R N E Y 

"Terry O'Hagan is an 
accomplished trial lawyer 
with the full range of 
experience necessary to bring_ 
positive change to the office 
of Prosecuting Attorney." 

—Thomas Giles Kavanagh, 
Former Chief Justice, 
Michigan Supreme Court, 
retired. 

A full range of experiences 
Outstanding trial attorney—23 years in state and federal courts 
Professional litigator—Advanced certificates from the National College 

of Advocacy 
Educator—Taught high school government and adult education law 

classes, Ann Arbor and Ypsilami schools, and the American Institute 
of Paralegal Studies 

The effective candidate: 
Managed successful law practice for 23 years 
Served as President of the Washtenaw County Trial Lawyers' Association 
Served 3 terms on the ExecutivjLBoard of the Michigan Trial Lawyers' 

iation 

Committed to improvement: 
Will inspire highest level of professional performance of the 

Prosecutor staff ~ -•• "' 
Will improve the efficiency of office administration to save tax, dollars 
Will encourage community involvement at all levels in. 

Washtenaw County 

Democrat 

P A I'D F O f t . B Y T H E O ' H A G A N F O R P R O S E C U T O R 
C O M M I T T E E . F U L T O N E A G M N , T R E A S U R E R 
6 0 3 W H U R O N , A N N A R B O R , M l 4 6 1 0 3 . 8 9 6 - 8 4 4 6 

(217)333-3611 

Elect 
WILLIAM D. 

Paid for bv the political committee to elect 
William D. Ferns (313) 428-9144 

for 
Wffshtenaw County 

Drain Commissioner 
PRIMARY ELECTION, AUG. 4 

"Meeting the concerns of rural 
ban~7development while 

protecting our environment from 
pollution." 

STOP WASHINGTON FROM 
\ 

YOUR 
J. 

-¾¾ 

**A 

V 

i^L'iJ.W'^ ** i 

Kfwwjv. 

\ 

ELECT 

REPUBLICAN, 

for U.S. Congress 
A PROVEN RECORD OF NO WASTE IN GOVERNMENT. 

Paid for by 
O'Connor 

{or Congrwt 

mmmmmm 
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Biff Weber Graduates from The Chelseo Stqndord. Wednesday, July 29, 1992 11 

Dealer Candidate Academy Fe8tival of Michi8an Folklife Set at MSU in Au8mt 

*f Miofcloon'a—rmiofo—«wna-»•—nuH—iniif.fi-mi^^MiiWM.u.^-At..,^ Admission is 115 in a<iuflnca>.i20 i t Michigan Biff Weber of Palmer Motor Sales, 
Inc., Chelsea, graduated recently 
from the Dealer Candidate Academy 
of the National Automobile Dealers 
Association. The specialized training 
curriculum is tailored to prepare 
dealer-successors and key manage' 
ment personnel to operate a new-car 
or-truck dealership. 

Weber plans to use the academy 
training to increase his knowledge of 
successful dealership operations and 
to prepare for further responsibilities 
in the family dealership. 

—Weber holds a bachelor's degree 
from the University of Oregon, 
Eugene, Ore. 

The DADA Dealer Candidate 
Academy is an intensive 12-month ap­
prenticeship course in dealership 
management. Six weeks of classroom 
study in various locations across the 
country are combined with 45 weeks 
of in-dealership training to prepare 
students for dealership management 
positions. Thirty-seven percent of 
NADA academy graduates currently 
are either dealers or general mana­
gers of their own dealerships. An ad­
ditional 35 percent serve as depart­
ment managers in the dealership for 
which they may assume total 
management responsibility. 

The National Automobile Dealers—-
Association represents more than 
19,000 franchised new-car and -truck 
dealers holding 35,000 separate fran­
chises, domestic and import. 

Hiroshima Day 
Commemoration Set 
At Gallup Park 

All ages are invited to the Gallup 
Park Picnic Shelter in Ann Arbor on 
Thursday evening, Aug. 6 for the an-
nual "Celebration of Life,.Peace &̂  
Our Future" in commemoration of 
Hiroshima Day. 

Children's activities include lantern 
boat decorating, co-operative games, 
and origami taught by Don Shall. 

The program for all ages includes 
sacred dances lor universal peace led 
by Christopher Larkmoore, mime by 
Michael Lee, impressions on visiting 
Hiroshima by the Ann Arbor 8th 
graders just back from Japan, songs 
for peace & justice led by Common 
Ground Theater Ensemble, and a new 
song by Marcia Federbush. 

The evening begins at 6 p.m. with a 
pot-luck picnic and ends at dark with 
an interfaith litany and the traditional 
launching of the lantern boats. In case 
of rain, the entire program will take 
place at Temple Beth Emeth/St. 
Clare's Episcopal at 2309 Packard. 
Call 663-1870 if the weather is ques-
lonable. 
| The event is sponsored each year by 
the Interfaith Council for Peace and 
Justice and many area congregations. 
This year the end of the Cold War will 
add extra joy and hope to the celebra-
t̂torn • 

BIFF WEBER 

Michigan's-music—scene-is-well-
known for greatness, and you can get 
a taste of it, from blues and gospel to 
salsa and mariachi to pew wow music 
and fiddling, at the 1992 Michigan 
State University Museum Festival of 
Michigan Folklife. 

The Festival of Michigan Folklife 
celebrates the Columbian Quin­
centenary on Aug. 1-2 and 8-9, focus­
ing on the cultural contributions of 
Michigan's American Indians, 
Latinos, and African-Americans. 

Representative musical artists 
from these three ethnic groups will 
perform all day each of the four days 
of the festival, bringing amazing 
musical sounds to MSU's campus. 

Five blues acts will be there, along 
with gospel and rap artists. One of the 
blues and jazz bands, Chicago Pete 
and the Detroiters, features Chicago 
Pete, who's style is a hot urban blues, 

t^on-andtraditionai-jazzrehicago 
Pete has won a number of awards, in­
cluding "Doing the Most to Save the 
Blues" in 1988. 

Four Latino acts will play at the 
festival, including the Texas-Mexican 
music group, Grupo Aldaco. 

Admission is 115 in advance, |20 at 
the gate, with day passes at $5. 
Children under 10 are free. Advance, 
buttons are available July 1-30 at AAA 

Michigan Full-Service Branch Of­
fices, Michigan Kroger Stores, the 
MUS Museum Store and Quality 
Dairy Stores. 

t^. 
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ASK ME ABOUT 

New 
Country 

Spec-Tacular 
Specials 
thru August I 

SANDY MIl.AZZO 

475-7666 
FORTUNE ENTERPRISES 

(517) 783-2758 

Elect Renee Vintzel LORIDAS 
f o r y o u r JitdLtje. C o u r t o f 

First Dmc\ (Includot: Uvlngston, Jackton, I M C W M , 
Monroe, Washtenaw and Wayne Countiei). 

Livingston County resident, 
Only candidate living outside Wayne County. 
Lawyer... Appeals / Trial practice... 11 years. 
Counselor/Educator... 10 years. . 
Parent... Married. 5 children, 

*AJI other candidates and all present sitting 
judges are Wayne County residents. 

Paid for by 'Commiuee to Elect Rene* Vinuel LoriiU* 
to Coon o/ Appeal." P.O. Bos 4095 Dta, MI 4 8 1 » 

"Paid poUiiotl 4dv«rti»«m«ot" 

"As Judge, J will apply the 
law, not make the taw," 

> 

OH YEAH/ IT'S FACTORY AUTHORIZED CLEARANCE TEfaE AT YOUR SUBURBAN DETROIT FORD DEALERS. 
DON'T MISS THIS ONCE-A-YEAR OPPORTUNITY TO SAVE BIG ON ALL 1992 MODEL CARS & 
TRUCKS, WITH LOW FINANCING & BIG REBATES.. .THE TIME IS NOW TO BUY A NEW FORD. 

State Agricultural 
Funding Total Shows 
Modest Growth 

The final-state Department of 
Agriculture budget signed by Gov. 
Engler provides slightly more funding 
for next year's programs. $27.2 
million is budgeted for 1992-93, com­
pared t* $28.« million this year^ 
nrtwriing tn Rnn Mplann, legislative 

counsel for Michigan Farm Bureau. 
"When you consider that inflation is 
projected at about three percent, this 
is really a hold-the-line budget even 
though it is up slightly," he said. "The 
good news is that the food safety pro­
grams important to Michigan con­
sumers will continue to receive ade­
quate funding." 

The Michigan FFA also got some 
good news in the state agriculture 
budget. Nelson said $30,000 was ap­
proved for 1992-93 activities. "When 
you're looking at $30,000, it seems like 

_ftlot_of money.But when you're look-
ing at a total state budget of $8 billion, 
it really is small change. However, 
it's very important small change, 
because with those dollars FFA has 
the financial backing to do the things 
they do so well, and that's working 
with youth in leadership training." 

Save $600(3) when you buy 
Prelerxed Equipment Package 
253A on 1992 Ford Probe LX. 

Combine Option Package Savings of $600 with Cash 
Bonus") fox a total value of $1600. Package includes: 
•3.0L 5-Speed Manual lAir Conditioning 

• Convenience Group I • Tinted 
Glass • Dual Illuminated Visor 
Vanity Minors i Rear Window 
Defroster • AM/FM Stereo Radio 
•And More.., 

Ford Festtva GL equipped with Preferred Equipment 
Package 383A. Package includes: • 1.3L EFI 5-Speed 
Transazle • Cloth & Vinyl High Back Bucket Seats 
•Electronic AM/FM Stereo w/Digital Clock • Rear 
Window Wiper/Washer • And More... 

mm 
Introduce beneficial bugs, which 

prey on your real pests. The beneficial 
bugs won't eliminate the pest entirely, 
but will prevent an infestation that 
could destroy your crops. 

Detroi t Edison 
Bonds 

7.03% 

MHiiiYiiK'irTTTT H'diMJi 

Save $700<3> when you 
' buy Preferred Equip­

ment Package 204A on 
v$1992 Ford Taurus GL, 

Combine Option Package Savings of $700 with 
Cash Bonustf) for a total value of $1700. Package 
includes: B3.0L Automatic Overdrive iAi i 
Conditioning iRear Window Defroster • Light 

Group • Power Windows 
(4) • Power Locks • Speed 

• Control! Power Seat 
•And More... 

Save $1000«> when you 
buy Pref erred Equip­
ment Package 240 A on 
1992 Ford Mustang LX. 

CASH 
BONUS 

•Combine Option Package Savings of $1000 with 
Cash Bonustf) for a total value of $2000. Package 
includes: • 2. 3L EFI 5-Speed Manual • Power , 
Windows • Power Locks • Speed Control iDual 

Electric Remote Control 
(4) Minors • And More.... 

AAA Rated & Insured 

•MaturityTJ7T570T*-

JIFF CRAUSE 
3300 Washtenaw, Ann Arbor 

930*1636 

SS Edward 
D. Jones & Co.* 
mmm n m w i w iitfmoi, wt 
>M9«wmnwimaii»iamM«C»Mini»« 

We know our cuttomm u well 
is wc know our ln*Mtin«fltt. 

•Itoto oxpfMMd m yloM to maturity 
tftetiv* 7/29/99. Sub)«t to avollcfcll-
ty Morkot flik It o wmlaVotlon on In-
vMtmOfltt «old prior to moturltjf. 

<1) Cash Bonus from Ford or 4.8% Annual Percentage Rate financing through Ford Credit 
for qualified buyers. 48 months at $22.94 per month per $1000 financed with 10% down. 
Dealer participation may affect savings, lake new retail delivery flom dealer stock by 
9/23/92. See dealer for details. (2) Cash Bonus from Ford plus additional cash bonus from 
Ford Dealer Advertising or 7.9% Annual Percentage Rate financing through Ford Credit 
for qualified buyers. 48 months at $24.36 per month per $1000 financed with 10% down. 

Dealer participation may affect savings. Take new retail delivery from dealer stock. 
Limited time offer. See dealer for details. (3) Savings based on Manufacturer's Suggested 
Retail Price of Option Package vs.-ft&S.-fcP, of options purchasecUeparately. <4) Total 
servings based on cash bonus plus Option Package savings. The FDAF reserves the right 
to cancel their offer at anytime. A. X and Z plan buyers are not eligible for the FDAF offer. 

WASHTENAW COUNTY S Quality DEALER fcj FOR D 
Chelsea P A L M E R M O T O R 222 S. Main I 475-1301 

<£H> 
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(313) 475-9656 

Pork Avenue Excavating 
A Business Built on Old'Fashioned Values 

Driveways 
Basements 

DrainfieMs 
Grade Work 

Doug Welshans 
3675 S. Fletcher Rd„ Chelsea, Mich. 48118 

BUSH & HUTCHINSON, P.C 
CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS 

— •-- Bookkoeplng, Tax ConsuitlnaJPavroll _^__ 
Financial Planning, Business Start-Up 

PERSONAL - BUSINESS • CORPORATE -FARM 

MICHAEL W. BUSH, MBA, CPA 
DEBORAH J. HUTCHINSON, CPA 

8064 Main St., Daxtor 
Telephone: 426-3045 

NORMA BERNHARD, a long-time Chelsea Community Hospital Lifeline 
volunteer is honored with a plaque presented by Will Johnson, the hospital 
president. v r V ._, . / 

Lifeline Volunteers Cited 
At Hospital Workshop 

Norma Bernhard was honored at . . 

^ttsf/cld- X(mm^Sb2^ 
—^O^^nnivcrsarv ~~ 

Open House 
5u7t4ai/t$u4u$t Z^ 

6 
enmngton LPGAS 
'Count on us to keep the heat on!" 

13400 M-52 
PvO. Box 4 9 ^ - - -
Stockbridge, Ml 49285 
(517)851-7577 
Toll Free 1-800 274-5599 

REPUBLICAN 

STANOWSKI *>.'<. 
s * . 

\A 
PROSECUTING ATTORNEY 

the annual Lifeline Volunteer 
Workshop-Luncheon held recently at 
Chelsea Community Hospital. Norma 
has been working with the Lifeline 
Program since 1985. She has con­
tributed countless hours of service as 
a volunteer test caller for the pro­
gram. Willard Johnson, president of 
Chelsea Hospital and Chuck Hamill, 
regional Lifeline representative were 
presenters at the workshop. 

The hospital continues to offer the 
Lifeline service to residents of Dex­
ter, Chelsea, Manchester, and the 

there are 13 Lifeline units installed in 
Dexter. These personal response 
systems are used in the event of a 
medical emergency in which the 
subscriber is unable to reach a 
telephone. The "help needed" signal 
is received at the Chelsea Community 
Hospital Emergency Room. If the 
Emergency Room personnel are 
unable to contact the subscriber by 
phone, a responder is sent to the 
home. 

The Lifeline program is managed 
through the Hospital's Social Work 
Department with the assistance of 10 
volunteers. 

For more information about 
Lifeline, please contact Andrea Tup-
per BSW or Phyllis Meranuck MPH at 
475-3952. 

$lu*tc for s^uore^daTicincj 
and lOana'Tia -~~ 

OdwcCctcbmtc with us J 

SSSl^oL^dxac. 

Refreshments 

Nearsighfed? 
RK can change the way you see. 

Radial Keratotomy (RK) may be your answer for better vision...allowing you to 
becomelessdependentonyourglassesorcontactlenses.RKisaprecisexniaosurgipal 
procedure to correct nearsightedness and astigmatism. With the latest technology 
<aird state oTtfirarTequipment/LTr. sensoli performs RK as an in office procedure. 

WANT TO LEARN MORE ABOUT RK7 
Come to our free seminar on August 6th or Aug 17th at 6:30 p.m. 

CALL FOR A RESERVATION NOW! 

ANTHONYM. SENSOLI,MP. 
EYE PHYSICIAN & SURGEON 

Middle Square Professional Building 
134 W. Middle Street / Chelsea, Michigan 48118 

313/475-5970 

COME TO OUR FREE SEMINAR AND SCREENING 
TO FINO OUT IF YOU ARE A CANDIDATE. 

'-i&v 
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IfnDT ( A i m JOf «- > 
"I would like to . . . express my sincere oppreeiation for the effort of Mr, 

John Stonowski In preparing for-the trial of . . . o 'White Collar' crime. 
"(It) took considerable skill (to portray this complex matter) to a jury so 

| "as not to confuse them. We believe John Stanowski's command of the facts and 
'his presentation of them were instrumental in the finot-verdict. 'Mr,-Stanowskiha»done ĉommenddbiijob-foLjustice, and weJeeLfor-.. 
tunate to have worked with him; he is a credit to your organization." 

William R. Slagenwhite 
Director of Materials 
Northern Telecom Systems Corp. 

REPUBLICAN 

COME TRY 
AIID MIME El C 

it We'll Give the BEST DEALSI" 
C M AUCTION CARS 

1993 OLDS OELTA ROYAL 
4-dr. 11,200 mllas $16,900 

1992 OlDS DELTA 88 L.S. 
12,300 m i l * * . . . . . . $17,900 

1992 BUICK LeSABRE ' 
4-dr. 6,200 m1lM...V $17,900 

1992 OlDS TORANADO 
9,900 mile* $19,900 

1992 OLDS QERA 4-dr. 
3,200 mllef. 

1992 OLDS BRAVADA 
4x4.5,000miles.. 

1992 BUICK CENTURY 
4-dr. 11,000 miles. 

1992 BUICK SKYLARK 4-dr. 

1992 BUICK CENTURY :.. — 
4 dr. 10,000 mi 1« $12,900 

1992 CHEV BERETTA OT 
8,600 miles., $12,900 

1992 CHEV. LUMINA 4-dr. 
11,000 miles , . . ' . . . .$12,900 

1992 OlDS 98 4-dr. 
7,800 fflllM $19,900 

~6,3001flllii; 

$13,900 

7$T9,Wr 

$13,900 

rsrsmr 
1992 CHEV ASTRO VAN 

4x4, 10,000miles. ' $19,900 

1991 CHEV CAVALIER 
STATION WAGON 

8,000 miles .$9,995 

1991 CADILLAC DeVILLE 4-dr. 
<-_LO,600_milM , $22,900 

QUALITY USED CARS & TRUCKS 
1990 CHEVROLET S-10 BLAZERS 11,900 

$9,995 
1990 BUICK LeSAME 
• 4 -d r . . . ' 

1988 PLYMOUTH SUNDANCE 
' 2-dr. . . . . . . . . .$4,495 

1988 MERCURY TOPAZ 
4-dr.. $2,995 

1988 CHIV CAVALIER $5,295 

1986 PONTIAC GRAND AM 
4-dr .., 

1986 CHRYSLER NEW YORKER 
Sharp — 

1986 CHEV NOVA 
/Tdr ..; 

1986 PONTIAC 6000 STE 
4-dr 

'X'WX'XwsjXvK'iy*', ..v.v»v.v.v.v.v.v.v.*.v.v. 
-V.,.V*V*W?.W<»SM»K'V'Y'V -:-:--,--:-:-:-:-:-:--,:-:-:--- -,:w, 

.••:fo>:s,::y:̂ Kv.-;y -̂:W::'"'̂ ,i': :.;«•.'.:«:<••••'••••« 

1932 'This Year, 
We, The Wacker Family 

--,-,:.:^-: 

m 

1992 
look forward to celebrating 

Our BOth Year in business with you 

: • : • : • > 

W 
-*•¥•-

;ft- -M 

First Row; left to right: Mike & Kim Wacker Mahrle holding Alexandra, Elfrieda Wacker, Courtney and Nicholas Henry. 

Second Row: George & Lois Wacker, Tim & Lauren Wacker 

• * * * 

::: f S 
.v.\ ^ 

1988 CHEVY CAPRICE 
4-dr ..$7,495 

1988 CHEV CELEBRITY 
4-dr. Was $4,995 $3,995 

1988 FOR0 CONVERSION VAN 
-Turtle top., $9,995 

1987 CHEV CAVALIER R.S. 
• 2-drv W « $4,495;.. rr ; - .~ .$3,495 

1985 OLDSMOBILE 88 ROYALE 

1985 S-10 BLAZER 
With plow 

1985 DODGE PICK-UP 
V».ton. 4x4 

1985 FORD TEMPO 

1982. BUICK CENTURY 
AM, 

1987 FORD CONVERSION VAN 

1986 OLDS TORONADO 
2-dr 

• $8,995 

$5,995 

1982 CHEVROLET CAVALIER. 

1981 PLYMOUTH HORIZON 
2-dr, 

$2,995 

. $5,495 

$2,995 

$5,495 

$3,995 

$3,995 

$3,795 

$2,995 

$i;995 

$1,295 

..$495 

"Whir, the OUAlirr Vtd Cars Art found" 

FAHT-MORROW 
1500 $. MAIN ST. 
CHELSIA 

4 i « * « # # * OPINtmStOOPM 
4 7 5 - 8 6 6 3 M O N*™u a s 

OPfN SAT *-3 

1932 1957 I960 02 

| | We currently service most of Washtenaw County and the edges of surrounding counties with retail and wholesale accounts. | | 
| | We supply our customers with Gas & Distillates: Propane, Motor Oils, Greases, Tanks, Hoses, Nozzles, Lawn & Maintenance | | 
!§j Equipment & Parts, Tires, Tire Repair & Furnace Parts. In our Convenience/General Store we sell Groceries, Household items, | | 
| | Beer, Wine and Package Liquor. 
'•*•'•*• 'X*»*» 

§ You're invited to visit us, and view our photo-history § 
display at The Chelsea Community Fair August 2 4th-29th! 
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Most VCRs Repa i red 
In 1-2 Days 

SPECIAL 
VCR CLEANING 

Now iust $14.95 

VILLAOI VCR 
& ILICTRONICS 

920 S. MAIN , CHILSEA 479-7030' 

Stye QUXZIBZU g>tunbatb 
Section 2 Chelsea, Michigan. Wednesday, July 29,1992 

TEUVISIONS 
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Now Open Later!; 
Tues.-Sat.: noon* 10 p.m." 

Sunday noon-8 p.m. I 
Closed Monday 5 

Featuring: m 
A "Galaxy" of gourmet flavors!!, J 

* Hand-dipped cones - Sundaes • Floats •• 
'•-- JI Frenzies - Shakes • Splits \ 

• ICE^CHCAM * Frozen Yogurt with endless toppings!! • 
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • » • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • " 

CHELSEA HIGH SCHOOL CLASS OF 1982 held its 10th reunion at the Doll 
Farm in Sylvan township on Saturday, July 24. Of the 188 members of the class. 
66 are in the photo. In front, from left, are Jeff Klink, Jeff Shepherd, Sandra 
Shulze-Shepherd, Doris (Erke) Zink, Dawn Moore Alexander, Carla Pfltzen-
maier, Kim Byers-Mawortn, itaci (Fletcher) Young, Beth Heller, Shelly 

i\-* 

al 
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CHELSEA FARMERS1 

MARKET 
Free drawing at 12:30 for Market items 

Preview the PRIZES in the window at 

to^.fi&satfm WATTS ^mmxsm&sj^^ 
Saturday, August 1st - 8 am to I pm 

Municipal parking lot of f Park Street 

New .Vendors always welcome!!! 

*<L< >X. *±. >:' > ^ ^ >,L> >X^ >^* > ^ ' 
"̂ Pv >̂ Rv ^^v >^R '̂ p*^ -̂ 5¾ *^P* /^P\, ^^P* 

(Weber) Gates, Ann Eisele-Riemenschneider, Lauri (Cobb) Harwood, Tom 
Vandervoort; retry Lucas, and John Preston, in the second row, from left, are 
Richard Gaul, Doug Henson, Janine Hoffman-Hartman, Bob McKenzie, Steve 
Snyder, Dave Mason, Jennifer Classon, Dina Olson-Saarinen, Alan Hale, Nan­
cy Hastings Pagliarini, Bruce Centofanti, Dave Lange, Jeff Cox, Herb Pear-

Boy Apprehended 
After Taking 
Handgun to School 

A 15-year-old Chelsea boy was ap­
prehended by police last week after he 
took a handgun to Chelsea High school 
and tried to sell it. 

According to Chelsea police, the boy 
and a friend stole three handguns 
from a house on Garvey Rd. and a ri­
fle from another Garvey Rd. house. 

On Tuesday, July 21 the 15-year-old 
took a 38-caliber, semi-automatic 
handgun to the school and tried to sell 
it to another boy for $100. He also ap­
parently showed it to several of his 

| friends because police had~~six~ 
witnesses. 

After police were notified of the in­
cident by school authorities, they im-

| mediately began searching the village 
and surrounding area. They found the 
boy riding in the back of a pick-up 
truck on Garvey Rd, After a traffic 
stop they discovered the truck belong­
ed to an Anrr Arbor policemarrwtRr 
had apprehended the boy. 

Police said handcuffs and candy 
were also stolen from the .homes. 

~X5/veo ~~ 
Gift Subscription to 

The Chelsea Standard! 

son, Allison Koepp Harris, Tim Whitehall, Rick Eder, Ken Roskowski, and 
Craig Wirtz. In the third row, from left, are Geoff Shaw, Chuck Elkms, Leon 
Walworth, Steve Grau, Jim Heaton, Cathy Boomus, Sharon Uebeck, Lynne 
Ertel. Mary Anderson, Kgthy •WglHyim, T^nn* (TViiy) Rahkp, Davft Harrison, 
Tim Pennington, Karla Troutman, Bethel Snyder, and Rob Benedict. In back, 
from left, are Cheryl Hankerd, Lisa Vandegrift DeDona, Maggy^woet, Daren 
Pierson, Pam Spayd, Doug Burchett, Laura Ratzlaif, David Cooley, Monica 
(VanderWaard) Men*Renee (Satterthwaite) Dault, Connie Dault Haley, Jeff 
Hager, Jim Herter, Howard Whitaker, and Karen (Kiel) Burchett. 
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New car prices leave you cold? 
Warm up to our late model 

used car and light truck 

CHELSEA D & C STORE completed its golng-out-of-
iroslnessirale last week and someone put one of the store's 
Halloween decorations, a black R.LP headstone, in the 

window. The store is one of about 10 stores in the chain 
that are being closed. Unconfirmedn'uihors have-an 
established downtown store moving into the building. 

If it's a better car or light truck you're seeking 
for your driveway, we have a financing pro­
gram that you'll warm up to. It's known simply 
as our, "Late model used car and light truck 
financing program." 

Whether you trade up or buy outright, we 
have the funds and the financing program 
that will be tailored to your needs. Try us, 
you'll see. 
We're the financing folks that are easy to talk 
to. 

SIDEWALK 
« 

KSTIVAL 
FRI. JULY 31 SAT. AUG. 1 

8:30 am.-8:30 pjn. 8:30 ajn.-5:00 pjn. 

ON THE STREET IN THE STORE 

CHILDREN'S, LADIES and MEN'S WEAR 

V0GEI/S& 
FOSTER'S 

DOWNTOWN CHELSEA 475-1606 
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Let's Go 
Bulldogs! m& 

h 
\i 

i 

Chelsea Summer Baseball Team 
Ends Season With Win, Loss 

Chelsea summer baseball team 
finished their season last week with 
their third straight win over B.T. Ex­
press, 11-6, and a KM loss to Ross Col-
lision in the final game. 

On Monday. July 20 Chelsea hosted 
B.T. Exptm 
out to a 2-0 lead in the first inning. 

The Bulldogs picked up a run in the 
bottom of the first. Chris Dunham led 
off with a single, stole second and 
third, and crossed the plate on a wild 
pitch. 

five hits and four walks and struck out 
two. 

"Colby did a good job," Marshall 
said. 

The Bulldogs closed out their season 
against the league champions and lost 

the guests jumped their 15th game of the season. 
Chelsea sent 10 batters to the plate 

in the third inning to score the first 
four runs of the game on four singles, 
two walks, and two errors. 

Ross Collision crept to within one as 
they came up with three runs in the 

Chelsea took the lead for good in the fourth, then tied the score at four with 
second inning as they scored four a single run in the fifth, 
times, featuring a double by Gary 
White. The Bulldogs added one in the Athletic Boosters 
third, then another in the fourth on —• n *m * • — 
doubles by Tim Wescott and Steve rlans Rattle tor 
Grau. JJ J 

Two walks, three hits, and a couple 
of Bulldog'errors turned into a six-run 
sixth inning for Ross Collision. 

Chelsea put a couple of runners on 
in the seventh inning but couldn't ral­
ly. 

The Bulldogs had six hits, all 
singles, by Dunham, Wescott, Grau, 
Schiller, Powell, and Skelton. 

Chris White pitched the entire game 
for Chelsea, giving up eight hits and 
six walks. He also struck out five. 

Chelsea placed fifth in the league 
with a 10-15 record. 

Women's Softball 
League-

B.T. Express pulled to within 7-4 in A UtOgraphed Ball 
the fifth inning, but Chelsea goHhesr—Chelsea Athletic Boosters is raffling 
runs back in the bottom of the inning 
as Dunham drove in Matt Powell and 
NickMcCalla. 

Chelsea scored their final two runs 
uV4jhe sixth inning as White doubled 
and Grau smacked a two-run homer 
over the left field fence. 

Grau had the hot bat for Chelsea 
with four hits, including the homer 
and two doubles. White had a pair of 

off a 1990 Detroit Pistons World 
Championship Autographed Basket­
ball. 

Tickets are available from high 
school wrestling coaches and parents 
of team members. 

The drawing will be held on Friday, 
Oct. 16 at the Chelsea-Tecumseh foot­
ball game. 

Proceeds will benefit Chelsea High tsxtJSSSLriJss^ ***** »•*« '*••"• 

_ _ Standings as of July 2 
W L 

Vanston-O'Brian_ 10 I 
BookCrafters ...10 2 
Geary's Pub .8 3 
Palmer Ford-Mercury.;.. 8 3 
Big Boy ...6 5 
Chelsea Pharmacy. 4 6 
Chelsea State Bank. > 2 9 
Common Grill 1 9 
Chelsea Hospital 0 10 

tv-ncws^f^m. 
. /.' H.-'*nw-> .*tv.#**"i,*,s 
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METS of the Pee Wee Reese baseball league in the 
Chelsea Recreation Department are pictured above. In 
front, from left, are Bobby Armstrong, Nate Cooper, 
Adam Morse, Danny Schnaidt, and Bobby Cooper. In 

back, from left, are Chris Herter, Mike Fischer, Matt 
Adams, Scott Vlchlnsky, Josh Powers, and Justin Klvl. 
Not pictured are Josh Bragalone, Nathan Clark, and 
coach Bruce Herter. 

had a pair of singles, Wescott doubled, 
and Ken Slane, Casey Schiller, Jason 
McVittie, and Nick McCalla each 
singled, 

"We hit the ball well and some of 
our outs were well-hit balls," said 
Chelsea coach Akel Marshall. 

Colby Skelton recorded the 
complete-game victory. He gave up 

Give a 
Gift Subscription to 

The Chelsea Standard I 

APOLOGY 

fe Support 
Chelsea Athletic Boosters 

and win an official 
•̂•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••i 

NBA 1990 Detroit Pistons 
World Championship Autographed Basketball 

RAFFLE TICKETS on sale banning July 27 

^^^m^j^^^^^ 
t l each or 6 / 1 * 

The winning ticket will be drawn on 10-)6-92 at the Chelsea-Tecumseh football 
game. A fundraiser for C.H.S. Wrestling Team. 

fJTittSTilS 
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REPUBLICAN 

STANOWSKI 

and Village of Chelsea Recreation Oept. 
I was a coach for Sandy Koufax Team No. 2—o very 

zealous coach as you all know. Tuesday, July 21, I was very 
unsportsman-like and argued with the umpire after the game. 
I immediately resigned because of my poor example. I also 
called and apologized to the young umpire (who does a fine 
job) and his mother. I have written personal apology notes to 
every boy on my team explaining that I would nBvr like to 
see them follow my example in this. I love each of these fine 
young men. I also wish to apologize to the town and recrea* 
tion baseball for my wrongful actions. I have the utmost 
respect for Rainey Bassimer—his (ob is not easy—the rulings 
were not his or the ump's fault. My reaction was beyond adult 
behavior or good sportman play. I will not justify—for there is 
none-—only ask the forgiveness of all involved. 

Thank you, 
RICHARD HOWARD 

P. S. I am not interested in controversy or further pain h) this ̂  
issue. I'm proud of my boys—keep if up. ' * 

Standard* Want Ads Get Quick Results! 

^ vfT, ' )" 

PROSKUIMG ATTORNEY 
nMv Unas Soy • • • 

JOB* W. tTMOWtll 
•wpf irtsf AffsflMy 

"Effective April 28, 1980, you are assigned full time to the Probote Court 
Division. 

" . . . My assignment of you to this division is bosed upon my personal 
opinion of your competency In the criminal low and your professionalism in the 
way that you have represented the Prosecuting Attorney's Office during the 
years you have been with this office." 

William F. Delhey 
• _ _ _ _ ^ _ Prosecuting Attorney 

REPUBLICAN 

MIKE TERPSTRA of Chelsea will play for the West in this Saturday's 
Michigan High School Football Coaches Association All-Star Football Game In 
East Lansing. 

Terpstra To Play 
t All-Star Football 

Game on Saturday 
3 20½ W. Middle St 
Chelsea, MI 48118 

HlSttftl m n 
4 PITMIM CIMTII 

INC. 475-1900 
TOTAL TRAINING FACILITY 

Recent Chelsea High school 
graduate Mike Terpstra will play in 
the 1992 Michigan High-School East-
West All-Star Football Game this 
Saturday, Aug. 1 at Michigan State 
University. 

Terpstra, 6' 3", 281 pounds, is a 
member of the West Team and will 
play in the defensive line. He^wilfyrfn 
Saline defensive back Jeff Comfort as 
the two representatives of the 
Southeastern Conference. Saline 
coach Jack Crabtfee is an assistant 
coach for the game. 

Each team consists of 44 players, 
and each player is froryi a Aitfnn^ 

Players are chosen by a committee 
of all-star game coaches, members of 
the board of directors of the Michigan 
High School Football Coaches 
Association,-and members of the all-
star committee. 

Each player receives his game 
jersey, a set of all-star shorts and 
t'Shirt, an equipment duffle bag, an 
all-star cap, and a programr-The 
players are not paid and they do not 
receive free tickets or remuneration 
for travel costs. 

The game begins at 1:30 p.m. at 
Spartan Stadium. 

fWORKOUX SPECIAL! 

3 $ 

MONTHS 65 00! 
NON-CURRENT.&NEW 

MEMBERS ONLY 

"NO ADD-ON MEM BERSHI PS 
ATTH1S PRICE. 

With this couponGuod thru 8/10/92^^ J 

school. 

RoUs4n*Orie Posted 
At Hudson Mills Course 

Charlie Burton, manager of Hudson 
Mills Golf Course, reported a hole-in-
one made Sunday on the No. 8 hole by 
Butch Murdock of Petersburg. 

The 127-yard shot was made using 
an eight iron. His total score was 101. 
Murdock has been playing for five 
years and this is his first hole-in-one. 

» . 

475-1900 
* TOTAL 

^ FITNESS/ 
. % - u i i - i tr<3? 120W.MIddl*St. 

V Chelsea, Ml 
IK if 

UP 
TO 

Friday fc Saturday recelv 

25°/< ^ OFF 
Q STOREWIDE 

on such brands as: ;__ 

L\vce® V Asics 
Rhode Geo r Descente 

Brooks .^6 spprthitt 

Saucony and more! 

Don't forget to renew your 
Chelsea Standard subscription! 

HARPER PONTIAC 
"WW/IE" SALE 

118 W. Middle St. 
Downtown Chelsea 

SIDEWALK DAYS 
SPECIALS 

FRIDAY 
July 31,9-8 . _ 
SATURDAY ST\ 

August 1,9-4 

wi 

Sports Physical Days 

Chelsea Internal Medicine Consultants, PC 
II perform Sports Physical and College Physical Exams 

for $20 on 
Friday August 7, 1992 and 
Friday August 14, 1992. 

9:00AMO.1:00AM 
1:30 PM-4:00 PM 

No Appointment necessary 
Walk-Ins Welcome 

Steven A. Yarows, MD, FACP • 
Martin P. Gieespen, MD 

Karen S. Cummings, PAS 

Come to Our New, State-of-the-Art Offfce at: 
128VanBuren 
Chelsea, Michigan 48118 
(313)475-8677 

m m m 



BURGUNDY BOMBERS of the Chelsea Recreation Murphy, Michael Sharp, Danny Whltesall, and Jason 
Department's Willie Mays league have had a fine season Wilson. In back, from left, are coach Steve Lelter, Jeff 
this summer despite the poor weather. In front, from left, Rickerd, Luke Hanson, Brad Howard, Justin Lelter, Cole 
are Michael Kattula, Jared Daniel, Adam Hall, Patrick Graves, Jeremy Bacon, and coach Dan Whltesall. 

iT l PONTOON 
^ BOAT TOPS 

Roberto Clemente 
Baseball Results 

Willie Mays 
Baseball Results 

Week of July 20 
SUver Streaks 6, Team Five 6— 

Mike Vargo, Mike Radka, Matt 
Borders, and Chris Roberts led the 
Streaks at the plate. For Team Five, 
Bobby Wilson homered and scored 
three runs, and Thomas Robinson 
doubled and tripled. Daniel Steward 
played well on defense. 

• • • 
Team Five 7, Team Two 4— 

Bobby Wilson and Bradley Harper 
doubled for Team Five. Jeremy 
Baker doubled for Team Two. 

• • • 
Team Five 10, Team Six 5 -

Bobby Wilson and Travis Robinson 
turned a double play for Team Five. 
Robby Dymond doubled for Team Six. 

• • • 
earn meTpreImlSe~0^™~'" ,~"~ 
Thomas Robinson tripled for Team 

Five and Greg Kennedy doubled. 
Craig Forshee caught a hard line 
drive for Team One. 

* • * 
Silver Streaks 7, Team Two 2— 

Leading bitters for the Streaks were 
Matt Hinderer, Dan Goss, Pan 
Kanitz, Pat Jolly, Mike Radka, and 
Chris Roberts. Tony Scheffler, Matt 
Hinderer, and Mike Radka combined 
for a two-hitter and struck out 14. 
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PARISHO & COMPANY 
PiolwtwMMl CIMIKMUIHWI 

JAMtt (JAY) W. PARISHO. C.P.A. 
aariFuo puiuc ACCOUNTANT 

Two locations to «fv« you: 
1905 PaufiM.awlevard, Suite 5 107¼ South Main, P.O. Bos 25} 

Ann Arbor. Michigan 48) 03-5001 Chelsea, Michigan 48118 
313/995/5654 . 313/475-9440 

Wf SERVICE: Pertoftd - Corporate — Partnership - farms 
ACCOUNTING — TAX PSfPAftATHM ft CONSULTING - FINANCIAL PUNNING 

"^^P^WWfMeWf#i ^FV«pV^e^pnF ^PP^W^WPy VMiOJ^P^pv 4 W f ^ p * w y 

Chariot E. 

Sullivan Plumbing 
licensed Michigan Master Plumber 

• Water Heaters M — 
• Remodeling 4 7 5 * " 8 I 1 4 

-̂™«jfc-Sefvk^«VRepoir • -
• New Conslruction 
• Water Softners 
• Sewer Cleaning 

! Reasonable Rates 

Free Estimates 

Week of July 20 
114, Black Tigers 11- Pee Wee Reese 

CUSTOM REPLACEMENTS 

TENTS3 
AWN I NO CO. 

617 S. Ashley, V Ann Arbor * (313) 665-9126 

Paul Newbouse and Mike Mignano 
each had three hits for the Tornadoes. 
Dan Mayes, Jon Wagenschutz, and 
Ben Walton also hit well. Bobby 
Brown played good defense for the 
Tornadoes. Sam Norton homered 
twice for the Tigers and Kyle 
Schrotenboer homered and tripled. 
Danny Schlosser and John Br win 
played well on defense for the Tigers. 

Baseball Results 

White Tigers 11, Black Tigers 6 -
—William—Bredernite,— Zach 

- Week of July 20 
Twins 12, Rockies 5— 

Leading hitters for the Twins were 
Mike Schultz, Chris Petsch, Matt 
Hand, Matt Kolodica, Jason Mid-
dleton, Jake Bell, Corey Johnston, 
and Matt Freeman. Mike Schuitz 
made an unassisted double play. For 
the Rockies, Mike Holloway had an 
RBI triple. Todd Pearsall made a fine 
catch in centerfield. and Jason Mast 

RoUingHUls Waiermfk ' independence Lake Co. /¾ 
7660 Stony Creek Rd 3200Jennings. 

Ypsiland313-482-FUNN Whilmore Lake 

i l l ! ) 
* • * , w*$. Fenced 

'' • iJ (; j i > , J . J ! ^ i o n . M l , • c 

CHELSEA 

ChrLstman, and Brian Livengood all 
homered for the White Tigers. Nate 
Keiser and Alex Rendell played well 
on defense. For the Black Tigers, 
Nick Battistone, Kyle Schrotenboer, 
Sam Norton, Ross Davis, and Ben 
Daniels all played well. 

* • • 
White Tigers 9, Maroon Monsters 7— 

David Blough, Davy Graff, Derek 
Horvath, and Robby Barner all hit 
well for the White Tigers. For the 
Monsters, Ricky Castleberry, Joey 
Tripodi, Justin Bulson, Griffin 
Biedron, and Warren Bowen all hit 
well. 

Midget League 
Softball Results 

WeekalJuly 20 
Great Grays 22, Lethal Lilacs 

Cara, Long and Clasina Minneboo 
T were the leading hitters for the Grays. 

Laura Baird and Alissa Porter played 
tough defense. For the Lilacs, Allison 
Williams. Emily Rose, and Anna 

SELF STORAGE 
18000 BROW* DRIVE, CHELSEA 

HOUIIS: 
Mon. -Fr l . 11:30-5:30 

Sat. 9-3 

(313) 475-8008 
or 

1-000-250-0030 

-played well at^secondbase.—— 
• • • 

Twins 10, Wolverines 9— 
Mike Schultz and Matt Kolodica 

each had a bases-loaded triple. Jason 
Zatkovich dove to make the game-
saving play with a runner on third. 
Leading hitters for the Wolverines 
were Vince Scheffler, Steve Taroli, 
and Scott Kiel. Jamie Bauer tripled 
and Norm Menge homered. 

* • • 
Braves 9, Twins 0— 

Drew Henson pitched a perfect 
game for the Braves and hit a home 
run. Brian Jankovic, Joe Frost, and 
Dan Graff each liad two hits. 

Braves 10, Wolverines 9— 
Drew Henson and Joe Frost 

homered for the Braves. Jeff Dixon, 
Dan (BjQugh,, Grant Bollinger, and 
Dani^arT^rofchJ^-weU. For the* 
Wolverines, Jeff Dohner, Nathan 
Menge,and Phil-Wood were the 
leading hitters. 

• * • . 
Mete 15, Rockers 0— 

Arend were each 44, and Leslie Ching 
hit three line drives. 

* « * 
Great Grays 24, 
Red Hot Chili Peppers 12-

Meagan Hollo and Amy Dault led 
the Grays at the plate. Jenell Vlcek 
and Corinna Christman played well on 
defense. 

• • • 
Teal Tornadoes 28, Lethal Lilacs 7— 

Lindsay Baker, Molly Edman, 
Ashley Augustine, and Kim Lancaster 

-Bobby Armstrong was the leading 
hitter forthe Mets. 

• • • 
Mets 14, Stlckney 1— 

Nate Cooper, Josh Powers, 
Bobby Cooper played well for 
Mets, 

and 
the 

t 

Scores Hole-in-One 
At Reddeman Farms 

Ann Holmes, a Dexter resident, 
made a hole-in^n on No. 5 at the Reo> 

were^Heading-hitters-for-tt»e-Tor——deman Farms Golf Course in Chelsea 
nadoes. Emily Royce, Lindsay July 10. Holmes has been golfing for 

KARAOKE Is EASY. IT'S EXCITING. 
IT'S FOOT STOMPIN; 

HEART THUMPIN', RIB TICKIJN'FUN!" 

Powers, Kasie Whitley and Jessica 
Stlckney played well on defense. For 
the Lilacs, Bethany Kinner and 
Stephanie French hit well and Emily 
Rose turned a double play. 

20 years. 

Don't forget to renew your 
Chelsea Standard subscription! 

Then take the stage and be the star 
you'd Jove to be! 

jRegardless of yout-musical t a l e m r — 
Karaoke's sophisticated laser audio and 

video systems will help you look and 
sound your best! 

Enjoy yourself...tell your friends.^.. 
then come back again and again. 

Karaoke is always exciting and unique, 
becquse you are the staf of the show! 

S&S Pools ft Spas 
1178 S. Main St. (next to Chelsea Lanes), Chelsea 

(313)475-4355 
Open , 

Mon.-Fri. 10 to 6; Sat. 9 to 2 

SIDEWALK SALE SPECIALS 
"r""~ VPrldciyASdtaifdc^ 

July 51 st August 1st 

Fraarane* Chlorine Bromine 
9 Cartridge* Leak Packets 

Oovers Detector 
_ — - — Kris 

LIQUIDi CHLO«Nir7TT7;7.......777.7."."." 7.001. 
MANY OTHIft rflMS Up to 67% Off 

Regular in-store Special: 

BUY ONE - OCT ONE FREE 
QUARPEX k LEISURI TIME CHEMICALS 

^ ^ • ^ ^ ^ • ^ ^ ^ • ^ • ^ • ^ • ^ ^ ^ B B B ^ B ^ S B S S B ^ S S S S S 

-

ADULTS 1,¾ 

Thursdays 8 p.m.. 12:00 a.m. 
Saturdays .8 p.m.-12:30 a.m. 

FUN • FUN - FUN • FUN 
- Get your group together and 

call for table reservations 

475-8141 
at CHELSEA LANES 

:xrxrr, 

^* - .... _m - » 

* 
* _ 

^ 
* 

\. ' Jim Kenewell I 
* * 
•» * * # - * * ¥ * • * - * - # - # * * * " * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

S«1*» 
'TO***! 

Relax at 
Cleary'sPub 
ENTERTAINMENT 

Thursday-Friday-Saturday nights 
S to midnights„ 

This weak: featuring "BEAN." 

CHELSEA LANES, INC. 
1180 M-52, Chelsea 313-473-8141 

mYtiwi 

Daily Luncheon & Dinner Specials 
We offer a Full Service Bar 

NEWlBTG scREEirrr ; -• ~ 
^ Hours: Mon-Sat 11:30 AM.—12 midnight 

Sunday 12:00A.M.-9:00P.M. _ M g g 

U3 S. Main, Chelsea MnSS 
475-1922 mmSPORTS 

CONSOLIDATIO RI PORT OP CONDITION OF 

CHELSEA STATE BANK 
of Chelsea, Michigan 48118, at the close of business June 30,1992, a 
state banking institution organized and operating under the banking 
laws of this state and a member of the Federal Reserve System. 
Published in accordance with a call made by the State Banking 
Authority and by the Federal Reserve Eank of this District. 
ASSETS 

Cash and balances due from depository institutions: 
a. Noriinterest-bearingbalances and currency and coin. $ 4,384,000.00 
b. Interest-bearing balances. 2,000,000.00 

"Securities; 54,902,000.00 
~Federarfunas"sold and se^uritiespurchased ~ 

under agreements to resell. 18,000,000.00 
Loans and lease financing receivables: 

a. Loans and leases, net of unearned 
Income .$53,398,000.00 

, b. LESSi Allowance for loan and 
lease losses 1,038,000.00 " 

c. Loans and leases, net of unearned income, 
allowance, and reserve 52,358,000.00 

Premises and fixed assets 679,000.00 
Other real estate owned 9,000,00 
Other assets ^>6lbW°M 

TOTAL ASSETS f. 1134/)07.000.00 
LIABILITIES 

Deposits: 
' a. In domestic offices $115,246,000.00, 

(1) Noninterest-bearing ....: $ 10,468,000.00 
(2) Interest-bearing....-.. , 104,778,000.00 

Demand notes issued to the U. S. Treasury 867,000.00 
Other liabilities 569,000.00 
Total liabilities • • • 116,682,000.00 

EQUITY CAPITAL 
Commonstock .... .... .. . 3,200,000.00 
Surplus 4,000,000.00 
UnWdeWf ofitsima rapim 
Total equity capital 17,325,000.00 

TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL... .$134,007,000.00 
Memoranda • Deposits of State Money * Michigan 35,000.00 

I, Paul G. Schaible, Jr., President of the above+named bank do 
hereby declare that this Report of Condition has been prepared in con­
formance with the instructions issued by the Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System and the State Banking Authority and Is true 
to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

PAULG.SCHAIBLETJR. 
We, the undersigned directors, attest the correctness of this 

Report of Condition and declare that it has been examined by us and to 
the best of our knowledge and belief has been prepared in conform­
ance with the instructions issued by the Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System and the State Banking Authority and is true 
and correct. . 

Robert L. Daniels 
John W. Merkel 
Lawrence C. Dietle 

Directors 

_&. 
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i Air Conditioning/Heating 

Marzec Mechanical 
Heating & 

* Air Conditioning 

totoZed Energy Management 

Sales & Service • Residential & Commercial 

475-3166 CHELSEA 

REPUBLICAN 

STANOWSKI • t v * izsami 

m 
FOR 

til 

U ^ ^ ^ AgL^^m t^mm 

tiror vmn Joy 
JOHN W. SHNONMI 
tfhr Trill »n»mi 

"We wish to extend our thorites for the time that John Stonowski spent on 
January 6 with the. members of the Fire Investigation Bureau . . . His explana­
tion of the Tyler-Tompkins and Miranda rulings was very clear, precise and 
beneficial. 

•"It's this type of co-operation and assistance from your office that will 
make the Fire Investigation Bureau prosper and continue to function in on effi­
cient manner." C.J'.M. Anderson, Chairman 

REPUBLICAN 

Elec t Renee Vintzel LORIDAS 
f o r y a i i r Jitdtjc. C o u r t o f A p p e a l s 

first District (includes: Uvingston, Jackson, Lenawee, 
Monroe, Washtenaw and Wayne Counties). 

^Livingston County resident. ^ 
Only candidcrte living outside Wayne County. 
Lawyer .„ Appeals /Trial practice^} l years. 
Counselor / Educator... 10 years. 
Parent,., Married. 5 children. 

'AH other candidates and all present sitting 
judges are Wayne County residents. 

Paid for by "CommiOM te Blea Rsnes Vimxel Lorldai 
to Court of AppMll," P.O. Boi 40M Dbn, MI 4« 12« 

"Paid political advertitemcru" 

"As Judge, I will apply the 
law, not make the law." 

\ < > i i \ i n . i 
,v i< I i x \ rs 

CONSTRUCTION 
& MECHANICAL 
SERVICES, INC^ 

SERVICES HE OFFER r 
MECHANICAL 
• PLUMBING 
• HEATING 
• COOLING 
• ELECTRICAL 
• CARPENTRY 

CONSTRUCTION 
• NEW HOMES 
• ADDITIONS 

*» DECKS 
• PORCHES 
• MASONRY 

FREE In-Home 

: . 475-0420 
Licensed & insured 

1992 Summer Fuel Oil Sale 

JASON M. PLACINTO, Navy 
Seaman Recruit, son of Ralph E. and 
Diane C. Placlnto of 171 Knollwood, 
Pinckney, recently completed basic 
training at Recruit Training Com-
mand, Great Lakes, HI. During the cy­
cle, recruits are taught general 
military subjects designed to prepare 
them for further academic and on-the-
job training in one of the Navy's 85 oc­
cupational fields. He is a 1990 
graduate of Pinckney High school 

McKune Mystery 
Book Club Plans 
Two Meetings 

McKune Memorial Library 
Mystery Book Club will hold their 
third and fourth meetings on Thurs­
day, Aug. 16, and Sept. 17, at 7 p.m. at 
the Library. 

The club, whose membership has 
grown to over a dozen members, will 
discuss the novels of award winning 
author John Barnard at their August 
meeting. The McKune mystery collec­
tion has a large number of Barnard 
mysteries, including Death and the 
Chaste Apprentice, Death & the 
Princess and Political Suicide. 

The mystery—writer featured in 
September will be Arthur W. Upfield. 
Upfield, an Englishman who lived in 
Australia all of his adult life, created 
the popular detective Inspector 
Napoleon Bonaparte. Bonaparte in­
vestigates crimes across the 
Australian landscapes. The McKune 
collection does not have any 
mysteries by Upfield so patrons who 
want to prepare for the September 
meeting can order Upfield mysteries, 
such as Death of a Swagman, Man of 
Two Tribes, Murder Down Under and 
The Sands of Windee, through the 
Library's inter-library loan service. 

The Mystery Book club, sponsored 
by the Friends of McKune Memorial 
Library, is*ree and open to the public. 
Visitors also are welcome. An alter­
nate accessible meeting space can be 
arranged. For further information 
call the library at 47WW82. \ ^ "' 

i o r s M a y R e q u e s t — 

D e f e r m e n t o n P r o p e r t y 

T a x e s U n t i l A p r i l ? 9 3 
Terry Drent, program developer for 

the Housing Bureau for Seniors, has 
issued a reminder that senior citizens 
can postpone payment of 1992 sum­
mer and winter property taxes until 
April 1993. To do so, seniors must file 
a deferment form with their local 
treasurer's office. The Bureau can 
help seniors fill out the forms and file 
them before the deadline. 

Workshops on Property Tax 
Management and volunteer recruit­
ment also are being planned by the 
Housing Bureau for Seniors. 

.__ For more information or to register 
as a volunteer, call the Housing 
Bureau for Seniors at 763-0970. 

The first large-scale strike for a 
10-hour day was by 600 Boston 
journeymen carpenters in 1825, accor­
ding to "Labor Firsts in America," a 
U.S. Labor Department publication. 

150 Gallon Minimum Delivery 

Cash or Check at Time of 
Delivery 

971-7230 
434-0660 

Serving Washtenaw County Area Since1933 

WASHTENAW 
FARMERS 

Call the Office to arrange for a 
delivery, and take advantage of 
these low prices. 

Also, be sure to ask about our 
Furnace Cleaning Special. 

OIL COMPANY! 

X / O T E N O N - P A R T I S A N A U G U S T - O ^ T M 

% / / V T A • 1V fc iJ<< VODB ior 
enence 

"Jerry Farmer will make a worthy and 
distinguished Washtenaw County Circuit 
Court Judge. I urge you to vote for Jerry in 

e primary election on August 4th." 

William F. Delhey 
Washtenaw County Prosecutor 

Jerry Farmer has the experience to 
make an outstanding Circuit Court Judge. 

3 degrees from the University of Michigan 
27 years courtroom experience 
19 years Chief Assistant Prosecuting Attorney 

JEROME v ^ jCjisujiyiCj 

EARMER 
FOR CIRCUIT JUDGE 

Paid for by Jerome Farmer for Circuit Judge, Norman Herbert. Treasurer, 1441 Ardmoor, Ann Arbor, Ml 48103 

tmwm* 5A5»WS«»»W 

REPUBLICAN 

To My Fellow.Republican Voters: 

It is our responsibility to elect a Prose­
cuting Attorney, who can carry on in the style 
of Wtittam^Oelhey, who retires ttUe-yeag-f 
office. As a first step, you and I must vote in 
the August 4th Primary for Delhey's Chief Trial 
Attorney of the past SO years, Lynwood Noah. 

Since 1969, Lyn Noah has beenguided by 
Delhey's positive direction and his law and . 
order tradition. Not only has Delhey encour­
aged Noah to seek the Prosecutor's Office, but 
four previous Washtenaw County Prosecutors 
have given Noah their endorsements to run. 

-These Include George Meaderr-Douglas Reading, 
Bdmond DeVine and Willian Barense. 

. Lynwood Noah's campaign has also been 
recognized and supported by David Faritera, the 
Washtenaw County Republican Party Chair. 

I need your help, though, if we're to have a 
winning ticket in the Fall. You and I must go 
to the polls on Tuesday, August 4th and -east*" 
our votes for Lynwood Noah in the Republican 
Primary. 

That action is the most effective way to 
have real impact on making sure Lynwood 
Noah, is Washtenaw County's next Proseouting 
Attorney, 

James Drolctt 
Peter B. Fletcher 
t. Suzanne Glkas 
Paul Gikas, M,D. 
Joe K. Hall 
Fannie Hamilton 
Robert M. Harrison. 
DougHarwy 

J t a u l e y — — 

Howard S. Holmes 

FREE DELIVERY 
475-1130 

HOURS: 
Mon.-FH.. 10-5 

} st & 3rd Sat. of Month. 9-3 

Paid for by the Committee to Eled Noah Prosecutor 
800 Sunrise Court, Ann Arbor. Michigan 48103 
Larry Hahn Treasurer 

Robert L. Henry. Jr. 
John Holland 
Allan W. Houghton 
(jinnyjohansen 
AbeA. Karam 
Mary I,. Kerkhoff 
John P. Keusch 
ClydeKing 
Donna K. Lane 
WHfrcdCLane.O.VM. 
Jack Lousma 
Paul Mann 
toorgc Meader 
Jack Merkel 

' Pat Merke! 
Tom Mlnlck 
Herman Neuman 
Mary Lynn Noah 
Russell 1.. Ogden 
(*orgc Pappas 
L, Brooks Patterson 
Robert Pifcr 
Mrs. Marcus Plant 
Donald A. Raney 
Douglas K. Reading 
Rev, S. L. Roberson 
Man Such, D.D.S. 
Raymond*. WaRgoner. M.D. 
JackWeidenbach 
Kevin Williams 
Chester Wilson 
Jackie Wright 
Man/Ann Zlmmer 



Host Families 
Sought for 
Exchange Program 

Could your family use a hit of 
cultural diversity? American Inter-
cultural Student Exchange is seeking 
American families who are interested 
in hosting a foreign exchange student 
in their home for the 1992-93 school 
year. Students ages 15 through 18, 
have their own spending money and 
medical insurance. Host families pro­
vide room, board and a warm family 
environment 

Families may request a student 
from more than 20 countries in 
Europe, Asia, South America and 
Australia. All exchange students are 
in excellent health, are fluent in 
English and have met the academic 
standards set forth by A.LS.E. 
. Call 14004IBUNG for further in­
formation. 
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CYNTHIA BLACKLAW BEAUCHAMP 

4x 
^ . ^ : . ^ - ^ ¾ ¾ ¾ 

, ' " * > 
?>!««£•* 

Give a • 
Giff Subscription to 

The Chelsea Standard! 

• EMPLOYMENT cV LABOR LAW 
• WILLS, TRUSTS & ESTATES 
• REAL ESTATE CLOSINGS 
• DOMESTIC LAW 

105 E. Middle St. 
Chelsea, Ml 48118 

EVENING AND SATURDAY APPOINTMENTS AVAILABLE 

JIM GAKEN of Chelsea had his 1949 International fire noon. Hie truck was put into service for the Chelsea Fire 
track on display at the Antique Car and Vehicle Show at Department in 1950 and went out of service in 1985. 
the Chelsea Retirement Community last Sunday after-

Junior Miss 
Softball Results 

WISD Elects Officers, 
: WWRolJUlyM : 

Gladiators 20, Blue Bombers 18— 
Shontay Young was 3-5 with five 

RBI, Cindy Richard was 44 with four 
RBI, and Hilarie Szczygiel was 4-4 for 
the Gladiators. The Gladiators rallied 
from an 18-12 deficit in the bottom of 
the sixth inning. Shontay Young's 
bases-loaded single won the game. 
For the Bombers, McKenna Houle 
and Suzy Steele each had two hits and 
scored two runs. Meghan Holefka 
made two consecutive put-outs at sec­
ond base to hold the Gladiators 
scoreless in the fourth inning. 

~SeiB~Ncw Meeting Times 
Washtenaw Intermediate School 

District's Board of Education has 
unanimously elected Tanya Israel, 
president for 199243. Israel, an Ann 
Arbor resident, is also vice-president 
of the Arm Arbor Public Schools 
Board of Education. Israel has served 
15 years on WISD's board. 

Clarence Lyte was unanimously re­
elected the board's vice-president. 
This is Lyte's 13th year on the board. 
He also serves on the Willow Run 
Board of Education. :— 

ai.<ii.«Ara vt Ri.,k A „ M K « « ii Diane G^ ' Anne Comeau, and 
^ t t S i ^ l ^ ^ t l rtri Warren McLean are the board's 
^ ^ V J T L A ^ l ^ tional therapist who lives in Saline. 

Comeau, a Chelsea resident, also 
double, and Stacy Melton had a single 
and scored three runs. For the 
Amoebas, Beth Wagenschutz had two 
singles and scored a run, and Erin 
Dougherty and Heather Kemnitz each 
scored two runs. 

Blues Sisters 27, Purple Posse 4— 
Rianne Jones scored four runs for 

the Sisters. SheUey Williams did a 
good Job catching and Malia Mon-

serves as president of the Chelsea 
Board of Education and is a school 
executive search consultant. McLean 
is an Ann Arbor resident and the 
broker/owner of the real estate firm 
McLean & Associates. 

At its July organizational meeting, 
the board also voted to shift the start 
of its meetings by one-half hour. The 

* J o J u ii i «J „~ A WISD board will now meet at 5 p.m. 
tange and Candace Hall played good ( inatead of 4:30 p m ) on m e ^ ^ 
defense. For the Posse. Miranda Har- Tuesday of each month and at 7 p.m. 
ris was the leading hitter and Char ( l n 8 t e a d of 7:30 p.m.) on the fourth 
Tassinari played good defense. Tuesday of each month. 
Mint Juleps" 21, Tornadoes 20— 

U a j U n i . h i t t e r » ^ ^ 4 u ^ P % w ^ ; ^ | ; 
MfluW Bycraft and Katie Morse, 
who were each 3-3. Jennifer Woods 
and Amanda McConeghy led the Tor­
nadoes at the plate, and Lindsay 
Williams played well on defense. 

TANYA ISRAEL 

Tell Them 
You Reod It 

In 
THE STANDARD 

Blues Sisters 21, Blue Moons 11— 
Rianne Jones and Stepanie Wynn 

each scored four times for the Sisters. 
Shelly Williams and Ingrid Biedron 
played good defense. Amanda Taran-
towski was on base three times for the 
Moons. Leah Thompson scored twice. 

• • * 

Watchamacallits 9, Purple Posse 8— 
Melissa Molina, Jennifer Buss, 

Alicia Vogel, and Chrissy Vargo were 
the leading hitters for the Wat-
chamacallits. Stacy Bergman and 
Alicia Vogel played well on defense. 
For the Posse, Kelly Kentala, Katrina 
Reyeer Sarah—Pruess,and Iaura 
Koengeter hit well. 

• V J ; - ^ 

Over 19 Years of Satisfied Customers 

DON POPPENGER 
Used Car Sales 

ALMER MOTOR SALES 

475-1800 
475-3650 

See Don for Your Next New or Used, Car or Truck. 
You'll be happy you did!. 

, 

ElMt 

GEORGE 
MERKEL 

Republican Candidate 

Michigan 
House of Representatives 

District 52 

Lifetime District Resident-
George is Xftuc neighbor and 
friend. You may know his 
wife, Nancy, their seven 
adult children and their 
families. 

Small Business Owner-
George has owned a variety 
of service oriented and 
consumer focused businesses. 
George's only boss now and 
when elected is vou. 

Experienced Public Servant 
8 years as Sylvan Township 
Trustee 

8 years as Washtenaw County 
Commissioner 

George Merkel—characterized by local press as the honest 
candidate. 

George Merkel—with a reputation as an unpretentious politician 
whose instincts are rooted in a concern for working people, small 
business owners and farmers. 

George Merkel—approaches this, challenge with an open mind and no 
hidden agendas. He will be your ears and eyes in Lansing. When it 
comes to the difficult vote, you can depend on Merkel to, be 
there to voice your opinions and vote your values and conscience. 

While other politicians may shift their sails to ride current 
political winds, you can TRUST George to follow a steadfast course 
based on your values. 

— RRMEMBRR TO VOTE 

ON ftUStfST-4~-AND AGAIN-INNOVEMBER-.-

VOTE 
FOR GEORGE MERKEL 

Paid for by the Couittee to Elect George k. Herkel 

Watchamacallits 20, Blues Sisters 9— 
Leigha Young doubled and singled, 

Chrissy Vargo hit two doubles and a 
single, and Alicia Vogel doubled and 
singled for the Watchamacallits. For 
the Sisters, Rianne Jones hit two 
singles and/ Ann Terpstra had three 
singles. 

CD. THERE'S No TELLING 

THE CHELSEA STANDARD welcomes 
letters to the editor (^subjects of in­
terest to our readers., Letters must be 

' legible and space limitations may die 
tate when and if a tetter will be publish-
ed; short letters are most likely to be 
chosen for publication. The use of any 

" ^material is at the discretion of the" 
editor. The editor reserves the right to 
edit or refuse letters to meet space 
requirements, clarity or to avoid 
obscenity, libel or invasion of privacy. 
All letters must bear the handwritten 
signature of the writer and include the 
address and phone number® for verlfi-
cation purposes (these, will not be 
printed). The writer's name will be 
withheld only for extraordinary reasons. 
Letters published do not necessarily 
reflect the editorial policies or beliefs of 
this newspaper. 

• attjr 
g>tanbarb 

M i l i i M t f k i i i i M M y a i a M mm 
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i\ Church 5eroces 
v-^- Sheriffs 

Assembly of God-
FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 

14800 OH US-llCbebea 
Tte Re*. N. James Maaaey, Pastor. 

Every Sunday--• 
•:tt ajn.—Anode? schooL 

10:4ft ajn.-Snnday morning worship, and 
cbfldren's service. 

•JOODJO.—Evonlng aervfce. 
ma Wednesday-

7:00 p.m.—Mkkeeek eerrtces. 

C8EUEA CHRISTIAN FELLOWSHIP 
MTWiBdaaooSt 

Wm. Mattfaews. Paator 
Ctarcb taL 47M906 

EranSanday— 
t:<B ajn.—Overcoman Worship Service. 
9:90 ajn.-Cofiee, Juke and fellowship. 

10:00 aigtHSonday school for all ages. 
JM):80 a-m.-Worship service ana Children's 

6:00p.m.—Evening Service. 
Every Wednesday— 

7:00 pjn.-Famto Night 
Van pieYjB available for Sunday morning and 
Wednesday evening. 

Baptist- "~ 
PHUT BAPTIST CHURCH OF GREGORY 

The Rev. Richard Mathew, Pastor 
Every Sunday-

9:4Sajn,~SandayscaooL 
11:00 aJn.—Mornlflg worship. 
7:00j»jn.-Evening worship. 

Every Wednesday— 
7:00 p jn.—WQd-week service. 
0:00 pjn.—Choir practice. 

NORTH SHARON BAPTIST 
Sylvan and Washburne Rds. 

Bm Wininger, Pastor 
Everv Sunday— 

10:(10 ajn? " 

ST. JACOB EVANGELICAL 
LUTHERAN 

, 12801 RietinnilkrRd., Grass Lake 
The Rev. James S. Fischer, Pastor 

Every Sunday— 
0:30 ajn.-Sunday school, Family Bible Study. 

10:46 ajn.—Worship service. 

ST. THOMAS LUTHERAN 
10001W. Ellsworth Rd. 

(9 miles south and 3 miles west of Dester) 
The Rev. John RJake, Pastor 

Sunday, Aug. J -
9:30 am—Worship service with Holy Commu­

nion. 

TRINfTy-LUTHERArf 
S7M M«36, three miles east of Gregory 

Richard G. Genthner, ST., Pastor 
Every Sunday— 

0:00 am-Worship. 
9:30 ajn.-Sunday School and Bible Class. 

10:40 am—Worship. 
Communion 8 a-m. first and third Sunday, 10:48 

a m second and fourth Sunday. 

ZION LUTHERAN 
EX.CA. 

Corner of Fletcher and Waters Rd. 
The Rev. Mark Weirauch, Pastor 

Thursday, July 30— 
6:30 pjn.-&rftbaH at St Mary's east field. 

Sunday, Aug. 2 -
9:18 a jn.—Worship with Hob/ Communion. 

Free Methodist— 
CHELSEA FREE METHODIST 

766SWerknerRd. 
Mearl Bradley, Pastor 

G. Harry Bonney, Associate Pastor 
Wednesday, July 2 9 -

1:00-2:30 pjn.-Ladlea Bible study. 
6:30 pja.-Support Group. 
7:O0Fpani—S aweek service. 

Jig&Sg&^V"**** ""^ S t a W E j u l ^ 
B V rL w e a n e ^HK~'^. j ^ -^ 12:30>2:00ojn.—Ladies BJ 

J : b 0 p m - B ^ s t u d y andprayermeeting. " » p £ . p - ~ - ™ 
Nursery available at all services. field 

- — — Saturday, Aug. 1 -

METHODIST HOME CHAPEL 

) e jn.-Worship service. 

SHARON UNITED METHODIST 
Corner Pleasant Lake Rd. and U-U 

The Rev. Peggy Paige, Pastor 
Every Sunday— 

10:00 a jn.-&aday school 
11:00 a jn.-Wonmp service. 

Mormon— 
CHURCH OF JESUS CHRIST 

OP LATTERY AY SAINTS 
1330 Freer Rd. 

Rnm ItkiAfftQtf tffBiy* prwHff^ 
¢17404-7876 « leave a message at 478-1778 

Every Sunday— 
9:30-10:20 a jn.-Adult and Youth Sunday. 
9:30-11:14 a jiL-Prtmary School 

10:28-11:18 aja-Priesthood and Relief Society. 
11:30-13:30 pm-SaerameM meeting. 

Son-Denominational-' 
CHELSEA HOSPITAL MINISTRY 

10:00 a jn.-Moming service, Chelsea Commun­
ity Hospital ChapeL 

COVENANT 
SON. Freer Rd. 

The Rev. SiegMedS. Johnson, Pastor 
Every Sunday-

9:30ajQ.-Wonhip. 

rmrt.gP'.A Btn.i.flflBPBi. 
11482 Jackson Rd. (Lima Town Ball) 

John * Sarah Groesser, Pastors 
478-7379 -

10:18 ajn.—Intercessory Prayer. 
11:00 ajn.—Morning worship. 
6:00 p. jn.-Evening worship. 

" rNight^ 
«1 classes 

Report 
Washtenaw County Sheriff's 

Department deputies investigated a 
number of incidents between July 13 
and July 21. 

On July 13, John F. Docksey, 36, of 
Wlxom was arrested after his vehicle 
bit James Linfield's vehicle on east-
bound X<M west of Freer Rd., Chelsea. 
Unfield said Docksey came up on him 
while he was in the passing lane on 
I<94 traveling 65 mph and struck his 
vehicle in the rear. Both Unfield and 
Docksey exited at Fletcher Rd. and 
called the WCSD. After deputies ar­
rived they spoke with both men and 
asked Docksey to perform sobriety 
tests. Docksey was arrested for 
operating a vehicle under the in­
fluence of liquor. 

On July 14, a vehicle driven by Gene 
D. Brown of Ann Arbor hydroplaned 
on water and hit a baracade wall on 
1-84 near Maple Rd. 

On July 15, John T. Morford, 28, 
formerly of 1075 N. Lima Center Rd., 
Chelsea, was arrested as a disorderly 
drunk. WCSD deputies were dispatch­
ed to the Big Oak Party Store on Zeeb 
Rd. because Morford was passed out 
in his car. When they tried to return 
Morford to the above address no one 
at the residence wanted him there. 

The Rev. Theodore Brueckner 
To PreacTT at Zion Lutheran 

#e study. 
Jat-St Mary's east 

for, all ages. 

Catholic-
ST. MARY 

The Rev. Fr. David Philip Dupuis, Pastor 
Every Sunday-

6:00 a JXL—Mass. 
10:00 a JD.—Mass. 

Every Saturday— 
13:00 noon-1:00 pjn.—Confessions. 
6:00 pjn.—Mass. 

Christian Scientist— 
FIRST CHURCH OF CHRIST SCIENTIST 

1883 Washtenaw Ave., Ann Arbor 
Every Sunday— 

10:30 a jn.—Sundayachool morning service. 

8:00 a jn.-SmaU group Leaders breakfast 
Sunday, Aug. 2— 

8:30 a.m.—Early Celebration. 
9:30 a jn.—Coffee Fellowship. 
9:48 a Jn.—Sunday School for all 

11:00 ajn.—Morning Celebration. 
6:00 pjn.—Michael SeweD concert 
6:00 pjn.—Evening Vespers. 

Tuesday, Aug. 4— 
9:30-11:00 ajn.-Ladies Bible study. 

Wednesday, Aug. ft— 
6:30 pjn.-Support Group. 

7:00 pjn.-Midweek service. 

Methodist— 
Church of Christ-

CHURCHOFl 
13661 Old US-1 
Minister, RD. 

.East 
'amen 

9:30 am.—Bible classes, all ages. 
10:30 ajn.—Worship service. Nursery available. 
6:00 pjn.-Wonhip service. Nursery available. 

Evay Wednesday— 
7:00 pjn.—Bible classes, all ages. 

First and Third Tuesday of every month— 
7:00 pjn.-Ladies class. 

Episcopal— 
ST. BARNABAS 

/ 20600 Old US-12 
(Directh£across from the Fairgrounds) 

The Rev. Fr. Jerrold F. Beaumont OJS.P. 

10:00 ajn.—Worship and Holy Communion. 
10:00 a J&.—Church school, K-12. 
10:00 ajn.—Nursery-
11:00 a JD.—Family coffee hour. 

Every Wednesday— 
6:30 pjn.—Light supper. 
7:30 pjn.—E«pk>rali5h of selected issues. 

Lutheran— 
FAITHEyANQELICAL -

| T.^'ftES'^— " 
Wednesday, J u j y J T ^ ^ ^ 

7:30 pjn.—Worship service with Lord's Supper. 
Sunday, Aug. 2 -

10:00 ajn,—Worship service with Lord's Supper. 
6:00 pjn..—Softball game at Jackson. 

Monday. Auk 3 -
Vacatf0B-B»)e School through Wednesday, 

SALEM OROVE UNITED METHODIST 
3320NottenRd. 

The Rev. Jim Paige 
Every Sunday— 

9:30 ajn.-Church school 
10:361 ajn.—Morning worship. 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
Parks and Territorial Rds. 

Pastor Wayne Wilier 
Every Sunday-

9:30 ajn.—Worship service. 
10:00 ajn.—Sunday school , ^-¾ 

WATERLOO VILLAGE — 
UNITED METHODIST 

8118 Washington St. 
Pastor Wayne Wilier 

Every Sunday-
10:00 ajn.—Sunday school 
11:16 ajn.-Worahlp service. 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
128 Park St. 

The Rev. Dr. Jerry Parker, Pastor 
Wednesday, July 29— 

6:30 pjn.—Prayer Group, 
7:16 pjn,—Study Group. 

Sunday, Aug. 2 - ' 
9:18 a ja.-Crib nursery opens. 

fajB—Worship service. Church school for 

Ipjn.-Church school 

IMMANUEL BIBLE 
145 E. Summit St 
Ron Clark, Pastor 

Every Sunday— 
9:48 a jn.-Sunday school* nursery provided. 

11:00 ajn.—Morning worship, nursery provided. 
6:00 pjn.—Evening worship. 

Every Wednesday— 
7:00 pjn.—Family hour, prayer meeting and 

Bible study. 

MT. HOPE BIBLE 
12864 Mat Rd„ Grass Lake 

The Rev. Joseph A. O'Neill, Pastor. 
Every Sunday— 

10:00 a jn.-Sunday schooL 
11:00 ajn.—Morning worship. 
OiOOjjn.-Evening service. 

JSsar 
7:00 pjn.-Blbte study. 

Morford became disorderly and was 
arrested. 

On July 16, Barbara E. Griffith of 
8680 W. Huron River Dr., Dexter, said 
her son found three marijuana plants 
on a corner of their property, freshly 
planted among a group of pine trees. 
WCSD took them and will destroy the 
plants. 

David M. Colwell, 44, was also ar­
rested for operating a motor vehicle 
under the influence of liquor. WCSD 
deputies were dispatched to Miller 
Rd. east of Delhi Rd. in Scio township 
to an unknown accident. When they 

Sunday, Aug. 2, is the next event in 
the series of celebrations that Zion 
Lutheran church is having to com­
memorate 125 years since the church 
was founded at Rogers Corners.' 

This event features a return of the 
Rev. Theodore P. Brueckner, a son of 
the congregation* to preach at the 
Sunday morning service at 9:15 a.m. 

Following the worship and commu­
nion service there will be an old-
fashioned church pothick picnic out­
side on the lawn of Loren and Dorothy 
Koengeter across the street from the 
church. A special feature of this pic­
nic will be a lamb roast. All are in­
vited to join in on the celebration. 

The Rev. Theodore P. Brueckner 
was born in Alpena, and came to 
Rogers Corners where his father, the 
Rev. M.W. Brueckner, served as 
pastor of Zion Lutheran congregation 
for 26 years. Pastor Ted Brueckner at­
tended elementary school at Rogers 
Corners, and Chelsea High school He 
graduated from Capital University 
and Evangelical Lutheran 
Theological Seminary, Columbus, O. 
in 1945. He married Doris Bryant, also 
a graduate of Capital University. 

Pastor Brueckner has served 
parishes in Mullan, Ida., San Bernar­
dino, Calif., Saginaw, and Beaverton, 
Ore. He also served as assistant to the 

^ishop-ofthe-NortihPaeific District of 

Washington, and Alaska. He retired in 
1983. He has served as a senior pastor 
at St. Luke Lutheran church in 
Portland, Ore., and as a stewardship 
counselor in the northwest. 

The Brueckners have a daughter, 
Pamela Nagel, teaching in the Seattle 
area and a son, Timothy, pastor of 
Bethany Lutheran church in Gold 
Beach, Ore. They have four grand-
children. The Brueckners make their 

The. American Lutheran Church, 
covering Oregon, southwest of 

home in the Beaverton area, 
southwest suburb of Portland. . a 

ST. VLADIMIR ORTHODOX CHURCH 
The Rev. Fr. Paul Karas, Pastor 

9900 Jackson Rd. 
(between Stelnbach and Dancer Rds.) 

Sunday Services-
9:30ajn.-Hour. 
9:00 ajn.—Hob/ Confession. 

10:00 a jn.-Divine Liturgy. 

NEW LIFE CHRISTIAN CENTER 
80 Freer Rd, (Covenant church) 

Pastors Erik & Mary Hansen 
Every Sunday— 

11:30 ajn.-Praise, worship. Children's Church. 
6:00 pjn.—In home meetings. 

1st Monday of the month— 
7:00 pjn.-Women of Faith meets in homes. 

Every Thursday-
7:00 pjn.—Praise and prayer. 

Presbyterian— 
' FIRST UNITED PRESBYTERIAN 

Unadilla 
The Rev, Mary Groty 

Every Sunday-
9:90 ajn.—Sunday school. 

.- 11:00 ajn.—Worship service. 

t and kjfldergartners. 
—Svuhin1 ' ent Time, 1st through 4th 

graders 
10:30 ti.m.-Lemonade on the lawn 
10:38 ajn.—Crib nursery closes. 

Wednesday, Aug, 6 -
6:30 pjn.-Prayer Group, 
7:18 p.m.—Study Group. 

United Church of Christ-
BETHEL EVANGELICAL AND. 

REFORMED 
Freedom Township 

The Rev. Roman A. Reineck, Pastor 
Every Sunday— 

0:00 ajn,—Worship service. 10: 

OUR SAVIOR LUTHERAN -
-lSlS^MaUvC&Heee 

The Rev. FnukUnIft oTebel Pastor 
Thursday, July 30— 

1:00 pjn.—Bible study. 
Sunday, Aug- 2— 

9:00 ajn,—Worship. 

NORTH LAKE -.-
4JNITED METHODIST CHURCH-

CONGREGATIONAL 

—arrived they discovered Colwell, who 
said something ran Out in front of his 
vehicle. Severe front-end damage was 
done to his 1988 Honda. Colwell in­
dicated he had five drinks and his 
speech was slurred and incoherent, 
according to the deputies' report. Col­
well was arrested and taken to the 
Ann Arbor Police Department for 
chemical tests. 

On July 20, a malicious destruction 
of property over $100 occurred at the 
North Lake Construction site on North 
Territorial Rd., Dexter township. The 
incident was reported by Alexander 
McDonald of Munith. The damage is 
estimated to cost $5,000 from sand in 
the gas tanks and cut electrical and 
gas lines on road grading equipment. 
• Vicki Yargeau, 25, of Saline, 
reported a suspicious incident. When 
she was traveling, eastbound on 1-04 
east of M-62 In Chelsea her frolit 
passenger window was smashed while 
she was driving. She said she didn't 

' see anything hit the window. Damage 
is estimated to cost $200. 

An attempted breaking and enter-

ssflssjl 

1 

ORTHODONTIST 
RAYMOND P. HOWE 

D.D.S., M.S. 

515 South Main Street 
Chelsea 

Te l ephone 313-475-2260 

Examination Appointment without charge 

BS^BSSBBSaSSSBBBBIBBBBBBBBSBBBaaa 

Every Sunday-

14111 North Territorial Road 
The Rev. Wayne Hawtey, Pastor 

iryS 
9:30 ajn.—Church school. 

10:30 a.m.-Worship service. 
ll:30ajn.-Fellowship time.. 
6:00 p.m.-Youth Group. 

The Rev. J. Keith Roberson, Interim Minister 
-^gloe-hours) Monday-Friday, < 

+ . _ * 
J You Are Heartily Invited to I 

i SPECIAL GOSPEL MEETINGS : 
* * 

_| Sunday through Friday at 7:30 p.m. * 

* 

* 

* 
* 

* 

. * 

JL-

JULY 19 through AUGUST 9 
at the Gospel Tent 

on the Farm of Ron Ritchie 
9100 Trinkle Rd., Dexter, Mich. 

Every Sunday-
10:00 ajn.—Worship, 
10:00 a jn.-Sunday school, K-7. Nursery provided. 
Every Thursday— 
7:00 p.m.-Cholr practice. 

ST. JOHN'S 
Rogers Comers, Waters and Fletcher Rds. 

The Rev. Nancy Doty, Pastor 

I a jn.-Worship service, Sunday school. 

ST. JOHN'S EVANGELICAL 
AND REFORMED 

Francisco 
The Rev. Michael Permanen 

Every Sunday— 
10:30 a jn.-Sunday school and worship service. 

First Sunday of every month— 
Communion, - -. : 

ing was abb reported. The Scio Party 
r located at 0950 Jackson Rd. in 

Scio township had a window broken 
out and someone tried to kick the door 
in. 

On July 21, a breaking and entering 
was reported. It happened July 20 at 
17865 Garvey Rd., Chelsea. The two 
victims, Thomas Kemp and Chris 
Minick, apprehended the juvenile 
suspects before deputies arrived. The 
two Juveniles, one 13, and the other 15, 
stole three guns and hid them in a 
field. Their footprints led Kemp and 
Minick to one of the juvenile's home.-

CONDUCTEDBY 
NORMAN CRAWFORD - Jackson, Mich. 
STUART THOMPSON - Sarnla, Ontario 

* 

* . 

./ 

/ N O COLLECTIONS 
ThlTTt O faithful saving ond worthy of oil acceptation •hat 

1 timothy Jesus Christ came into the world to save sinners. 
1:15. There meetings are convened by Christians who meet in 
the Gospel Halls in Livonia and Jackson, Mich. 

*-
* 
* 

» 

* 

» 

» 
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ST. PAUL 
The Rev. Erwin R. Koch, Pastor 

Sunday, Aug. 3 -
t:30ajn.-Wonhip service. Worship for all 

ages, children's story. 

Manchester Man 
Graduates from Navy 
Technician Course 

-Thr^ t Jrted 
friend. Both were takento the Chelsea 
Police Department for further in­
vestigation. 

CHICKEN 
BAR-B-Q 

and 

CORN FEAST 
Saturday, Aug. 1 st 

-~—^my p.m — 
BAR-B-QjCHICKEN • CORN ON THE COB 

BAKED BEANS • COLE SLAW 
ROLLS & BEVERAGE 

A DELICIOUS DINNER $ 
FOR ONLY 

T 
6.00 

NORTH LAKE 
UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

14111 North Territorial Rd., Cholna 

Eat in or Take Home — Call, or get tickets at door 

TAKE-OUTS — CALL 475-7569 

r 

w 

Kv bora 

Navy Airman Apprentice Robert E. 
Luckhardt, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert E. : Luckhardt, Sr., of 122 
Riverside Dr., Manchester, recently 
graduated from the Basic Avionics 
Technician Course. 

During the course at the Naval Air 
Technical Training Center, Naval Air 
Station Memphis, MiWngton, Tenn., 

* * M w £ students receive technical instruction 
£££**- oh the fundamentals necessary to per* 

form job-entry level aviation elec­
tronics maintenance tasks. Students 
also receive instruction to prepare 
them for further specialized training 
on operational aviation electronics 
equipment found in naval aircraft 

KUBOTA TRACTORS & IMPLEMENTS 

JUaUt 
FINANCING 
AVAILAtLI 

CHECK 
DEALER FOB 
tfETAJLS * 
REBATES 
LEASING 

AVAILABLE 

Since 1955 
6530 N. Territorial Road 
(Located between Dexter ft 

Pinckney, 1 mile E. of Dexter-
Pinckney Road) 

Dexter, Ml-(313) 426-8527 

^rftttutfainlinfif 
Sine* 1978 

ytXhmparm Our 
*S@ Qualify A 

* tow Prlft 
Residential A Commt-rclttl 

Interior & Exterior 

Exports In 
ROLLER-BRUSH 

SPRAY M I N T I N G 
• New Home* • Staining 
• Restoration A Repair ', . . 
• Aluminum Siding Finishing 
• Power Washing • Boom Rentals 
• Interior Custom Wood Finishing 
• Wallpopor Hanging 
• Electrostatic Spraying . 

FULLY INSURED 

nn itriMATit 

4733376 
• e*m. to S p.m. 

Fred Herendeen 

tOHCE*#ty 

INSURANCE COMPANY OP AMERICA 

Member of The Hanover Companies 

Palmer Insurance 
3074 Baker Road 

Dexter, Michigan 48130 
426-5047 \\L 

v*£ 

SPECIAL DISCOUNTS FOR 
SENIORS • TEACHERS • NON-SMOKERS 

tfMBMiaa 
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Local 4-H Youth Show 
Runs Through Friday 

Th» Chelteo Standord, Wednesdoy, July 29,1992 19 

Washtenaw county 4-H Youth Show 
is being held through Friday at the 
Farm Council Grounds, 5055 Saline-
Ann Arbor Rd. in Saline. 

During the week there will be a 
variety of activities. 

"^Members of a local 4-H group, 
Rogers Comers Herdsmen, will be in­
volved in everything from arts and 
crafts to livestock classes. There are 
also more unusual activities, such as 
the animal decorator class and the 
dairy goat milk-out. 

A VOLUNTEER COURTESY SHUTTLE Is in operation at Chelsea Com­
munity Hospital The shuttle is designed to transport patients and visitors to 
and from the hospital parking lots on the hospital's campus. A six-passenger 
golf cart is being used for the service. Those individuals who have been trained 
to operate the shuttle Include Homer KuhL Margaret Kohl, Dave Stricter, 
Leona Beeman, Wflber Beeman, Fred Harris, Tom McNamara, Dave Pastor, 
George West, Barbara Haag, Sherman Read, Pat Stange, Ernie Schaf er, Merle 
Davis, Richard Kalmbach, Howard Dancer, Maynard Blossom, Doris Bum* 
chard and Austin Arte. Shown above are Homer KuhL EUa Aldrlca and Bar­
bara Haag in the new shuttle cart. Additional drivers, male or female, are 
needed and welcome. Training sessions will be provided. Interested persons 
sb«w>W call Linda PearsaU at 475-3913. 

^R 

i 

Many 4-H members from all over 
the county are involved in the yearly 
event, which shows the hard work 
they have put in during the year. 

The show is free and open to the 
public. 

Meat cuts of all types are cheaper 
this summer compared to last year. 
Retail cuts of beef are about nine 
cents a pound lower. Pork is down 
about 18 cents. Even chicken is down 
a little. 

WELDING & FABRICATION SERVICE | 

1 
I 

• SHORT RUN PRODUCTION • SHEARING 
• PLASMA CUTTING . HELIARC 
•PRESS BRAKE 

I 
* 

S 
t 
tf 

WEIL BEND TO YOUR NEEDS 
4 7 5 . 7 6 1 7 ALL SEASON COMFORT J 
*ff # t# # U I # 1 2 1 BUCHANAN. CHELSEA f 

« _ • . « • : • •_•!#.»< 

Canon 

lOs 

• Advanced Flexible Autofocus System allows lor 
precise focusing (left, nghi or center) . 

• Bwit-tn retractable flesh 
• 5 Ips built-inmotor drive 
• 14 custom function controls let you tailor camera 

to your personal needs 
• image Stabilized Program automatically 

compensates shutter speed lor shaking 
• Optional exclusive Bar Code Scanner hr fast 

customized programming 
• 8-Zone Evaluative AE Metering 
• Shutter speeds up to ) /4000 sec 
• Optional Remote Controller: with instant release 

or i-se'cond delay 
> includes Canon USA inc one-year limited 

warranty/registration cara 

Soadvanced...H'seasytoshootiikeapro 
Special Limited Edition Aval labia 

HURON CAMERA & VIDEO 
W* rtpair all mektt and medtti ttmtm t pro)ttMn. 

•060 Main St., Oostar M»» 42MoS4 
— — — — only 10 mlmiHa from A M Aibor, Cfwowo A MiKftiwy — 

Everybodys 
Science 

• Bait Minnows Can Be 
Sentinels of Water Pollution 

By Don Comls 
Bait minnows or even clams could 

be the "environmental canaries", of 
the 90*8, their illnesses giving an early 
signal that something is wrong in the 
environment. At the turn of the cen-

~~tury, canaries were used to detect tox* 
ic gases in mines. 

Unlike the canaries that died in 
mines, the minnows known as mum-
michogs are cared for by scientists 
while being tested and are released 
back to home waters along the East 
Coast. 

"We're testing mummichog min­
nows as indicators of water quality to 
be sure farm chemicals—fertilizers 
and pesticides—are used safely/' said 
George Gassner, a U.S. Department 
of Agriculture biologist. 

"Mummichogs are prone to liver 
tumors in the presence of car­
cinogens," he said. "We are using a 
magnetic resonance imaging scanner 
to detect invisible tissue damage as a 
sign of liver lesions." Later, these le­
sions can form tumors. 

,4'^^X«^ 
habitat for long-term monitoring once 
they have been tagged. He has been 
doing the research at the En­
vironmental Chemistry Laboratory 
operated by USDA's Agricultural 
Research Servleeat Belteville, M d , — 

Gaaaner said the work is part of the 
lab's search for biosensors-living 
plants, animals or tissues used to 
detect pollutants. Other aquatic can­
didates for magnetic resonance scan­
ning, he said, include clams, oysters 
and crayfish. All share key criteria 
with the mummichog: They're abun­
dant along the East Coast and they re­
main in the same area all their lives. 

Each mummichog is gently 
anesthetized and wrapped in a plastic 
foam "blanket to protect against hand­
ling and drying while undergoing, 
tests. Gassner's scanner is a smaller 
version of the one hospitals u s e ^ r 
diagnose patients. 

He said environmental scientists 
and managers from federal, state and 
local agencies could use the scanner 
technology to periodically monitor the 
minnow for the quality of waterways. 

(Agriculture Research Service, 
uSTDepertnent of Agriculture) 

During the period 1990-2005, growth 
in one-half of the 30 fastest increasing 
occupations will be generated by the 
rising demand for health services. 
The other half of the fastest growing 
occupations will be professional and 
technical occupations that require 
significant post secondary education, 
according to the Bureau of Labor 
Statistics' Occupational Outlook 
Quarterly, Fall 1991. 

ELECT - ELECT - ELECT 

JERRY 
DRESSELHOUSE 

for 

—SUPERVISOR 
and 

LUANN 
STRIETER KOCH 

far 

CLERK 
SYLVAN TOWNSHIP 

RIPUBUCAN 

VOTE — PRIMARY 
AUGUST 4. 1993 

Paid tor by Committer To Elect 
Luann Stricter Koch 

and Jerry D r e u e l h o u s * . 
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Automotive lHRecreation Equip. CLASSIFICATIONS 

83 TOYOTA — Runs good, noeds 
body work. Best oKer. 498-2042. 

^10 
1976 LINCOLN MARK IV — 25,000 

original miles, mint condition, no 
winter miles, $9,000 or best offer. 
426-4924 after 1 p.m. c1L2 

HAVING TROUBLE 
BUYING A CAR? 

We finance. Michigan's oldest dealer 
since 1912. Palmer Ford-Mercury, 
Chelsea. 313-475-8790. 

_ _ _ OStf 

BODY SHOP 
COMPLETE PULL TIME 
Estimates Available 

PALMER FORD 

SAILBOAT — Sunflih, good condi­
tion, $375. Call 475-3618. 

clO-2 

For Sale 

BULLDOZER FOR SALE 
Bulldozer TD25, 1977 

International, For Sale 

Phone 426-4304 
clO 

222 S. Main 

^ 

475-1301 
17tf 

Farm & Garden t 

„TOR L2850-34 h.p., 
four-wheel drive, loader. 138 

hours. $13,000. Call 426-5088. -cl 1-2 
BANTAM CHICKS for sale. Hatched 

this spring and summer to free-
ronge hens. $2 each. 475*0105. -clO 

ROCK GARDEN 
SALE 

at 

Rock Bottom Prices 
Other perennials on sale tool 

CHAIRS 
STRAIGHT CHAIRS—$35 ea. 
BARREL-BACK, cut-velvet upholstery 

in gold tones. Excellent condition, 
$50 ea. Cott426-9273. 

-cll-2 

A Quality Set Mod* for Grand Living 

AAAHOGANY 

T.J. Forms 

DINING SET 
Oval table wftfc6 upholstered chairs, 
buffet china cabinet. Call 426-9273. 

.ell.2 
OAK FLOORING — 2'/«" No. 2 red 

or white, $1.19 per sq. ft. 2nd 
grade maple, $1.96. Antique grade 
ash, $1.70. Wide oak flooring, $1.75. 
Colli.800-523-8878. -C13-4 
PIANO — 5 ft. upright Grand, 

excellent condition, new keys,, 
new hammers. $500 or best offer, 
Call 475-1829. • cll-2 

Modern 

RUMMAGE SALE 

Thurs., July 30 & Fri., Jury 31 

Masonic Temple 
: VUTW;TMIddle St., Chelsea 

9 a.m. to 4 p.m. A little of 
everything, come look and seo. 

clO-2 
ANNUAL YARD SALE - Thursday, 

Friday and Saturday, July 30, 31, 
Aug. 1, 10129 Manchester-Chelsea 
Rd. Lots of miscellaneous, crafts, 
clothes, doll house. -10 
YARD SALE — Thursday, July 30, 

10:00 to 5:00? 730 N. Main St., 
Chelsea. -clO 
HUGE GARAGE SALE — July 31, 

Aug. 1, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m., Aug. 2,12 
noon to 5 p.m. Lots of kid's clothes 
and coots of all sites. 761 Flanders, 
Chelsea. -clO 
4-FAMILY GARAGE SALE — Thurs.-

Sot., July 30 - Aug. 1, 9 a.m. to 5 
p.m. 40 Chestnut. Camera, yogurt 
maker, electric typewriter, bicycle, 
bedding, clothes and lots more I -10 
6-FAMILY GARAGE SALE — Friday & 

Saturday, July 29-Aug. I. 766 
Flanders St.,. Chelsea (off 
Washington St.) Bikes, baby clothes^ 
typewriter, antiques, Tupperwdre, ~ 
clowns and much more. -clO 

YARD & BAKE SALE 
Thurs., July 30-Sat., August 1 

9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
First Assembly of God 

19400 E. Old US-12, Chelsea 
clO 

MOVING AFTER 50 YEARS — Satur­
day, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 11250 

Rlethmiller, Chelsea (1-94, exit 150). 
Housewares, Avon and other collect-
ibles. lots of miscellaneous. -clO 

Automotive. 1 
Motorcycles l a 
Farm 4V Garden 2 

fta^^L_____ I ___•)__•> K___ 
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Wanted • • » • • . • « . • . • • 
Wanted to Rant . . . . 11a 
for Rent. 12 

Per Salo(GoMfft)....... 4 
A u c t i o n . . . . . . . . . . . 4a 
Oarage tale* 4b 
Antiques 4c 
Real Estate .5 

M M * wojes, Cetlegss 
Mobile Homes. . . . . .3a 
Animals A Pots 6 
Lost A Pound 7 
Help Wanted 8 
Work Wanted 8a 
Adult Core 9 
Child C a r e . . . . . . . . . 10 

Misc. Notices 13 
Personals . . . . . . . . . 14 
Entertainment 13 
Bus. Services 16 

Cerysetry/CwutnKtlM 

Ttttffaf/ butrvctise 
ifosyts eel nTsess 

Financial 17 
Bus. Opportunity... 18 
Thank You. 19 
Memorfam . . 20 
Log a I Notice. 21 

Real Estate 

BUILDING SITES — Three 3¼ 
acres; five 1 -acre sites. Grass Lake 

schools. Close to 1*94. (517) 
522-5196. -clO-2 
ANTRIM COUNTY - 10 beautifully 

wooded acres, (deal hunting and 
camping spot. Near Jordan River and 
Lake Bellalre. $9,500. $300 down. 
$125/mo., 11% lend contract. Call 
Northern Land Company, 
1-800-966*3118. ell-3 
HOUSE FOR SALE BY OWNER -

Dexter area. Needs repair. Call 
(313)426-3071. -clO-2 

CLASSIFIED ADS THANK YOU/MEMOftf A 

CASH RATES: 
10 f l rurss. . . . . . .81.00 
10«/figure over 10 

When po/sf by M M A Saftirday -

CHARGE RATES: 
IBflgurtt . . .83.00 

Wrimtm tbrtsi $1.00 
/ * • 
' AM odv#rti»«rt should chtck lh«jr.ed lh* tint 

wMk. Th» L«d«r connol ««#pi rtiponiibih-
ly tor arrcn pn odt racilvMt by t«l«phon« 
but will mokt ivtry «Mer1 le mek« th#m op-
p«or ccrtcily. Mundi moy b« mod* only 
wh#n on «rron«ou» ad it uncclltd elltr thi 
Urtl wf*k that it opp»oA. J 

CASH RATES: 
50 figures 83.00 
Ibt ear figure ever 50 
When paid ey teen Saturday 

CHARGE RATES: 
SO figures $5.00. 

Mobile Homes 

MUST SELL TO BEST OFFER — Down, 
town Chelsea. Ideal for single. Fur­

niture included. Terms available. 
Coll 475-4409. c13-4 

Arbor Manufactured Homes 
has o new home for you 

in 
MANCHESTER MANOR 

Lost & Found 

KITTEN FOUND - Near Old US-12 
and Sylvan. Light grey striped. Call 

475-9296. _? 
LOST* FOUND'ADOPT ABLE PETS 

ANIMAL SHELTERS 
•HUMANE SOCIETY 
OP HURON VALLEY 

(313)662-5589 
3100 Cherry Hill Rd., Ann Arbor 

(off Plymouth Rd. at Dlxboro) 
7 days, Noon-6 p.m. 

•JACKSON COUNTY 
SHELTER 

1-(517) 78*4464 
2004 N. Blackstone, Jackson 

(1-94 Cooper St. exit, right on North 
St; to Blackstone) 

Mon.-Frl, 8-5 
•CASCADES HUMANE SOCIETY 

ADOPTION SERVICE 
1-(517)788-6587 

Mon. ft Sat. 10-5; Tues.-Fri. 12-5 
e47tf_ 

1 > 

'/ 

clO 

Chelsea 
Farmer's Market 

Sot., Aug. 1, 8 a.m. to 1 p.m. 

Recreation Equip. 

'80 CHAMPION 25' motor home. Fully 
self-contained. 39,000 miles. 

$8,900. Coll475-0366. -cll-2 
14' StUMACRAFT BOAT with oars. 

No looks. $350. Coll 475*0105. -clO 
" * < l 

3______? 
FORD-MERCURY 

MICHIGAN'S OLDEST 
, FORD DEALER 
! HONESTY • INTEGRITY 

SATISFACTION 

Fresh Trades 
Luxury Cars 

1992* FORD CROWN VICTORIA LX 
. Only 16,000 miles. 

Cost new $23,000. 
Palmer Price only $16,900 

1990 LINCOLN TOWN CAR 
Dual power, keyless entry, 
flawless cor, silver. 1 owner. 
Cost new $29,250. 
Palmer Price $16,250 

1989 LINCOLN MARK VII 
1 pwner, low miles. Cost new 
$29,500. Palmer Price. .$13,900 

1988 MERCURY COUGAR -

Keyless entry, low miles, 
.Only $7,295 
1987 FORD MUSTANG 

Very clean. Only .$4,995 
1987 COUGAR LX 

Low miles. Only $9,995 
1988 LINCOLN TOWN CAR 

Signature Series. 
Like new. Only— . .$10,900 

TRUCKS 
1992 FORD E-250 Club Wagon 

7,000 miles. Cost new $23,750. 
Palmer Price .$19,900 

1992 EXPLORER Eddie Bauer 
12,000 miles. Cost new $25,000. 
Palmer Price —$22,900 

1992 FORD F-150 
Auto, 8K miles. Only... $11,900 

1987 FORD RANGER 
With cover. Qnly $4,495 

1988 FORD RANGER 
Super Cab. Low mileage. 
Only $5,995 

1989 FORD F-150 Super Cab 
4x4, V-8, outo., captain's 
chairs. Cost new $14,750. 
Palmer Price $11,900 

THREE-QUARTERS 
OF A MILLION DOLLAR 

INVENTORY 

70 FRESHLY DETAILED 
CARS AND TRUCKS 
TO CHOOSE FROM 

Thft-Hom* of 
Chelsea Auto Credit 

fORD - MERCURY 
Michigan'! Oldest Ford Dealer 

1-94 AT M-5Z CHELSEA 
313-475-1800 or 

313-473-6750 

Full size bed frame, 4-drawer vanity 
with great mirror. Blonde wood 
(bleached mahogany). Call 426-9273. 

.cll-2 
SOLAFLEX EXERCISE MACHINE — 

With leg and butterfly at-
tochments. $750. Coll 475-0149. -clO-2 

STEEL BUILDINGS 
Garage to warehouse size. 

Packages or complete construction. 
SOME CLOSE-OUTS AVAILABLE 

BIG SAVINGS 
Call Us with your needs. 

(313)> 994-5956 
• -cii-3 

KILLS FLEASI Buy ENFORCER Flea 
Killers for pets, home ft yard. 

Guaranteed effective I Buy EN­
FORCER at: Johnson's How To 
Center, 110 N. Main, Chelsea, Ml. 

-12-10 
SCRATCH PADS • • .Kid's Drawing 

paper" at The Standard and 
Leader's offices, 300 N. Main St., 
Chelsea. 

- C45tf 
C0LLECT0RS_G0WEN~-01DIES -— 

1930's ft 40's labels. 18 rmp. Good 
condition. Call 662-1771. 

c___ 
PIONEER POLE BUILDING: 30x40x10. 

$5,390.12 colors, 2x6 truss system, 
12' slider, 36" entrance door. 
Overhead doors available. Other 
sizes and options. Free quotes. 
800-292-0679. c49tf 
SIGNS, SIGNS, SIGNS — We have 
. the one you're looking for at The 
Chelsea Standard, 300 N. Main St., 
Chelsea. Utf 
WEDDING STATIONERY - Prospec­

tive brides are Invited to see our 
complete line of invitations and wed­
ding accessories. The Chelsea 
Standard, 300 N. Main. Ph. 475-1371. 

x6tf 

HUGE GARAGE SALE - Thurs., 
July 30, Sat., Aug. 1, 9 o.m. till 

dark. Household Items, clothing • all 
sizes (baby's, boy's, girl's, men s and 
women's). Collectibles, patchwork 
quilts, early-American loveseat and 
toys. 7020 Clear Lake Rd. (Waterloo 
area). elO 
2-FAMILY GARAGE SALE — July 30, 

31 and Aug. 1, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
1095 N. Fletcher, Chelsea. Clothing, 

tewelry, household Items, exercise 
>lke, misc. -clO 

GARAGE SALE — July 31, 9 a.m. to 
4 p.m., 14183 Waterloo Rd. {bet­

ween McKlnley and Werkner Rds.), 
Chelsea. Bedroom suite, living room 
choirs, lamps, stereo, other fur­
niture, bicycles, toys, girl's clothes 
(sizes 1-2), boy's clothes (sizes 5-7), 
hope chest, Kirby vacuum cleaner, -
stroller, crib, mlsc, -clO 
4-FAMILY GARAGE SALE — July 31 

and Aug. 1. Starts at 9 a.m. 4155 
King Hill Dr. off Island lake Rd., Dex­
ter. Furniture, weight machine, 
aluminum gate, children's books, 
clothes, ana mony misc., households 
items. Rain amino, • \~ -^10' 
MULTI-FAMILY GARAGE SALE -
. 1770 N. LimaCenter Rd., Dexter 
(between Dexter-Chelsea and 
Trinkle Rd.). Items to numerous and 
varied to list. Thurs.-F/i., July 30-31, 
8;30o.m.1o3pTm.,Sot„Aug.1,9lo 
2. -clO 

DEADLINES 

CLASSIFIED PAGES 
Saturday, 12 noon 

"CONTIHVLD" CLASSifltOS 
Mondlny, 12 noon 1 

Look no further, you can find just that 
right house from our In.park models 
ready for your visit. We are the 
areas exclusive Fleetwood dealer, 

-the largest home builder In America. 
Don't wait for all the prime lots to be 
taken. Financing may be arranged. 
Call 428-0200 or 663-5291. 

clO-2 

Animals & Pets 

DOBERMAN PUPS — AKC, excellent 
temperment. Tails and dew claws 

done. Call (313) 426-5879. clO 
BRITTANY PUPS — AKC-14 weeks old, 

$100 for males, $200 for females. 
all (517) 589.5105. cKL Coll (517) 589.5105. 

Help Wanted 

COMPUTER — knowledgeable person 
for local feed and grain business. 

Full-time position with benefits 
available. Apply, Mon.-Frl., 8-4:30 at 
Provico Big H, 11800 Chelsea>Dexfer 
Rd. Coll 475-1386. _ 0 

Bennigan's 
of Ann Arbor 

now hiring kitchen personnel, all 
positions. Apply within, 2 to 4 p.m. 
Ph. 996-0996. 

clO 

Garage Sales 

YARD SALE — Saturday, Aug. 1, 9 
a.m. to 5 p.m. 11506 Jackson Rd., 

(corner of Lima Center Rd.) Mini-
bike, snow blower, 16' boat, trailer ft 
motor, Nintendo games, boseball 
cards, toys, household. Good clean 
clothes. Free stuff. No early sales. 

10 

Antiques 

ANN ARBOR ANTIQUES MARKET — 
THE BRUSHER SHOW, 5055 Ann Ar­

bor Saline Rd., Exit 175 off 1-94. Over 
350 dealers In quality antiques and 
select collectibles, all Items 
guaranteed as represented and 
under cover, 6 a.m.-4 p.m. Admis­
sion $4.00, Third Sundays. 24th 
season, The Original 1111 ¢24-36 

Real Estate 

2+ ACRE. ESTATE In.village of Chel-
' sea. Lovely older home an Taylor 
Lone. 4 bedrooms, large living room, 
bath and dining room. Ph. (517) 
522-6198 or 475-8991 or 475-2193. 

-clO-2 

CONDO in CHELSEA 

Garage Sales 

GARAGE SALE — Exercise bike, 
Moped, Ilka new condition, '82 

. Reliant wagon, with or without tow­
ing hitch. Toys, old cameras, miscel­
laneous. Fri., July 31, and Sat. Aug. 
1, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 9144 Pettysvllle. 
Plnckney. clO 

Rank 
Grohs 

CHEVROLET-OE< 
•THE-

DISCOUNT OUTLET 

426-4677 

Wo Buy Uied 

MOVING SALE — Fri., July 31, 
8 a.m. to 4 p.m. ft Sat., Aug. 1, 8 

a.m. to 2 p.m., 18799 Bush Rd. Pick­
up camper, waterbed, electric 
typewriter, Linton oboe, furniture, 
TV, toys, skates, skis, clothes, lawn 
equipment, lots of misc. JO 
PRICED-RIGHT GARAGE SALE — Lots 

of toys and clothes from only child. 
Nice household goods galdre. 7017 
Parklawn Dr., North Loke area (off 
North' Territorial Rd.), 
Thurs.-Frl.-Sat., July 30-31, Aug. 1, 9 
o.m. to 6 p.m. -clQ 
2-FAMILY YARD SALE - July 31, 

9 a.m. to 5 p.m., Aug. 1, 9 to 1. 
Don't miss this I Something for 
everyone. Clothing, miscellaneous 
and household Items. 3110 Kens­
ington (off Main St., top of the hill), 
Dexter. . -clO 
MULTI-FAMILY GARAGE SALE — 

Toys, sports and pool equip., fur­
niture, craft, supplies, stereo, sax-' 
ophone, clarinet and more goodies. 
July 31-Aug. 1, 9 q.m. to 5 p.m. 9765 
Horseshoe Bend (Carriage Hills), 
Dexter. . -clO 
MOVING SALE - July 31-Aug. 1, 

9 a.m. to ? 9595 Dexter-Chelsea 
Rd. Household goods, lownmowers 
ond lots of good stuff. -clO 

MULTI-FAMILY GARAGE SALE — 
8371 W. Huron River Dr. Fri.-Sat., 

July 31-Aug. 1.9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
•clO 

_ 

Cars & Trucks 
Bring your title 

and a *mll*l 
,i 

1988 RANGER 
Sharp $3,495 

1986 DODGE CarojoVon 
Automatic $3,895 

1991 CHIVY S-10 
Red. S-speed. 

Sun roof. . . . . $ 6 , 5 7 5 

CHANCE 
AUTO CREDIT 

Call Jim Hawley 
on our EZ 

Credit Hot line 
collect 

1-313-4758750 
Chalsaa 

AUTO CREDIT 

—J50JLSALE-BY-OWNE 
2 BEDROOM, 2-BATH CONDO 

103 QUIET CREEK CIRCLE 
Call 475-0461 

' -CIO-4 

BRIDGETOWN 
Condominiums 

NOW AVAILABLE—2- and 3-bed­
room, including 2-car garage, full 
basement, patio deck, with many 
bullMns. From 

$119,900 
Models open daily 12 p .m.fS p.m. 

Chelsea. 475-7810 
c19tf 

3-BEDROOM RANCH for sale - 2 
baths, fireplace. In Chelsea 

Village. Ph. 475-2585. elOJ 
COMFORTABLE COUNTRY RANCH — 
3 bedrooms, 2 baths, full basement, 
nicely landscaped 1.8 acres, 35 mln. 
to Ann Arbor. $89,900. 
IMAGINE - The best view of 
Cavanaugh Lake, a wooded hillside 
setting, 90 feet of waterfront, and a 
3-bedroom home all for $170,000. 
READY TO BUILD — Wooded 1 + acre 
hillside, paved road, area of nice 
new homes. $15,000. -

Steve Elseman 475-3106 
Falsetto's Real Estate 

Real Estate 

44- Acre 
BUILDING SITE 

2 miles north of Chelsea. Great pond 
potential. 

Call (313) 475-7220 
elO 

WONDERFUL-FUNCTIONAL: Chelsea; 
5 mln. to 1-94; close to schools; lots of 
Andersen windows; cathedral ceil­
ings; gas fireplace; large kitchen, 
oax floor, Jenn-air, oak cabinets; 
laundry; formal dining room; 3-4 
bdrms,; 2¼ baths; master suite, 
walk-In closet, all-tile bath, |acuizl; 
unique third floor studlo/bdrm./of-
fIce/den; full partially finished base­
ment; 2'/i-car garage. Wonderful 
amenities/extras, details, closets, 
storage, accent lighting and fans, 
skylights; central air; top-quality 
workmanship, Boaytl{y,l «xfe/fe;; , 
lovely, Immaculate home by owner. 
$203,000.475-8256. ^ 0 

Golf-Lake Access 
Sharp, 3-br., 3-bath ranch on 9th folr-
woy of Inverness Golf Count. Extra 

-targe-1ctfr-$209;00Qr-6505ctom' ' 
Dr., Chelsea. Call 475-7341. 

FAMtlYCAT-^-- Needs new home. 
Spayed female. Blonde tabby. 

Pretty. Quiet. Excellent companion. 
Coll 426-4064. elO 
HOUSEStTTING and Petslttlng — Ref­

erences, over 14 years experience. 
Call Sherl, 475-8407. O0U 
LIVE TRAPS — $4/day rental plus 

deposit. Farmer's Supply, 122 
Jackson St., Chelsea. 475-1777; 

. c26tf 
EMERGENCY RESCUE — 24 hour, 7 

days. Humane Society of Huron 
Vdlley, 662-2374. c47tf 
SPAY/NEUTER CLINIC — Humone 

Society of Huron Valley, 662-4365, 
9-12,2-4. c47tf 

Lost & Found 

DIAMOND RING LOST — Marqul's 
sotting. REWARD! I Call 475-0392. 

10 

VOCALIST — wentedfof casual week*-
end (evening) performances. 

Pleose coll 475-7714. clp 
GROUP HOME AID — In Dexter. Full 

or part-time. Help teach young 
adults how to become Independent. 
Coll 426-1956. -cll-2 

MACHINIST 
< 

We are looking for an experienced 
machinist to do prototype work. Must 
have own tools. 
Applications accepted Mon.-Thurs., 
8:30 to 11 a.m. and 1:30-3 p.m. at 231 
Little Lake Dr., Ann Arbor. 665-3757. 
For details and directions call 
761-5627. 

MANPOWER 
cll-2 

-cl2 

INCOME PROPERTY 
5.6 acres in country 
4 rental units 
1 4-bedroom house 
duplex with 2 bedrooms each 

Munlth area. Land contract 
avoilable. $99,900. Phone (517) 
769-2185. C12-4 

Real Estate One. 
MommuKorMHtaMKCtitmi ir 

CARPENTRY, REMODELING, 
RENOVATION 

D MICKA 
Specializing in Older Homes 

and Barm 
Licensed a* Insured 

(517) 536-4371 

AFTERNOON, DAY, 

r«i & MIDNIGHT, i 
hAi^flri «>fia> 

Assembly-work is available in. 
Western Washtenaw County. No ex-

—perionce—neodedr Long and short 
term positions open. 
Applications accepted Mon.-Thurs., 

—B:3ato 11 o,m. and 1:30-3^0^0^231 
Little Lake Dr., Ann Arbor. 665-3757. 
For details and-directions cdtT 
761-5627. 

MANPOWER 
c12-3 

769-1400 
40-

EXCELLENT 
Manchester Schools 

Lovely park-like setting on paved 
rood. .20 acres with mature trees, 
sprlng.fed ponds, barn, fenced 
patures, and wildlife galore. 
Beautiful 2,200 sq. ft. ranch, 3 to 4 
bedrooms, 2 baths, family room with 
fireplace, large kitchen, dining 
room, sunken living room, first floor 
laundry. Overslie garage. Asking 

, te//y ^oU 
(343) 475-7236 

u&ti€ti 3£cm&to€&n 
Sffaecdwtibt 

LAKE FRONT 
Cozy 2 Bedroom year around 
home on the ever popular Cavan­
augh Lake, at an affordable price. 
$87,900. 

CLASSIC 
This older Chelsea home has 
original woodwork hardwood 
floor, beautiful open stairway 
leads to 3 spacious bedrooms, 
bath with ceramic tile floor. A 
must see at $119,500. 

LAKI ACC1SS 
2 bedroom charmer, hdwd floor, 
fireplace, full basement, updated 
mechanics. Lg. lot $99,500. 

PAVID ROAD 
CmiSIA SCMOOtS-

Call 428-7431 
•clO 

1 9 8 9 B ! R r r T A p — — 
Red. 5-speed. . $4,975 

1992 LUMINA EURO 
Red or gray. 112,875 

7128-7140 
Dexter-Ann Arbor Rd. 

in Hhtorie totter 

Ph. 426-4677J 

* 3 P ^ 
Landscape 

personalized 
professional 

service 

• Design Consultation * Finish Grading • Wild flowers 
•Plant Installation •Rototilling • Brick Pathways 
• Retaining Walls. • Hydro Seeding 

(313) 428-7005 

4 BR Cape Cod, 2¼ baths. Formal 
dining, plaster walls, cove ceil­
ings, full basement, ' lots of 
storage on 2 acres. $109,900. 

COUNTRY CONTEMPORARY 
The heart of the Waterloo Rec. 
Area holds this unusual. 4 BR 
home with hardwood 4 ceramic 
tile floors, cathedral ceilings and 
full walkout basement on 6 acres 
adj. to wildlife area. $139,900. 

BLIND LAKI 
A truly private ond hidden lake, 
well built 2 BR home with hard­
wood floors. Full length enclosed 
porch. Beautiful wooded setting, 
on approx. 1 acre with over 100 
ft. of waterfront. ' 

TAM A DRIVI 
down a country lane to wonderful 
1880's American farm home. 3 
bedrooms. 2 full baths, updated 
THfeRenT newer mechanics. A 
must see. $115,000, 

C1NT1NNIAL FARM 
Beautifully r«Vnodeled. Feoturet 
all original oak woodwork. Very 
spacious country kitchen with all 
built-ins. Master bath with 
whirlpool tub. Formal dining 
room. Family room wjth stone 
fireplace. Plus 45x80 barn, 
workshop and 2¼-car garage. In 
scenic Waterloo Rec. Area. Land 
contract possible. $279,000. 

I f AUT1FUL 4.SSDROOM 
Hardwood floors, 2¼ baths, 
fireplace In L.R., full basement, 
hot water heat. All on 5 acres. 
$139,900. Seller will consider L.C. 
ANN ARBOR OFFICII 945-1616 
KHJAl HOUSfNO OPPORTUNITY 

MINT CONDITION •> RIADY FOR YOUl Beautifully decorated 
3-bedroom ranch in Grass Lake. Family room, 2 full baths, full 
walkout basement. Quality thru-out this home w/many extras: 
plaster cove ceilings, centra vac system. 26x26 heated 2¼-car 
garage. Walking distance to public access to Grass Lake. 89,900. 
PAUL 475-2621.. 
RIDUCID TO 87,500 this very nice 3-bedroom ranch on quiet cul-de-
sac In the Village. Nice family room/woodburner, 1 '/> baths, nice kit­
chen w/eatlng space. l'/»-cor garage & nice yard. 87,500. BOB 
231-9777. 
LOVILV COUNTRY StTTINO) for 2,200 s.f. builder's home on 2.5 ac. 
Oak trim thru-out. 5 BRs, 3 baths, two family rooms—1 up 
w/fireplace & one on lower level. Formal dining rm, llv rm. 2 decks. 
2-car garage. 34x34 wood barn w/200 amp elec. service. 4 ml. SE of 
Chelsea/paved rood. 169,900. HERM 475-2613. 
SPRBAD THI WORD! A 2-BR cottage w/40' frontage on prestigious 
NORTH LAKE is avoilable w/good beach S dock. On 1 ae. 8 only 
117,000. BOB 231-9777. 
WHAT A BUYI HILLTOP SITTING w/view of Chelsea, just outside 
Village) limits. 5 BRs, 2¼ baths, fomlly room. Beautiful Inground pool. 
2¼-cor garage. On 24- aeres. REDUCED TO 147,900. JOHN 475-2064. 
FRISHLY PAINTID IXTUtrOt makes this very nice3 BR quality ranch 
even more attractive. Great for young family w/fenced yard. Nice 
family room w/coty woodstove, formal dining rm. 2 car art. garage 
on 1+ ac. A real treasure for the discerning buyer. 98,900. BILL 
475-9771. 
WOULDN'T A l&B IN CHBLUA Rl WONDItFULf This large 2,560 
s.f. home would fit the biH! 4 BRs, formal dining rm, 2 fomlly rms. In 
an excellent location. Needs some TLC, 117,900. CHUCK 475-3889. 
OLDIR HOMI, PARTIALLY t IMODiUD. NtlDS TLC. On 5 ac. 
w/stocked pond 8 wooded state land at rear 8 east boundaries. 3/4 
mi. off M-52. 2 BRs. Fireplace A 1-car garage. 65,000. JO ANN 
475-8674. 
IP YOU ARI A NATURILOVIR, this home is for you! Extremely nice 
3 BR ranch adjacent to state land 4 wildlife preserve. 2Vfc baths; Ige 
kitchen w/dlnlng area .overlooking I'/i-aere pond. Living 
room/flreptaci S family rm w/beautlful' crown fireplace. 2¼ cor 
garage. On 8 acres. 133,500. JIM 475-2685. 
M l US FOR YOUR LAND NIIDS. We have a large Inventory of va-
cdnTldnd. ' 

PIERSON 
nates 

935 Main Street, Chelsea MI (313) 475*8681 

_H Chelsea's 1st - established 1964 H 

FRISINGERS 

Paul Frlslnger.... 
Norm O'Connor. 
Herm Koenn — 
Jim Utsfer 
Bill Dorwln-

.475-2621 John Pierson. 475-2064 

. 475-7252 Joann Worywoda 475-8674 
.475-2613 Bob Koch 231-9777 
,475-2685 Chuck Beck 475-3889 
.4759771 
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LITTLE W A N T A D S ! BIG PLUSES FOR BIG RESULTS! 
Washtenaw County's Busy marketplace . Quick, economical Results Give'ematryl . . . Ph. 475-137J 

Help Wanted 

COUNTRYSIDE BUILDERS need full-
and part-time laboror. Call 

473-9153. |Q 
MIKE'S DELI — Mon.-Frl. 9 a.m. to 

* ££>« «omo Saturdays. Call 
475-5980 or stop In at 114 N. Main (In 
The Sylvan). Choi too. n-2 
TWE WASHTENAW-WAYNE ASCSoHko 

1» accepting applications for a part, 
tlmo petition of Field Assistant. Ap-
plicotloni can bo obtained at tho of­
fice, located at 7215 Jockton Rd., 
Ann Arbor, or coll 662-3900. clQ-2 

RNorLPN 
Locking for a caring, warm at­
mosphere where the patient comes 
first? Join our own team at C.R.C. 
Competitive wages. Afternoon shift 
and float pool positions available. 
Apply at: 

Chelsea Retirement 
Community 
805 W. Middle St., 
Chelsea, Ml 48118 

E.O.E. 
=«10*2-

LIGHT ASSEMBLY 
No experience needed. Con go per-
manent. $4.60 per hour. Call 
769-4802. 

LEE TEMPORARIES 
' cU-4 

SUMMER JOBS 
$240 per week to start 

local company now has 8 full-time 
• and 4 part-time positions available In 
our Customer Service Dept. Excellent 
profit-sharing program and produc­
tion bonus. 
By appointment only. 
For Interview call (517) 782-7178 be-
tween 10 a.m; and 8 p.m. 
__ clQ-3 

NOW HIRING — for new Toco Bell 
at Zeeb and Jackson Rds. Apply at 

2280 W. Stadium, Ann Arbor. Call 
663-4764. ¢10-3 

Npw^Hirino^for^— 
ASSISTANT CHILD CARE PROVIDER — 

Monday-Friday, 9 a.m. to 2 p.m. 
Beginning Sept. 7. Prefer mature 
women. Must be reliable. Call 
475-3413. T0U~ 
SUBSTITUTE BUS DRIVERS: Chelsea 

School District. Call Sally Proctor, 
475-7647. Chelsea Bus Garage, 14138 
OldUS-12. 14-12 
SUBSTITUTE SPECIAL EDUCATION Bus 

Monitor: Chelsea School District. 
Call Sally Proctor, 475-7647. Chelsea 
BusGarofle, 14138QldUS-12. 14-12. 
A LOCAL BRANCH of Michigan Corp-

oration needs to fill several full-
and part-time positions. Excellent 
work conditions and advancement 
opportunities. No experience neces­
sary, will train. For Interview call 
between 11 cnd4,(S17)782-7329.39tf 

Accepting Applications 
For All Positions 

Apply In person. 

Chelsea Big Boy 

New Taco Bell 
at Zeeb & Jackson Rd. 

Shift monager wanted: 
Apply of 2280 W. Stadium, Ann Arbor 

clO-5 

NO LAYOFFS 
Local Distributor for 55-year-old 
manufacturing firm has 6 permanent 
fu l l - t ime posi t ions . Salory, 
guaranteed, benefits, company 
training, management opportunity.' 

For Interview call (517) 782-7178 
Mon. thru FN., 1 p.m. to 5 p.m. 1 4 3 ^ 

CHILD CARE provider wanted for in­
fant twins in our Dexter home. 30 

to 40 hours per week. Experience 
and references required. Call 
426.5321. -clQ.2 
CHILD CARE In my home, eges 6 

weeks to 6 years. Full-and part* 
time available. Reasonable rates. 
Call 475-3134. -1Q.2 
LITTLE RED CABOOSE DAYCARE -

Quality Care at Greet Prices. We 
have 3 full-time openings for children 
18 mo*, and older. Pro-school ac­
tivities featuring Kapers for Kids, 
fenced play yard and morel Call 
475-3415. JIM 
LICENSED DAYCARE In my home. 

Country setting. Reasonable rotes. 
Coil 426-5284. e l M 
FULL-TIME OPENINGS available In my 

licensed Dexter family day care 
home. Great location. Lots of TLC. 
426-4138. cU-10 

Chelsea Community Hospital 
CHILDREN'S CENTER 
Ages 2¼ weeks to 5th grade 

Openings as ovullobli 

475-3922 
37tf 

Wanted 

Volunteers Needed 
Enthusiastic, organized volunteer 
needed to co-ordinate volunteer ac­
tivities for the Western Washtenaw 
Recycling Authority. Major tasks in­
clude publicity ana education of the 
public regarding cureside and drop­
off recycling programs to begin this 
fall. Core group of 20 volunteers 
needs new direction. Other volun 

Building For Sale 
The following buildings located In 
Plnckney Recreation Area are being 
offered for bid sale. 
BLDG. NO. 1—34x24 2-story frame 
house. 
8LDG. NO. 2—20x30 garage, pole 
bom construction. 
Both buildings ore being bid as a 
package; and both buildings need to 
be removed. 
Neither building may be moved to a 
new location within the Plnckney 
Recreation Area project boundaries. 
Site clean-up will be provided by the 
successful bidder. Clean-up will In­
clude covering oil foundations and 
removal of all building materials. 
Building removal and site clean-up 
must be completed by Feb. 15, 1993. 
Minimum bid will be $1,000. 
Bids will be accepted until Aug. 14, 
1992. 
The State of Michigan reserves the 
right to accept or reject any^r_otl 

SANDI'S WORDPROCESSING -
Resumes, letters, mailings, re­

ports, transcription, editing, laser. 
426-5217. C36-52 
CUSTOM PIPE CUTTING and thread­

ing, '/»" to 2". Johnson's How-To-
Store. 110 N. Main, Chelsea. Ph. 
475-7472. 25tf 
SHARPENING SERVICE ovoilable. We 

sharpen almost a n y t h i n g . 
Johnson's How-To-Store, 110 N. 
Main, Chelsea. 25tf 

Cor pentty/Con st ruction 

HOME 
TUNE-UPS 

by 

TARGET 
CONSTRUCTION 

• Home Maintenance 
big & small 

-ftXomplete-

THANK YOU 
The Class of 1982 Reunion Com­

mittee would like to thank the 
following: Chelsea Milling Co., 
Gina's Cafe, Gemini, Klink Ex­
cavating, Dale and Kathy 
Schumann, and all the other area 
merchants for their contribu­
tions. Your help was much ap­
preciated! 

Please Notify Us of 
Any Change in Address 

i ,•" 

RESTAURANT 
1610 S. Main St., Chelsea 

c47tf 

SALES ASSISTANT Wanted — Part-
time position ovoilable with local 

builder. Must be neat and courteous. 
Hourly wage plus bonus. Call Bob at 
Quality Properties, 426-8858. clQ-2 

PHOTO TRIMMERS 

R^T^*-****-
Call 1-800-262-4389 

C12 

OFFICE HELP NEEDED — In a small 
-but busy retail business. Duties in--

elude phones, billing, cash register. 
~Mrot1Je dependable, energetrc end 

able to work well with people. 
Hours: Mon.-Frl. 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m.,. 
every other Saturday, 9 to 3. Apply in 
person at Diamond Gloss ond 
Pernor's, 2350 W. Liberty, Ann Arbor, 
Ml dO-2 

Work Wanted 

HOUSECLEANING — Dependable! 11 
years experience, reosonoble 

rotes. (313)428-9691. -c13-4 

ANN'S QUALITY SB?VICE 
Cleaning Service for residential, 
business offices. Also house-sitting. 
Free estimate. Call 475-8394. 

' <1_4 
WE'LL WASH S WAX your car, at your 

Chelsea-area home. $15. Call 475-
4409. ^J0 
CLEANING — Home/office. Chelsea-

Dexter area. Call 473-2066. -c10-3 
TEAM OF TWO will clean your home. 

We do everything. Reosonoble. 
Very thorough. Weekly; bi-weekly or 
monthly. CalTKarenot 475-S9M.-c11 -2 

teers needed. 
475-6160. 

For information or inspection of the 
buildings, please contact: 
PARK MANAGER 
Plnckney Recreation Area 
8555 Silver Hill 
Plnckney, Ml 48169 
313-426-4913 

clO 
Personal 

SINGLES DATELINE matches you to 
to perfect fun motel Recorded 

message 1-800-775-7496, ext. 5009. 
_ _ _ , _ -clO 
SAVE OUR CHILDREN — Stop porno-

grophy. Porn contributes to child 
~1 

Home Improvement 
For a free estimate call 475-1928. 

Guaranteed work. 
_ — -clO 

B&B 
REMODELING 

All phases of 

Residential Building 
• NEW HOMES • RENOVATIONS 

f REE ESTIMATES - LOW RATES 
We will do our best to beat any 

reasonable written estimate. 

10 
Cenloci^JeifZ^itll^^ «iets worse. Porn is no different. In-

ormation: American Family Associa­
tion, Washtenaw County Chapter, 
Box 15134, Ann Arbor, Ml 48106.-10-4 

WANTED — Empty building or 
born In Chelsea! 2nd or 3rd week 

in October. Send Info, to: Chelsea 
Lions Club, P.O. Box 121, Chelsea, Ml 
48118, or call Rodger Dymond, 
475-3749. 1£2 
BUYING ALL TYPES of horses and 

ponies. References available. Ph. 
(313) 437-2857 or 437-1337. -c!3-8 

Wanted to Rent 

3-BEDROOM HOME - Chelsea School 
District. Needed immediately. 

References. Call 475-7698. clO 

L l c N o . 2102076245, INSURED 
Bruce Bennett 475-9370 
Bob Usher 517-522-5811 

• 14-10 

Child Care 

Day Care with Care 
Licensed. Excellent rotes. Experienc­
ed. Loving care and personal often-
tlbn. Doxtor„426-0369. clO 
SITTER NEEDED — Saturdays, 9:45 to 

10:45 o._m. of the Outback Gym, 
Dexter. Must' Have own transporta­
tion. Call 475-0112 after 5 p.m. for 
details. c11-2 
HAVE BEEN BABYSITTING 2 children, 

for over 7 years, they have grown 
up. Would like to babysit more 
children. Walking distance to North 
school. Call 475-2673. -10 

For Rent 

3-BEDROOM, year-round, on-the-loko, 
close to 1-94 exit 145, $500/mo. 

plus utilities, deposits, references, 
no pets, lease, (517) 522-8867. -clO 
CHELSEA AREA — Cavanaugh Lake 

2-bedroom home. Sept. to June. 
Coll (313)464-7984,397-1588. -cll-2 
APARTMENT 1N CHELSEA —- Spacious 

1-bedroom. Heat and water fur­
nished. $480 per month plus security 
deposit. Coll 475-8483 after 6 p.m. 
Week days, onytlme week-ends,clOtf 
ATTRACTIVE OFFICE SPACE for rent. 

Downtown Chelsea. Clerical 
-oitlttdnce available, Call 475-3701. 

*11;2 

Entertainment 

Rent 
JUKE BOX 

PINBALL & VIDEO 
GAMES 

Home • Business 
Great for 

Parties • Receptions • Reunions 
Select your choice of music 
and save a lot of money! 

ZEMKE 
OPERATED MACHINES 

6 ^ 6 6 2 0 7 ^ ^ ^ 1 0 1 1 ^ - 1 '• 
c36tf 

BY OWNER — Dexter schools. Older 
5 to.6 bedroom home, 2 full baths, 

2,500 sq. ft. 2.5 acres. Gas-forced 
air. Some updates, needs some 

Excavating/Landscaping 

Jack's Tree Removal 
• Fast, courteous service 
• 50' boom 

U.S. Savings 
Bonds make 
good business 
sense/ 
Caff todayto find 
out just how much 
Bonds can do 
for 

1-800-US-BONDS 

M/C/7-CAN 

Statewide 
Ad Network 

Automobiles - 1 9 8 8 - 9 2 . 
models. No Down Payment. -
No credit check. Assume . 
payments on financially dis- --
tressed cars and trucks. For ' 
information call 1-800-753- -
3974. 24Hrs. 

Friendly Home Parties Has 
Openings for demonstrators. 
No cash investment. No ser­
vice charge. High commis­
sion and hostess awards. 
Two catalogs, over 600 items. .,-^ 
Call 1-800-488-4875. .^1 * * 

Truck Driving Training: Voir 
can be CDL certified in 8 
weeks. Job placement, finan­
cial aidavailable for those who 
qualify. 1-800-325-6733/-
Eaton Roadranger Training-, 
Institute. 

Cadillac Area -Ten acres 
wooded, rolling. Best hunting, 
close to state forest. Good 
county road access, $6,995/-' 
$500 down, $125 per month -
on a 10% land contract., Call 
Wildwood Lane 
3122. 9 a.m. to 9 p.m. 

Happy Jack Tabllcks: Prevent -
fleas Mother Nature's way 
without pesticides. Chewabte A7? ' 
nutritious tablet. For dogs &'•'•*• 
cats. At Farmland Co-ops. "> " 

* ••• t: 

Ph. 475-1026 
after 6 p.m. 

10 

PETER YOUNG 
Custom Builder 

Specializing In Home Restoration 
• Affordable Additions • New Homes 

looting •Siding • Replacement Windows A Dooro 
• Contemporary Spacious Kitchens • Oramic Tile 

We7/ bmof any qualifying, written •itfmott 
PHONE (313) 475-7*366 

LICENSED (No. 079558) INSURED 

TRUE CHELSEA CHARMER—on oversized lot. 4 bedrooms, 1.5 baths, 
walk to schools and downtown. Beautifully maintained ready for the 
family. $149,500. Call Today. DIANE BICE 475-8091. 
HORSE LOVERS! — 5 bedroom, 2.5 bath home on 5+ acres. Pole bam 
with stalls, electric and waier and fenced psiture! Priced to sell r $149,900. 
ANNA SHEAR 426-0428. 
ENJOY A FANTASTIC SETTING EVERYDAY! — Pines surround 
this wonderful 6 year old ranch. 3 bedrooms, 2 baths and a 24x32 pole barn 
on 3.22.acres. 1 mile from 1-94. Chelsea, $109,900. 
SANDY BALL 475-2603. (20884) 
JUMPINYOUROOLFCART^andofftothefirstteeon Inverness. This 
2 bedroom home also has access on North Lake. Fireplace, lots of storage, 
extra garage space. $134,000. Call HELEN LANCASTER 475-1198. 
ALMOST NEW! — Great starter or retirement home with 3 bedrooms, 2 
baths, skylights, attached garage, close to 1-94,30 minutes from Ann Arbor. 
$88,900. Call NORMA KERN 475-8132.(20861) 
ENJOY SUMMER ON BEAUTIFUL CLEAR LAKE—Cozy 2 bedroom 
at end of private road has dock and boat lift. Bring the family and 
$134,900. Chelsea Schools. Call STEVE or ANNA BASUDES 428-9470. 
(20135) 
WOODEDPRTVATESETTINO—"ontheedgeofChelseaVillage. Paved 
cul-de-sac, underground utilities. Priced from $32,000. DARLABOHLEN-
DER 475-1478. 

3-BEDROOM COUNTRY HOME on 8 
acres. Pool with now deck. Dining 

room, 1¼ baths, 22 miles southwest 
of Chelsea. $600 per month. 
References required. Possible op-
tlon. (517) 764-3079. -cll-2 
2-BEDROOM HOME — Chelsea 

Village. $600 + credit report, in­
cludes neat. No pets. 
1-BEDROOM APT. in Chelsea. 

Ground floor. $425 + credit 
report, Includes heat. No pets. 
Reply in writing to Box 92, c/o The 
Chelsea Standard, 300 N. Main St., 
Chelsea, MI48118-1502. 
, clp 
2-BEDROOM LAKE HOUSE - Fully, 

carpeted. Stove, refrigerator fur­
nished. Washer/dryer hook-ups. 
Ideal for single person or couple. 
$540 per month, security deposit re-
quired. Ph. 475-7533. £10 
VEGETABLE GARDEN and lots of 

flowers. Cozy 2-bedroom with 
hardwood floors. Basement with 
laundry hook-ups, garage. Near 
Jackson and Zeeb Rds. Available 
Sept. 1. No pets. $595 plus utilities. 
Coll 763-8732 or426-2145. -clO 
1-BEDROOM - FURNISHED apartment 

3 miles south of Dexter. $425 per 
month includes utilities. 475-3088. 

<lp 
APARTMENT - Upper 2-bedroom, 
—Vibteekfrpflrdowntown Chetsear 
$470/mo. plus utilities. (313) 
231-2152. c l l j 
BEAUTIFUL 1-BEDROOM apart­

ment — lakefront. No deposit. 
$480. Colt (313) 426-9214^ clO 
OFFICE SPACE for Rent — Located 

off Jackson Ave., between Baker 
and Zeeb Rds.. on quiet cul-de-sac 

repairs. 1142,900. Call 426-5783 oT 
(313)481-1624.- ._ dO-6. 

Bus. Services 

SEEDING - SODDING 
Hydro-seeding • Drilled seeding 

Final A finish grades • York Raking 

TREES - SHRUBS 
Flower bed • Wlldflower Areas 

RETAINING WALLS 
Timber • Stone • Cast Block 

DRIVEWAYS 
Gravel • Stone • limestone 

—PAVE&8RICKS 

Gregory L. Johnson 
Realtor® 

475-0100 
OTMttMrrv 

N I I D TO SILL YOUR HOME* There's a lot more to It than a sign in the 
front yard. As an agent thot cares about people before profit, I go 
above and beyond in my marketing approach. Let me show you how 
this marketing strategy con get your home "SOLD", even In today's 
market. It all starts by colling me ot 475-01001 

»tlos-»-Drlvewoys-

General 

WALLPAPERING — Experienced, 
references, free estimates. Call 

Charlene Myers (517) 851 -7465. -11-4 
PAINTING —-Interior, eKterior, also 

painted wall patterns. Insured. 
Free estimates. Since 1974. John Llx-
ey, 475-2750. -19-13 
ROOFING — Barns, homes, roof re­

pairs of all types. 17 yrs. ex­
perience. Licensed, free estimates. 
Kirk Randall, 428-0163. -10-4 

RESIDENTIAL PAINTING 
Interior * Exterior 

Free Estimates 
Call 475-4428 
JoeZielinskl 

OM 

WORD PROCESSING 
BUSINESS a PERSONAL 

Resumes, Flyers, Letters, Newsletters, 
menus; Plot Charts & Spread sheets. 

HP Laser Jet* Reasonable Rates 
Call (313) 498-3463 

•clO-6 
FIELD MOWING — 6 ft. Brush Hog. 

Many references. 475-2189 or 
475-8312; -12-10 
TYPEWRITERS REPAIRED — IBM and 

others. Rentals, All guaranteed. 
Ph. 475*9965. -11-10 

Building Site Planning 

Landscape Design/Dravvings 
LANDSCAPE MATERIALS 

- Engelbert 
Landscape Service 

475-2695 
local References Available 

Free Estimates 
c45tf 

-GRASS HYDRO SEEDING, finish 
grading, rototilling, field mowing. 

Coll 475-0040. C3323 
LITTLE WACK EXCAVATING — 

Licensed & Insured. Basements, 
Drolnflelds, Digging, Bulldozing, 
Trenching, Black Dirt, Sand, Gravel. 
Paul Wackenhut, (313) 475-8526 or 
428-8025. 

23tf 

CHELSEA REALTY, INC 
OPEN SUN 1-5 

•*• 

.% 

W 4 4 IV1V. CHI IS IA COUNTRY 
FAMILY HOME—Beautifully landscaped 3 bed, 2 both, bi-level on 2 + 
acres. GARDEN SPOT & STREAM I Woodstove in lower level. New 
carpeting in bedrooms. Deck I $112,500 Dlr: N on Main to W on Werkner 
to Ivey. Ron Hopp (eves.) 1-313-482-0627 (ML25741CS). 

. -^ 
SAND GRAVEL 

KLINK 
EXCAVATING 

ana *ooo Has., on quier cui-ae-sac , . . . » ^ ^ ^ - > » • • -
with plentiful parking. 1,500 sq. f t , L I M E S T O N E 

Bulldozer — Backhoe 
Road Work — Basements 
Trucking — Crane Work 
top Soil — Demolition 

Dratnfleld — Septic Tank 
Trenching, 5" up 

Industrial, Residential, Commercial 
CALL 475-7631 
•• — : Wtf-

4600 M-52, STOCKBRIDO! COUNTRY 
(15 minutes N off Chelsea) 

ALMOST 3 ACRES—Room for a family mslde & out. 2 BR + study 
down. Roughly finished room for 1 or 2 more bedrooms upstairs!! 
WOODS! $69,000. Dlr: M-52 N near Green Rd. intersection. Sharon 
Roberts (eves.) 475-5778 (ML24878CS). 

_̂̂ -__ 
TK 

1 
*ff 

Jk4 «. 

v 

• ' 

\ 
1 

I 
1 

\ 
\ 

SPEAR 
ASSOCIATES! 
I N C . R E A L T O R S 

Formerly 
Thornton Realtors, Inc. 

CHELSEA 
323 S. Main 

475-9193 
EBtSr 

Sandy Bell 
Diane Bice 
Dsrls Bohlender 
Terry Chase 
Peggy Cum 
Charles DeOryse 
AnnaBasudes 

Steve Easudes 
Leah Herrick 
Norma Kern 

. Mania Klpfmiller 
Helen Lancaster 
Glenn* Runciman 
Anna Shear 

•> 

Wil l i piwil l l iwi p w i m n y . > , w v aiq. •>• 
separate offices, storage space. 
Carpeted. $800 per month, available 
now. Cell 761-1990. c1JN2 
STOCKBRIDGE — 1- to 2-bedroom 

home, upper level, nice. $345. Call 
(313)878-2171. 10 
2-BEDROOM APT. fo r ren t . 

Ph. 475-7061. 'ClO-3 
STOCKBRIDGE — Duplex, 2 bed­

rooms, laundry area, clean, nice 
setting In town, new carpet, $475. 
Ph.(313)697-7187. 6tf 
STOCKBRIDGE — Duplex, 2 bed-

' rooms, laundry area, clean, nice 
setting In town, new carpet, $475. 
Ph.(313)697-7187. 5tf 
FOR RENT — Fair Service Center 

for meetings, parties, wedding 
receptions, etc. Weekdays or week­
ends. Contact Cheryl Haab, 475-2548 
after 6 p.m. e20tf 

BAND 
DATERS 

•Letter Band Numberers . 
•Vertical Numberers 
•Alphabet Stamps 
•Alpha-Numerals 
•Locel Daters or Numberers 

JES-KEY 
GRAPHIC SERVICES 

(517) 263-1322 
4 1 0 * N. ADRIAN HWY. 
ADRIAN, MICH. 4 0 * 2 1 

Hauled and spread for a better 
driveway. Free Estimates. 

Call Randy Luick 
(313)475-9404 

' ; C14-14 
HAULING, yard and tree work, paint-

ing, roofing, decks, docks, odd 
l o b s . . F r e e est imates. 1(517) 
769-67¾. -10-4 

We Offer 
Sales & Service 

RCA - ZENITH • Phllco • Quasar - Sony 
B « W and Color TVs • 

NuTone - Chonnelmasfer 
Wlngord • Cobra CB Radios -
Master Antenna Specialists 

Antenna Rotor Insurance Job 
Commercial; Residential 
Paging Intercom Systems 

NuTone Parts and Service Center 
Hoover Vacuum Dealers 
and Service Specialists 

Keys by Curtis 
We service other leading brands 

Senior Citizens 10% Discount. 

LOY'S TV CENTER 
512 N. Maple Rd., Ann Arbor 

n 

Repairs 

T. Weakley 
COMMERCIAL & RESIDENTIAL 

REPAIRS 
• ROOFING 

Specializing In flat roofs 
• PAINTING 
• INSURANCE WORK 

Free Estimates 

«07 W. Ma in , STOCK BR I DO I VILLAGE 
HUGE CORNER LOT—Chdrmlng older home In "tip-top" condition. 3 
bedrooms w/hardwood. Freshly decorated. Includes first floor laun­
dry/mud room/holf bath! Walk safety to schools. Garden for your 
harvest. $72,900. Dir: From central 4-corners go W 2 blocks. Wm. Hopp 
(eves.) 1-517-596-2505 (ML25894CS). 

(517) 851-4012 
•el 0-3 

•AUTO 
• Windshield Stone Chips Repaired 
• Auto Glass Replaced 

• HOME 

769-0198 
Master Charge, Visa Welcome 

37tf 

• Storms ft Screens 
repelred or custom-made 

• Thermopones Replaced 

Chelsea Glass 
140 W. Middle St. • 475-8667 

. 23tf 

Drivers Go To Work Immedf. 
itely. Roadrunner Distribu­
tions Services, Inc. TN — 
t . 800-444-6147. TX — 1-
800-285-8267. Competitive 
pay, new conventionale, 
medteal/oental/vacation, etc... 
sign on bonus. EOE. 

(25 minute* N off Chelate) 
AFFORDABLE—A little decorating will make this 2-3 bedroom really 
nice! Comes with appliances. Low $748 per year taxes! Wow! Now us­
ed as 3 bedroom (could be 2 bed + 1st floor foundry). Convenience 
store neorby. $49,900. Dlr: f rom Chelsea go N^d M-52 1o E on 
Werkner/Stofer across Territorial N past North Lake to Unadllla. N, to 
W on Doyle through Gregory Village ond the N 3 moremiles on M-36. 
All blOcktop roods! Jack Bllnn (eves.) 475-7543 (M124851CSJ7T" 
ATTINTIONI Any property listed with any Realty Firm Is available 
through our office. Call us for information on ANYBODY'S SIGN! 

Carit us with ALL of vow Rsxri Estate needs. 
We are open 7 days a week for you—the buying and selling public. 
Modern office with air conditioning, paved parking and so easy to 
f lnd-MIDWAY BETWEEN OLD US-12 AND 1-94. LOOK for the BIG 
YELLOW & BLUE SIGN. 

HOMES MAGAZINES AVAILAI4.I 24-HOUtS A DAY 
AT OUR FRONT DOORI 

1414 S. Main St. Chelsea, M 48118 
CcsB 475-HOME (4663) Anytime 

mm mtmmm mm ^ t f ^ ^ M M nee 
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Legal Notice Legal Notice 
MORTGAGE SALE-Default having been made 

In the terms and conditions of a certain mortgage 
made by GERALD L. ZONCA, a single person, 
Mortgagor, to STANDARD FEDERAL SAVINGS 
ANTVLOAN ASSOCIATION, now known as 
STANDARD FEDERAL BANK, a federal savings 
bank, of Troy, Oakland County, Michigan, Mort­
gagee, dated November 10, IMS, and recorded In 
the office of the Register of Deeds for the County of 
Washtenaw and State of Michigan, on November 
31,1963, in Liber 1901, on Page 161, of Washtenaw 
County* Records, on which mortgage there is 
claimed to be due, at the date of this notice, for.., 
principal and interest, the sum of Fifty-«lght Thou­
sand Seven Hundred Thirteen and 39/100 Dollars 
(186,713.39); 

And no suit or proceedings at law or in equity 
having been instituted to recover the debt secured 
by said mortgage or any part thereof. Now, 
Therefore, by virtue of the power of sale contained 
in said mortgage, and pursuant to the statute of the 
State of Michigan in such case made and provided, 
notice is hereby given that on Thursday, August 20, 
1993, at ten o'clock in the forenoon, local time, said 
mortgage wttl be foreclosed by a sale at public auc­
tion totbe highest bidder, in the main lobby of the 
Washtenaw County Courthouse, Huron Street en-
trancefiotbeCuyofAnaArbuvWaahtena* Coun­
ty, Michigan, of the premises described in said 
mortgage, or so much thereof as may be necessary 
to pay the amount due, as aforesaid, on said mort* 
gage, with the interest thereon at 8.630 percent per 
annum and all legal costs, charges and expenses, 
Including the attorney fees allowed by law, and 
also any sum or sums which may be paid by the 
undersigned, necessary to protect its interest in 
the premises, which said premises are described 
at follows: 

All that certain piece or parcel of land situate in 
the Ctty of Ann Arbor, in the County of Washtenaw, 
and State of Michigan, and described as follows: 

Unit 21, ALPINE CONDOiDNTUM, according to 
Master Deed recorded in Liber 1713, Pages 878-939, 
inclusive, Washtenaw County Records, and any 
amendments thereto, and designated as Wash­
tenaw County Condominium Subdivision Plan No. 
39, together with rights in general common 
oUymfrtff and limited common elements as set 

-^rrthtnlftfabjfftMgmtrPwd and as described in 

MORTGAGE SALE-Default his been made in 
the conditions of a mortgage made by RICHARD 
W. SLAQENWHTTE and SUSAN L SLAGEN* 
WHITE, his wife, to First Federal of Michigan, 
Mortgagee, dated September 2,1988, and recorded 
on September 8.1988, in liber 2298, on page 6» , 
Washtenaw County Records, Michigan, on which 
mortgage there is claimed to be due at the date 
hereof the sum of Forty-Seven Thousand Four 
Hundred Thirty-One and 07/100 Dollars 
(647,431.01), toctattug interest at 10.80ft per an­
num. 

Under the power of sale contained in said mort­
gage awl the statute in such case made and provid­
ed, notice Is hereby given that said mortgage will 
be foreclosed by a sate of the mortgaged premises, 
or some part of them, at public vendue, at the main 
lobby of the Washtenaw County Court House, 
Huron St entrance in Ann Arbor, Michigan, at 
10:00 o'clock ajn., Local Time, on August a7l99J. 

Said premises are situated in the Township of 
Superior, Washtenaw County, Michigan, and are 
described as: 

Lot 830, Woodland Acres No. 10. as recorded in 
Liber 22 of Plats, Pages 31,32, and 33, Washtenaw 
County Records. 

Tax Code: 1044-283-013. 
During the six months immediately following the 

sale, the property may be redeemed. 
Dated: June 23,1992. 

FIRST FEDERAL OF MICHIGAN 
1001 Woodward Avenue ' 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

Mortgagee 
N.MICHAEL HUNTER (P292S6) 
1001 Woodward, 4W 
Detroit, MI 48226 

Julyl-6-15-22-29 

Mich-CAN 
Statewide 

Ad Network 

4. 

Act 56 of the Public ActsoTi 
During the six months immediately following the 

sale, the property may be redeemed, except that in 
the event mat the property is determined to be 
abandoned pursuant to MCLA 600.3241a, the prop-„ 
erty may be redeemed during the 30 days im­
mediately following the sale. 

Dated at Troy, Michigan, May 29,1992. 
STANDARD FEDERAL BANK, 
a federal savings bank, 
Mortgagee 

RONALD J, PALMER 
Attorney for Mortgagee 
3600 West Big Beaver Road 
Troy. Michigan 48084 

. . - JulylS-22-29.Aug5.12 

MORTGAGE SALE-Default having been made 
in the terms and conditions of a certain mortgage 
made by ROBERT J. SULLIVAN and KATHLEEN 
I., WVVY*!", Ht ""» Mnrtgngnr. t* STAND-

STATE OF MICHIGAN 
Probate Court ' 

County of Washtenaw 
PUBLICATION AND 

NOTICE OF HEARING 
FileNo.9M93M.NC 

In the matter of LYNN CHRISTINE GOMULKA. 
TAKE NOTICE: On August 18,1992 at 9:00 ajn., jU^gj^ - . ^ - — • . . - . . . 

sement Walls - Cracking 
or Bulging • We can fix them 
without digging • Economical. 
Guaranteed - Free Estimates. 
Timbertown Water Control 
Chimney Relining — 1-800-
832-7060, Detroit area — 1-
800-747-2688. 

Executive Sales • Commis­
sion + Bonus. Selling to busi­
ness owners. Management 
opportunities • Benefits. 34-
year-old Legislative Research 
Firm. Send resume to: Na­
tional "Write Your Con­
gressman," Inc., 12115 Self 
Plaza, Pallas, Texas 75218. 

Wanted: Salesperson with 
sales background for Safety 
equipment and Supplies 
directed towards utility, chemi­
cal, marine, metropolitan, 
state agencies. Set own 
financial limits. Minority Busi­
ness. Box 750, Fremont, In­
diana, 46737. 

ARD FEDERAL BANK, a federal savings bank, of 
Troy, Oakland County, Michigan, Mortgagee, 
dated June 36,1989, and recorded in the office of 
the Register of Deeds for the County of Washtenaw 
and State of Michigan, on July 19,1989, in Liber 
2333, on Page 122, of Washtenaw County Records, 
on which mortgage there is claimed to be due, at 
the date of this notice, for principal and interest, 
the sum of Eighty-three Thousand Three Hundred 
Twenty-four and 71/100 Dollars (683,324.71); 

And no suit or proceedings at law or in equity 
having been instituted to recover the debt secured 
by said mortgage or any part thereof. Now, 
Therefore, by virtue of the power of sale contained 
In said mortgage, and pursuant to the statute of the 
State of Michigan in such case made and provided, 
notice is hereby given that on Thursday, August 20. 
1992, at ten o'clock in the forenoon, local time, said 
mortgage will be foreclosed by a sale at public auc­
tion to the highest bidder, in the main lobby of the 
Washtenaw County Courthouse, Huron Street en­
trance, in the City of Ann Arbor, Washtenaw Coun­
ty, Michigan, of the premises described in said 
mortgage, or so much thereof as may be necessary 
to pay the amount due, as aforesaid, on said mort­
gage, with the Interest thereon at Nine and Three-
quarters percent (9.75%) per annum and all legal 
coats, charges and expenses, including the at­
torney fees allowed by law, and also any sum or 
sums which may be paid by the undersigned, 
necessary to protect its Interest in the premises, 
which said premli 

Anthatcertalfc 

Beginning at the center of Section 19, Town 4 
South, Range 3 East, Manchester Township, 
Washtenaw County, Michigan; thence North 00 

a 34 minutes 30 seconds West 300.00 feet 
the North and South 1/4 line or 

beforeg J o ^ T ^ B ^ m a . ^ f t Truck Drivers $2,000 oign 
Probate, a hearing will be held on the petition of On DOMIS for Safe, qualified 
L^CWstoe^Gomulka to change her name to d r j y « r 8 with 6 months O T R SX-

Date: July is, \m,- penance, Tuition-free training 
^LKnRoadmulkf l available for inexperienced 
Chelsea, MI48118 013) 47M236 drivers. Call todayl Com 

Juiy29 Trans Inc. 1-800-759-6980, 
Dept.A-219. 

Alisun & Wolff Tanning 
Beds. New Commercial-
Home Units From $199.00. 
Lamps-Lotions-Accessories. 
Monthly payments low as 
$18.00.—Call Today, Frea 

A Doctor Buys Land Con­
tracts and gives loans on 
Real Estate. Immediate ser­
vice 313-335-6166 or 1-800-
837-6166. 

Place Your Statewide Ad 
Here! $300 buys a 25 word 
classified ad ottering over 
1,700,000 circulation. Contact 
this newspaper for details. 

Dexter Township 
Board Proceedings 

Regular Meeting of the 
Dexter Township Board 

Date: July 21,1992,7:30 p.m. 
Place: Dexter Township Hall, 6880 

Dexter-Pinckney Rd. 
Present: Jim Drolett, Julie Knight, 

William Eisenbeiser, Doug Smith, 
Earl Doletzky. 

Meeting called to order by Super­
visor Drolett. 

Agenda approved. 
Moved by Knight, supported by 

Doletzky, to approve the minutes of 
the July 7.1992 meeting. Carried. 

^¾¾¾. Quality Sfvkits Our BiMhnu 

ROSENTRETER 
EXCAVATING INC. 

475-1990 

8a*amam»>Oraiffflaidi-$sptic T « * f Saw* 
Botkhe* work-Wletav-Truckiflg^raeJ 

Sond>T«pMil-Sncw fiamoMi 

/5 
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Attention Lyndon Township Residents 

The Lyndon Township August Board meeting 
t ime and date has been changed to Wednesday, 
August 5, 1992, at 5:00 p.m. at the Lyndon Township 
Hall. 

LYNDON TOWNSHIP 
Linda L. Wade, Clark 

: l . ... 

Lyndon Township' 
Board Proceedings 

Lyndon Township Board Meeting 
July 14,1992 

Meeting called to order and minutes 
approved. 

Moved and carried to approve the 
request from the Chelsea Rod and 
Gun Club asking that they be 
recognized as a non-profit organiza­
tion operating in the community for 
the purpose of obtaining a gaming 
license. 

Moved and carried to change the 
date and time of the regular August 
board meeting to August 5,1992 at 5 
p.m. 

Moved and carried to reappoint 
George Coash as Ordinance Officer. 

Moved and carried to approve the 
settlement terms made between the 
village and the townships as a result 
of the meeting held on June 18,1992 
regarding the landfill costs. 

Moved and carried to pay bills total­
ing $6,264.83. 

Moved and carried to enter into a 
C iTTw#lS)ayV; , S jpJ»^ 

New Color Catalog 1 
228-6292. 

-8O0-

Treasurer's report—June report 
given. Reported on alternative ac­
counts for Township funds. 

Clerk's report—Engineer recom­
mended a refund of the deposit for 
Lottie lane. 

Zoning Inspector, Carl Will' 
oughby—11 permits, 8 appeals, 1 sign 
permit. 

Alvarez case is settled. 
Graham—Health Dept. approved a 

variance of setback for Webb Shore 
problems. 

Gilbert—Sewer taps on 1 dwelling or 
tarn. H« must rasters the duplex tn a 

SYLVAN TOWNSHIP RESIDENTS 
The regular muettny of Ihe Sylvan Township 

Board has been changed to Wednesday, August 5, 
1992, 7 p.m. 112 W. Middle St., Chelsea. 

SYLVAN TOWNSHIP 
Mary M. Harris, Sylvan Township Clark 

Make A Frlend...For Life! 
Scandinavian, European, 
Yugoslavian, South American, 
Japanese high school exchange 
students...aniving August.,.Host 
Families Needed I American 
Intercultural Student Exchange. 
Call Patricia (517)887-2535 or 1-
800-SIBLING. 

Taylor Waterstoves @ • Out­
side wood fired hot water fur­
naces. Heats your entire 
home and domestic hot water 
from a wood fire outside your 
home. 1-800-545-2293. 

Why Not Host An Exchange 
!̂&*A$$W#p M-

isS/vffl̂ -ooan*" 

and ibe canter line of Noggles Road; thence North 
SI degrees 4» minutes 30 seconds East 300.00 feet; 
thence South 00 degrees 34 minutes 30 seconds East 
300.00 feet; thence, South 89 degrees 46 minutes 30 
seconds West 300.00 feet along the East and West 
l/4Une of said section and the centerllneof English 

TSieTto the point of beginning, said parcel being a 
part of the Northwest 1/4 of Section IB, Town 4 

"South, Range 3 East, Manchester Township, 
Waahtenaw County, Michigan. 

During the sis months immediately following the 
sale, the property may be redeemed, eicept that in 
the event that the property is determined to be 
abandoned pursuant to MCLA 600.3241a, the prop­
erty may be redeemed during the 30 days Im­
mediately following the sale. 

Dated at Troy, Michigan, May 29,1992. 
STANDAHDFEDERAL BANK, 
a federal savings bank, 
Mortgagee 

RONALD J. PALMER 
Attorney for Mortgagee 
«00 west Big Beaver Road 
Troy. Michigan 4M4 

JulylM2-29-Aua>12 

naw Recycling Authority reports 
given. 

Adjourned. 
radep 

Lyndon Township Public Hearing 
and Special Board Meeting 

July 21,1992 
Moved and carried to approve the 

Private Road Ordinance Variance Ap­
plication submitted by Donald White 
for 561 Oakdale Dr. and have Or­
dinance Officer issue a zoning permit 
upon completion of Mr. Des Autels' 
recommendations. 

Moved and carried to pay bills total­
ing $424.44. 

Adjourned. 
Linda L. Wade, Clerk. 

W** . 
i. America, 

Europe, Japan arriving 
August. You can make a dif­
ference! AYUSA Internation-

>-763*963r—— ^ 

Drivers Take Charges! your 
career and your life. Drive for 
J.B. Hunt and earn top pay and 
benefits. We pay for your OTR 
experience — up to $0.28 per 
mile. 1-800-2JB-HUNT. EOE/ 
Subject to drug screen. 

WePayCa8h for Land Con­
tracts. Free 24 hour record­
ing explains how you can get 
more cash faster, and pay no 
fees. Call, 1-800-428-1319. 

single family dwelling. 
Blight inspector—Report submit­

ted. 
Sewer—Next meeting in Sept. 
Health Department, Doug 

Smith—13927 Aberdeen received a 
variance. 9231 Anne Dr.—Some tem­
porary relief granted. 

Sheriff's Report, Sgt. 
Stielow—Responded to 99 requests in 
June. 45 moving violations. 

Recycle Authority, Julie. 
Knight—Meeting June 24. Purchased 
a pickup for manager. Authorized 
purchase of equipment. Recycle 
center to be constructed. The project 
manager needs help in addition to 
prison labor. 

Moved by Knight, supported by 
Eisenbeiser, to refund Gary Gregory 
the $1,000, security deposit for Lottie 
Lane based on the Township 
Engineer's inspection. Carried. 

Moved by Eisenbeiser, supported 
by Smith, to refund Ron Cook the $150 
application fee for site plan approval 
since he withdrew his request. Car­
ried. 
"Moved oy udletzky, supported by 
Smith, to approve the bills as submit­
ted totalling $60,689.81. Carried. 

Moved by Smith, supported by 
Knight, to appoint William 
Eisenbeiser officer delegate and Jim 
Drolett as officer alternate delegate 
to the MERS 1992 annual meeting. 
Carried. 

Moved by Knight, supported by 
Doletzky, to adjourn the meeting; 
Carried. 

Meeting adjourned. 
Respectfully submitted, 

William Eisenbeiser, 
Dexter Township Clerk. 

ELECTION 
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NOTICE 
TO THE QUALIFIED ELECTORS OF 

SYLVAN TOWNSHIP 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT A PRIMARY ELECTION 

wi l l be hold In la id governmental unit on 

TUESDAY, AUGUST 4 , 1992 
from 7:00 a .m. to 8:00 p.m. 

for the purpose of electing cattJrtl^jRles for th 
fol lowing offices: 
Representatives In Congress, Stato Represent­
a t ive , County Offices, Township Offices, Ap­
peals Court Judge, Circuit Court Judge, District 
Court Judge, Probate Court Judge. Delegates 
to the County Convention wi l l be elected. 

! 

POLLING PLACES AM LOCATID AS FOLLOWS 
and all are accessible by handicapped: 

112 W. Middle St., Chelsea 

Published in compliance with M.C.L.A. 168.653a 
Date: July 22, 1992. 

MARY M. HARRIS, 
CliflT 

ELECTION 
NOTICE 

TO THE QUALIFIED ELECTORS OF 

LYNDON TOWNSHIP 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT A PRIMARY ELECTION 

wi l l bo hold In solid governmental unit on 

TUESDAY, AUGUST 4 , 1992 
from 7:00 a .m. to 8:00 p.m. 

for the purpose of electing candidates for the 
following offices: 
Representatives In Congress, State Represent, 
at lve, county offices, township offices and such 
other partisan offices that may by law bo re­
quired to bo nominated a t the primary. Can­
didates soaking nomination to the following 
non-partisan offices a r e also to bo voted for In 
the county a t the August 4, 1992 General Elec­
t ion: Appeals Court Judge, Circuit Court Judge, 
District Court Judge, and such other non­
partisan offices that may be required to be 
nominated a t the primary. 

POLLING PLACIS AM LOCATID AS FOLLOWS 
and all are accessible by handicapped: 

LYNDON TOWNSHIP HALL 
Corner of Lyndon Town-Hall Rd. and North Territorial Ed. 

Published in compliance with M.C.L.A. 168.653a 
Dotr 7/16/92. * 

LINDA L. WADE, 
Clark 

ELECTION 
NOTICE 

TO THE QUALIFIED ELECTORS OF 

DEXTER TOWNSHIP 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT A PRIMARY ELECTION 

wil l bo held In sold governmental unit on 

TUESDAY, AUGUST 4 , 1992 
from 7:00 a .m. to 8:00 p.m. 

for the purpose of electing candidates for the 
following offices: 
Primary Is being held to nominate candidates 
for offices of: Representative In Congress, 
Stato Representative, county offices, township 
offices and such other partisan offices tha t may 
by law be required to be nominated a t the 
primary. Candidates seeking nomination to 
the following non-partisan offices a re also to 
bo voted for In the county a t the August 4, 
1992 General Election: Appeals Court Judge, 
Circuit Court Judge, District Court Judge, and 
such other non-partisan offices that may be re­
quired to be nominated a t the primary. 

POLLING PLACIS ARI LOCATID AS FOLLOWS 
and all are accessible by handicapped: 

6880 Dexter-Pinckney Rd., Dexter, Mich. 
• * - , 

Published in compliance with M.C.L.A. 168.653a 
CWta: July 22, 1992. 

William Eisenbeiser, 
Clark 

ELECTION 
NOTICE 

TO THE QUALIFIED ELECTORS OF — 

LIMA TOWNSHIP 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT A PRIMARY ELECTION 

win be held in sold governmental unit on 

TUESDAY, AUGUST 4 , 1992 

\ 

from 7:00 a .m. to 8:00 p.m. 

for the purpose of electing candidates for the 
fol lowing offices: 
Representatives In Congress. Representative 
in State Legislature, County Offices as follows: 
Prosecuting At torney, Sheriff, Clerk/Register, 
Treasurer, Drain Commissioner, County Com­
missioner, Township offices as follows: Super­
visor, Clerk, Treasurer, Trustee (2), Constable, 
Delegates to The Democratic Couiwy Conven­
t ion, Delegates to the Republican County Con­
vent ion, judge of the Court of Appeals, Judge 
of t h e Circuit Court, 

POLLING PLACIS ARI LOCATID AS FOLLOWS 
and all are accessible by handicapped: 

11452 Jackson Road, Dexter, Ml 48130 

Published In compliance with M.C.L.A. 168.653a 
Dot* 7-22-92. 

Arlene R. Bareis, 
Clerk 

C 
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Erwin H. Haist 
Chelsea 

Erwin H. Haist of Chelsea, age 88, 
died Monday afternoon, July 27,1992 
in Stockbridge. He was born July 1, 
1904 in Lima township, the son of 
George and Martha (Eschelbach) 
Haist 
. Erwin had lived on the same farm 
since he was six months old and was a 
life-long farmer, raising state and na­
tional award winning Merino sheep. 
Mr. Haist was baptized, confirmed 
and was a life-long devoted member 
of Zion Lutheran church, Chelsea. 

He was married on April 25,1931 at 
Zion church to Ethel B. firuestle and 
she survives. 

Erw|n's family was the joy of his 
life and surviving him in addition to 
his wife are his four children, Ariene 
Riba and her husband Erwin of 
Chelsea, Doris Crocker and her hus­
band David, of Kalamazoo, Kenneth 
Haist* and his wife Barbara, and 
Richard Haist and his wife Bonnie, all 
of Chelsea; 19 grandchildren and 18 
great-grandchildren; a niece, Joyce 
Vogel and her husband, Phil. 

He. was preceded in death by his 
parents and a sister, Lorine Hoffman. 

Funeral services will be held Thurs-
day, July 30, at 11 a.m. from ffien 
Lutheran church with the Rev. Mark 
Weirauch, pastor of Zion Lutheran 
church officiating. 

The family will receive freinds 
Wednesday from 2 to 5 and 7 to 9 at the 
Starffan-Mitchell Funeral Home and 
at the church on Wednesday from 10 
a.m. until the hour of the service. 

' Burial will be in Zion Church 
Cemetery, Freedom township. 

Expressions of sympathy may be 
made to Zion Lutheran church. 

Marion Halter 
Chelsea 

Marion Elizabeth Halter, 805 W. 
Middle St., Chelsea, age 84, died Tues­
day, July 21, 1992 at the Chelsea 
Retirement Community, She was 
born July 24, 1907 in Manistee, the 
daughter of Jack and Gretchen 
(Schleif) Bullae. 

She married Alfred Halter in 
Manistee on Aug. 20,1929. 

Survivors include one daughter, 
Mrs. William (Carol) Cutler of Bloom-
field Hills; two brothers, Howard of 
Arizona, and Douglas of Illinois; four-
grandchildren; and four great­
grandchildren. 

Memorial services will be held 
Thursday, July 30, at 2 p.m. at the 
Chelsea Retirement Community 
Chapel with the Rev. Kearney Klrkby 
officiating. 

Memorial contributions may be 
made to Chelsea Retirement Com­
munity. 

Arrangements were handled by the 
Cole Funeral Chapel. 

Richard R. Stein 
80S W. Middle St. 
cneisea 

Richard R. Stein died Tuesday, July 
21, 1992 at the Chelsea Retirement 

-Community. 
Survivors include his widow, 

Gloria; five sons, John, Robert, 
Thomas, William, and Paul; a 
daughter-in-law, Mrs. Robert Stein; 
four grandchildren, Emily, Erin, 
Elizabeth, and EUina; four brothers, 
James, Gerald, Carl, and Paul; and 
one sister, Mrs. Marilyn L'Heureux. 

Magdalena 
Riegger-Dufrin 
Chelsea 

Magdalena M. Riegger-Dufrin, 
Chelsea, age 80, died unexpectedly 
Friday, July 24,1992 at home. She was 
born April 22, 1912 in Reitprechts, 
Germany the daughter of Johannes 
and Theresia (Dangelmayer) Seitz. 
Lena came to the United States in 
1934, moving to Chelsea in 1938. She 
was a member of St. Mary's Catholic 
church, Altar Society, German Park 
Recreation Club of Ann Arbor, the 
G.B.U., and a very active member of 
Chelsea Community Hospital Aux­
iliary. 

She was married to Karl R. Riegger 
who preceded her in death on June 22, 
1969. She then married Wilhelm 
Dufrin who died Dec. 16« 1989. 

Surviving are one son, and his wife, 
Otto and Joyce Riegger of Ann Arbor, 
one daughter, Betty Messman of 
Chelsea; six grandchildren; two great­
grandchildren; and one sister, Johan­
na Riegger of Germany. 

The funeral mass was held Monday 
at 11 a.m. from St. Mary's Catholic 
church with the Rev. Fr. Philip 
Dupuis celebrant. The vigil service 
was hold Sunday evening at 7i30 p j n r 

UTILITY POLE tfl 
finally removed last 
was initially called a'' 
the pole caused more 

the Sylvan bunding was other physical change downtown because it obscured the 
about six yean in what clock tower for motorists driving north and was generally 

'" location. At the time regarded as an eyesore, 
than Just about any 

Give a 
Gift Subscription to 

The Chelsea Standard! 

Private funeral services were held 
on Friday, July 24 at the Muehlig 
Funeral Chapel. Burial was in Arbor-
crest Memorial Park. 

from the Staffan-Mitchell Funeral 
Home with Deacon Richard Shaney-
felt officiating. Burial was in Mt. 
Olivet Cemetery, Chelsea. 

Martha"K7~Milliken 
7005 Sheldon Rd. 
Whitmore Lake 

Martha K. MiUiken, 7005 Sheldon 
Rd., Hamburg township, Whitmore 
Lake, age 69, died Friday, July 24, at 
Glacier Hills Nursing Home, of 
Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis-
disease, . 

A U G U S T 4 TH, PLEASE VOTE 

BLAKE A. THOMSON 
FOR 

SYLVAN TOWNSHIP 
~ CLERK 

TELL UfrABOjUT IMPORTANT LIFE EVENTS 
The Unis£rsiiy_of Michigan is seeking people between the ages of 40 a*rd-̂ 5 to 
answer questions about important life experiences you have had in the last ye:". 
Interviews will be in Ann Arbor or Ypsilanti and require 2 to 3 hours of your ti: .•. 

$20 WILL BE PAID FOR YOUR EFFORTS. 
Interested? Call 763-4962 to register. • 

ARNET'S - BECKERS 

« ' • 
' N* J V J U r U l l 

MERGER SALE 
NOW IN PROGRESS 

Save Up to 50% 

UN $110 
Sale* Manager 

Fine Memorials Since 1904 
4495 JACKSON RD., ANN ARBOP 

GEE FARMS 
117/7*9/6772 " 14928 lUNKHHUL RD. ST0CKMID6I 49215 

Home Grown— 
Corn 
Beam 

Cabbage 

_Fresh Michigan 
Blueberries 

& 
Cherries 

Last Chance to Order 

Frozen 
fruits & Vegetables 

She was born Nov, 8,1922 at Wood­
son, ill., the daughter of Francis A. 
and Mary EL (Culp) Henry. She had 
been a resident of the Dexter/Pinck-
ney area (or many years. 

She is survived by her husband, 
Donald E. MUliken, Sr,; daughters, 
Sharon McClellan of Chelsea, Elaine 
(Gary) Morel of Linwood, Kathy 
(Michael) Bodary of Ypsilanttrft 
(Steven) Trolz, Manchester; sons 
Ronald (Mary Jane) Callison, and 
James Callison, both of Ypsilanti; 
seven step-children; two sisters, Mary 
Frances Alkire of Jacksonville, 111., 
Helen (Bill) Spencer, of Oregon, 111.; 
21 grandchildren; seven great-
grandchildren; eight great-great­
grandchildren; eight step-
grandchildren. 

She was preceded in death by her 
first husband, James Callison; son 
Gene-Day; also one. sister and one 
brother. 

Funeral services were held Mon­
day, July 27 at 11 a.m., at the Hosmer 
Funeral Home, Dexter, with the Rev. 
Alfred R. Lackey officiating. Burial 

"Followed ax Forest LawrrCemetery, 
Dexter. v 

Memorials may be made to A.L.S. 
of Michigan or Arbor Hospice. 
Envelopes—are available at the 
Hosmer Funeral Home, Dexter. 

During thejgpg&^ears I have designed the Sylvan Township voter database, setup the 
awounting^iflffiftand acted as trainer and advisor for these programs. Through this 
experience as tdwhship consultant, I am already very familiar with many of the duties and 
functions of ijie:S§ayan Township Clerk. 

My 25 ye^r*gRJ6teerienc« in training and consulting has taught me how to listen to the 
needs of a tihtmpf believe that a township clerk can be most effective by knowing how to 
listen to a resident's needs and then translating those needs into actions to assist them. 

AVAfWlrTLr r^ 
--¾¾¾ 

I will te avaUaJWe-to township residents at my downtown computer businessoffice (System 
DirettionSjiil^Middle Street] and at the Sylvan Township Hall to assist residents in 
voting m a t | | j ^ | ^ g township services and to belter understand how our local government 
functions. • _ 

CQMlMipNITY INVOLVEMENT 
My-aunml$$ewTOourcommunity includes the following: 
Chelsea Urtra : ;^y Board Member 1987 - present, Finance Chairperson 1989 - Present 
Chelsea He^Eift* Co-Founder, Board Member 1988 • Present 
Chelsea Kiw:$h$J$ub Treasurer 1991 - Present, Board Member 1986- Present, Member 
since 1983^ ^¾¾ 1 

PLEA^jStffTE THOMSON FOR TOWNSHIP ON AUGUST 4 TH 

* '(TOR BY BLAKE A. THOMSON SYLVAN TOWNSHIP C'LliftKCOMMin lit: 

1 ^rBctftttA-

m&im^ 
CffliSMffi 

The Perfect Quick Stop 
Shopping Spot! 

A daughter, Hannah Leigh, to 
Steven and Mary Hazlett of Chelsea, 
July 21 at St. Joseph Mercy-HospitaL-
She has a brother, Jacob, 10, and a 
sister, Lauren, 6. Maternal grand* 
parents are James and Shirley 
Houston of Wapakoneta, O. Paternal 
grandparents are Robert and 
Florence Hazlett of Wolverine, 

A daughter, Arlesta Marie, to 
Michelle Marie Roderick of Ypsilanti 
and the late Jason Michael Reeves, on 
June 4. The late Arlesta Marie Alex­
ander is grandmother and namesake. 

A son, Timothy Francis, July 24, at 
U-M Women's Hospital, Ann Arbor, to 
David and Anita Shoemaker of Grass 

"Lake. Grandparents are uene-and 
Patricia Shoemaker of Chelsea and 
Janice Welch of Canton. Great* 
grandparents are Mrs. LaVern Welch 
of Chelsea and Mrs. Lance Rogers of 
Saline. Timothy has a brother, John 
James. 

C l r o E ifilder is your Circuit Court Judge. He is the only candidate with judicial 
e x p e | | $ and he is proving to be a well-respected, firm and fair judge. 

fxourse, that Judge Wilder has practiced in 5 federal, 18 circuit and 6 
district cour^rouncUhe state. 

A son, Shane Cody, July 8, at St. 
Joseph Mercy Hospital, Ann Arbor, to 
Douglas and Cheryl Trojanowski of 
Chelsea. _ _ _ 

CHflSfAQ 
•01 I . *AlM ^ ^ ^ 

PrlCMgood July33-Aug.4,1992 
whllt supplies lo»t. 

FORMAL WEAR 
WEDDING 

SPECIALISTS * 

MARTY'S 
MEN SWEAR 
& FORMALWEAR 
310 S. State St. 

Ann Arbor 
668-6338-668-6023 

& | s $ $ @ o u want to live in a safe community. A good community. A community 
in wbih^ou can take pride. A community where your children see that everyone is 
gfvacl^ect and a fair chance; 

e Wilder. He is dedicated to maintaining a responsive and accessible 
im continue to administer justice fairly and equally, for all who come 

* H # * "••?.• 

•&K 

•mix 
LDER 
WASHTENAW 
CIRCUIT COURT 

Vote for ( k u i t Court Judge Kurtis T. Wilder 
on AUGUST 4TH 

Paid for by the Commitkct&ft^tin Judge Wilder. 315 E Eisenhower, Suite 100, Ann Arbor, MI 48108. Jim Cameron, Treasurer. 

i i • ! & ' » " # ? M i • i i i • i • , 
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TheChelseo Standard, Wednesday, July 29, 1992 rDon't be a-, 
taartbreaker 
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Stop 
smoking 

toS^S^ 
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JOHN AND WANDA BISHOP of Sharon township had two years restoring the vehicle that originally came from 
their 1955 Ford pick-up on display at the Chelsea Retire- California. It was one of the many vehicles on display dur-
ment Community last Sunday. The Bishops have spent ing the afternoon. 

I M I B I t ^ A M 

STANOWSKI 
FOR 

PROSECUTING ATTORNEY 

— »** --« / k<L«a* timi 

- wfnuT WTnCri 3Bj • • • 

»*a* 

JOfttt M, tTMOWUI 
iunti Tritl ttltmti 

'I want tcvexpress my appreciation to you and your department for the 
Vi Hirt nn 

excellent job as prosecuting attorney, and we were fortunate in having someone 
of his expertise-assigned to the cose." 

Gene Haab 

REPUBLICAN 

Food Tacts' 
To Forget 

By Debbie Barrow, Extension Home Economist 
Fasting can cleanse your system 

and is a good idea occasionally. 
Truth: There's no evidence that a 

fast can "cleanse" your body in any 
way, and no evidence that your body 
needs cleansing beyond the usual 
measures of bathing, or showering 
with soap and water. Nor will a 

COMPLETE YOURJSBA IN ONE YEAR 
With Geary College's Accelerated Degree Program in 

Business Administration 

Cleary College's accelerated degree program is 
designed specifically for busy working people 

ELECT GLYNN D. RAKNETI 
Circuit Judge 
The candidate with: 

L£j Experience 

fyi 
wf>) Si rone community ties 

m Reputation for 
fairness and 
integrity 

LAJNO ties to special 
interest groups 

Glynn D. Burnett 

24-hour fast result In lasting weight 
loss: you lose primarily fluids and 
quickly regain this "lost" weight. For 
a person in good health, there is no 
danger in a self-imposed 24-hour fasti 
and some people derive satisfaction 
from an occasional fast. But fasting 
for more than-two orthree days may 
"be dangerous and should be under­
taken only under medical supervision. 

If your body needs fluids, you'll feel 
thirsty. 

Truth: Not always. Thirst is usually 
an adequate reminder of your need 
for fluids, but there are exceptions. 
For example, elderly persons may not 
feel thirsty when their bodies need 
water. Also, during physical activity a 
person may become significantly 
dehydrated before he or she feels 
thirsty, Exercise in warm weather 
may compound this problem. 

During exercise, it's possible to lose 
up-to4wo quarts of water before you 
notice your fluid loss. Also, when you 
drink, your thirst will feel quenched 
long before your fluid loss is really 

like you. You'll attend an accelerated schedule 
of classes that, combined with independent 
study, allows you to complete that much-
needed bachelor's degree in one year! 

An associate degree (or equivalent credit) from 
an accredited institution and at least three 
years of related work experience qualify you 
to apply for this excellent opportunity. 

'Finishing my BBA in deary's accelerated degree program 
allowe<f me to pursue my MBA at a state university. The 
accelerated degree program at Cleary College is a real 
winner f 

JoeR. Leach, Ameritech 

-ft Bachelor'sdegree In Business 'Administrationcoura neip Yuuk career.»/\nd now you can 
complete it in a year. 

FREE INFORMATION SESSIONS 
August 11 -- 6 j>.m., Washtenaw Campus August 11. -- 6 p.m., Livingston Campus 

August 12--6 p.m., WCC Western Regional Center, Chelsea 

Space b limited so call TODAY! 
— ; 1-800-686-1883 for Washtenaw & Chelsea-

1-800-589-1979 for Livingston 

Washtenaw Campus 
Ypsilanti 
1-800-686-1883 
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CLEARY 
C O L L £ G i 

Accredited by the North Central Association of Colleges and Schools 

Livingston Campus 
Howell 

1-800-589-1979 

Vole August 4, 1992 

• "The life of the law is not logic; it 
is experience. " 
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replenished. That's why you should 
always drink (plain-water is best) 
before, during and after exercise. 
This is important in cold weather as 
well as hot. 

» « • 
If you eat less, your stomach will 

shrink. 
Truth: No, your stomach cannot 

shrink. If you eat enormous amounts, 
it can expand to accommodate your 
intake, but it does not grow and 
become larger. If you diet for several 
days your appetite may drop, but not 
because your stomach has become 
smaller. 

SIDEWALK SALES 
BARGAINS 

• Closeout Specials 
ON MANY ITEMS OF 
MAJOR APPLIANCES 

SA VINGS 
Super Savings in AH Departments 

A • Specials on all Prior Year 
S MODEL TV's & VCR's 

fc=~-.--a 

5 0 % Off and more 
Lawn & Garden Equipment - BBQ Grills 

Lawn Furniture • Lawnmowers 
Reconditioned Lawn Tractors & Mowers 

Housewares - Paint & Stain 
Light Fixtures 

Check Our Garage Sale Table 

J.. 

• USED VHS MOVIES 
Large Selection— — 
PRICED FROM $5°° EACH, 

• Reduced Prices on Selected 
XJPROff&CANlSIERVAClJlJMS 

e Floormodel 
WIDESCREEN TV's 

SAVE$$$ 

• MORE SPECIALS! 

HON. 
Main St. 

Downtown 
Oreliea 

Johnson's 

HOW-TO, 4,.̂ 47, 
STOREa 

Shop Early for Best Selection! 
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H€YDLAUFF'S 
APPLIANCES & ELECTRONICS 

113 NORTH MAIN .STREET In DOWNTOWN CHELSEA 313/475-1221 
•&w 


